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Sally Baumer

Subject: FW: Important E-rate question

From: Tim Walker [mailto:twalker@ena.com]  
Sent: Thursday, August 17, 2017 4:34 PM 
To: Brian Sturgeon <brian.sturgeon@sdcsc.k12.in.us>; Sally Baumer <sally@adtecerate.com> 
Subject: RE: Important E‐rate question 

 
Brian, 
 
My apologies for the delay. The following is what I received: 
 

Below is the detail which has been requested for South Dearborn managed service. 
 
South Dearborn’s e‐rate filing represents management of 16 Aerohive SR214P switches, 106 Aerohive AP 330 
wireless appliances, and 95 Aerohive ‐ AP 230 wireless appliances.  
 
Please let us know if you may need any more information.  
 

If this doesn’t satisfy the request, please let me know. 
 
Thanks, 
Tim 
 
 
 
 
Tim Walker 
Account Services Manager 
Education Networks of America 
320 N. Meridian St., Suite 118  
Indianapolis, IN 46204 
Desk: 317-612-2891 
Mobile: 812-296-1939  
Fax: 317-612-2899 
 
From: Brian Sturgeon [mailto:brian.sturgeon@sdcsc.k12.in.us]  
Sent: Wednesday, August 09, 2017 2:22 PM 
To: Tim Walker <twalker@ena.com>; Sally Baumer <sally@adtecerate.com> 
Subject: Re: Important E‐rate question 

 
Tim - Any update? 
 
On Mon, Aug 7, 2017 at 10:21 PM, Tim Walker <twalker@ena.com> wrote: 

Brian, 
 
I requested this information last week when I first received the email. I checked again this morning and was 
told it's in process. I'm hopeful I'll have it tomorrow but certain we will have it back to you to meet the stated 
deadline.  
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Tim 

Tim Walker 
Account Service Manager 
Education Networks of America 
320 N. Meridian St., Suite 118 
Indianapolis, IN 46204 
Office: 317-612-2891 
Mobile: 812-296-1939 
Fax: 317-612-2899 
ENA Customer Technical Assistance Center: 888-612-2880 
 
On Aug 7, 2017, at 6:46 PM, Brian Sturgeon <brian.sturgeon@sdcsc.k12.in.us> wrote: 

Tim - Can you please provide this info? Thanks.  
 
---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: Sally Baumer <sally@adtecerate.com> 
Date: Thu, Aug 3, 2017 at 11:25 AM 
Subject: Important E-rate question 
To: "Brian.Sturgeon@sdcsc.k12.in.us" <Brian.Sturgeon@sdcsc.k12.in.us> 

Brian,  

The E-rate reviewer needs the quantity, make, and model number of the equipment being 
managed by ENA. The due date is 8-15-17, however, I would like to turn this around by the 11th 
if possible. 

  

Contact me with any questions. 

  

Thanks for your help, 

Sally  

Sally Baumer 

E-rate Consultant 

AdTec, Inc 

P.O. Box 97 

Centerville, Indiana 47330 

  

Toll-free:  866-855-1845, ext 1003 
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Telephone: 765-855-1612 

Fax:  765-855-1615 

  

www.adtecerate.com 

  

   

  

  

  

  

 
 
 
 
--  

Brian Sturgeon, Director of Technology 

E: brian.sturgeon@sdcsc.k12.in.us 

T: 812-926-2090  l  F: 812-926-4216   

www.sdcsc.k12.in.us  

 

 

 

 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments are for the sole use of the intended 

recipient(s) and may contain confidential and privileged information that is exempt from public disclosure. Any 
unauthorized review, use, disclosure, or distribution is prohibited. If you have received this message in error 

please contact the sender (by phone or reply electronic mail) and then destroy all copies of the original 
message.  
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--  

Brian Sturgeon, Director of Technology 

E: brian.sturgeon@sdcsc.k12.in.us 

T: 812-926-2090  l  F: 812-926-4216   

www.sdcsc.k12.in.us  

 

 

 

 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments are for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may 

contain confidential and privileged information that is exempt from public disclosure. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure, 
or distribution is prohibited. If you have received this message in error please contact the sender (by phone or reply electronic 

mail) and then destroy all copies of the original message.  
 



Records / Applicant Entities

#130514 - SOUTH DEARBORN COMM SCH CORP MANAGE CONTRACTS

Submitted Contracts / Contract #20743

Contract #20743
Contract Information

Nickname ENA Air Managed Services

Can Other Applicants Piggy Back
O� This Contract?

No

Piggy Backed O� Another
Contract?

No

Contract ID 20743

Contract Number N/A

Based on a State Master
Contract?

No

Based on a Multiple Award
Schedule?

No

Establishing FCC Form 470
User-entered Establishing FCC

Form 470 #
107320001342737 Number of Bids Received 1

Service Provider
Service Provider ENA Services, LLC (SPIN: 143030857) Account Number N/A

Contract Dates
Award Date 4/15/2015

Includes Voluntary Extensions? No

Multi-Year Contract? Yes

Pricing Con�dentiality
There is no rule, statue, or other restriction which prohibits publication of the speci�c pricing information for this contract.

Supporting Documents

Document Description

2015-2020 ENA Air Managed Services 2015-2020 ENA Managed Air Services



Summary Customer Service Modi�cations Additional Information Discount Rate Contracts FCC Forms FRN Appeals News

Related Actions

https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/view/all
https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/type/t2roWA/view/all
https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/item/lQBDUvg2DtnG8p1r6JDkTVfs-aZXLHnzXwMJVug0I0BCvYz0dKD_H7ryldtaSp_0KAqS5kTJplc8lJVHm9qV85z_LoV4yN8Rhej7W5utERnGAK6fks/view/summary
https://portal.usac.org/suite/rest/a/content/latest/isBDUvg2DtnG8p1r6BW22ke9-mA-DfrF2XlB5QNt95m49zOHE-8RtFeo2eZ/o
https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/item/lYBDUvg2DtnG8p1r6dDkTVfs7HcdVWZ-z0lFPZtEylj6-9vpnR6Xk0nsE1YaykWomTCde1gVUrWZyFh5QdVLmHZHCsZaI0jQLrU8awDuOr85FZXidQISA/view/summary
https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/item/lYBDUvg2DtnG8p1r6dDkTVfs7HcdVWZ-z0lFPZtEylj6-9vpnR6Xk0nsE1YaykWomTCde1gVUrWZyFh5QdVLmHZHCsZaI0jQLrU8awDuOr85FZXidQISA/view/_gV9Viw
https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/item/lYBDUvg2DtnG8p1r6dDkTVfs7HcdVWZ-z0lFPZtEylj6-9vpnR6Xk0nsE1YaykWomTCde1gVUrWZyFh5QdVLmHZHCsZaI0jQLrU8awDuOr85FZXidQISA/view/_paGVww
https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/item/lYBDUvg2DtnG8p1r6dDkTVfs7HcdVWZ-z0lFPZtEylj6-9vpnR6Xk0nsE1YaykWomTCde1gVUrWZyFh5QdVLmHZHCsZaI0jQLrU8awDuOr85FZXidQISA/view/_vPVk-A
https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/item/lYBDUvg2DtnG8p1r6dDkTVfs7HcdVWZ-z0lFPZtEylj6-9vpnR6Xk0nsE1YaykWomTCde1gVUrWZyFh5QdVLmHZHCsZaI0jQLrU8awDuOr85FZXidQISA/view/_GE1PGg
https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/item/lYBDUvg2DtnG8p1r6dDkTVfs7HcdVWZ-z0lFPZtEylj6-9vpnR6Xk0nsE1YaykWomTCde1gVUrWZyFh5QdVLmHZHCsZaI0jQLrU8awDuOr85FZXidQISA/view/_7vV6sg
https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/item/lYBDUvg2DtnG8p1r6dDkTVfs7HcdVWZ-z0lFPZtEylj6-9vpnR6Xk0nsE1YaykWomTCde1gVUrWZyFh5QdVLmHZHCsZaI0jQLrU8awDuOr85FZXidQISA/view/_tGC2ng
https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/item/lYBDUvg2DtnG8p1r6dDkTVfs7HcdVWZ-z0lFPZtEylj6-9vpnR6Xk0nsE1YaykWomTCde1gVUrWZyFh5QdVLmHZHCsZaI0jQLrU8awDuOr85FZXidQISA/view/_c7n50g
https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/item/lYBDUvg2DtnG8p1r6dDkTVfs7HcdVWZ-z0lFPZtEylj6-9vpnR6Xk0nsE1YaykWomTCde1gVUrWZyFh5QdVLmHZHCsZaI0jQLrU8awDuOr85FZXidQISA/view/news
https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/item/lYBDUvg2DtnG8p1r6dDkTVfs7HcdVWZ-z0lFPZtEylj6-9vpnR6Xk0nsE1YaykWomTCde1gVUrWZyFh5QdVLmHZHCsZaI0jQLrU8awDuOr85FZXidQISA/view/actions










Records / FCC Forms 471

South Dearborn CSC
Managed - #171031202 Follow

Respond to Inquiries Apply Summer or Winter… Submit Modification Req…

Close

Pending Inquiries

Read Notice Name Outreach Type Assigned By Title Phone # Assigned Date Due Date Extn. Status

No Pending Inquiries.

Submitted Inquiries 

Name Outreach Type Answered By Assigned Date Answered Date

Eligibility of Products and Services E-Rate Information Request Sally Baumer 8/9/2017 9:58 AM EDT 8/18/2017 4:22 PM EDT

Eligibility of Products and Services

Issue

USAC’s Program Integrity Assurance (PIA) team is currently reviewing your FCC Form 471 application, and we have identified an issue that we need you to 
help us resolve.  

What is the issue? 
On your form, your FRN Product and Service detail was not sufficient to determine if the requested amount for FRN 1799067910 can be supported. This is an 
issue because before we can proceed with processing your form, we must validate the amount of your request.  

Please read all of the questions, descriptions, and requests below. Please give enough detail, insight, and clarity to help the reviewers fully understand your 
specific situation.  

Check the boxes for statements that apply, and where applicable, type the information requested into the text boxes. If your information is too detailed for the 
text box, or if you need to provide additional documentation, click “Browse” to upload relevant files or documentation.  

Question(s)

This page will timeout after an extended period of inactivity. Please periodically save your work using the 'Save & Close' button below. You may then use your browser's
'Back' button to return to your work.

Your response to PIA’s questions:

# Question Response

1

Please provide vendor documentation which supports the funding 
request amount of $3,255.00 per month for Managed and leased from 
a third party service provider (FRN 1799067910). 

Note: Any vendor documentation provided should clearly identify any 
ineligible charges that were cost allocated out of your request as well 
as the make and model of all product(s) or service(s) requested in this 
FRN. Example of a make and model number: Brand X Router 345J. 
Also, please be sure to explain any discrepancies between the 
amount requested and amount supported. 

Email from ENA for South Dearborn.pdf

If you would like to provide any additional information about these 
issues that have not been addressed above: 

Use the text box to type information, or upload additional 
documentation using the “Browse” button. 

Please contact me with any additional questions or concerns.  Thank 
you for your patience.

https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/view/all
https://portal.usac.org/suite/tempo/records/type/BugM_w/view/all
https://portal.usac.org/suite/rest/a/content/latest/isBDUvg2DtnG8p1r6RQ3Gkf92qrRXpqCHnDfEkUbLVOUFZjMlskv0_sKc5m/o



