Diana Zarillo

From: Erate Funding <Erate_Funding@comcast.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 5, 2019 11:06 AM

To: Curtis Lee

Cc: Jason DeSilva; John Fleming

Subject: RE: Comcast Business E-Rate Request Form FY 17-18
Hello Curtis —

Apologies for the delayed response. I’'m in the processing of applying erate discount to FRN 1799066177, but
we’re unable to process due to discrepancies between the connection speed (200Mbps) provided on form 471
and billing information (20Mbps, 100Mbps and 200Mbps). Connection speed on form 471 must align with
billing information before discount can be applied. That said, form 471 will need to be updated to include
speeds of 20Mbps and 100Mpbs, but since LDl is 2/26/19, it will be best if you opt for BEAR method of
funding.

Thanks!
Bayo

From: Curtis Lee <clee@stanlibrary.org>

Sent: Tuesday, January 22, 2019 3:16 PM

To: Erate Funding <Erate_Funding@cable.comcast.com>

Cc: Jason DeSilva <jdesilva@stanlibrary.org>; John Fleming <jfleming@stanlibrary.org>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Comcast Business E-Rate Request Form FY 17-18
Importance: High

Hello Jackie / Bayo,

The Stanislaus County Library has not received its E-Rate discount for FY 17-18 yet. We understood it will take 1-2 billing
cycles. The Library filed an invoice extension with USAC that is ends 2/26/19. Please advise.

Thank you,
Curtis

From: Erate Funding <Erate Funding@comcast.com>
Sent: Monday, October 15, 2018 2:10 PM

To: Curtis Lee <clee@stanlibrary.org>

Cc: Jason DeSilva <jdesilva@stanlibrary.org>

Subject: RE: Comcast Business E-Rate Request Form

Hi Curtis,

Thank you for the quick response. | see FRN 17990066177 on our list for processing, please allow 1-2 bill cycles for the
funding to be applied.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Thank you,



Jackie Means
Accounting Supervisor, Accounting Operations Government Programs

From: Curtis Lee <clee@stanlibrary.org>

Sent: Monday, October 15, 2018 3:45 PM

To: Erate Funding <Erate Funding@cable.comcast.com>

Cc: Jason DeSilva <jdesilva@stanlibrary.org>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Comcast Business E-Rate Request Form

Hi Jackie,

We are looking to receive funding for the 17-18 funding year. We’ve been contracted with Comcast since July 2014.
I'll send the E-Rate Request for the 18-19 funding year as well.

Thank you,

Curtis Lee

Business Manager
Stanislaus County Library
Desk: 209-558-8951

Cell: 209-338-8300
clee@stanlibrary.org

From: Erate Funding <Erate Funding@comcast.com>
Sent: Monday, October 15, 2018 11:04 AM

To: Curtis Lee <clee@stanlibrary.org>

Cc: Jason DeSilva <jdesilva@stanlibrary.org>

Subject: RE: Comcast Business E-Rate Request Form

Hi Curtis,

Yes please fill out the attached form for the 18-19 funding year.

Are you looking to receive funding for the 17-18 funding year, or was your service just turned on 9/2018?
Thank you,

Jackie Means
Accounting Supervisor, Accounting Operations Government Programs

From: Curtis Lee <clee@stanlibrary.org>

Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2018 4:43 PM

To: Erate Funding <Erate Funding@cable.comcast.com>

Cc: Jason DeSilva <jdesilva@stanlibrary.org>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Comcast Business E-Rate Request Form

Bayo,



The 2017-18 funding year wasn’t turned in until this past September and we haven’t received the e-rate discount for the
2017-18 funding year. We received the attached notice back in September. | can send you the 2018-2019 form as well to
get that process going. Please let me know if there is anything else you need.

Also, we have new contacts for the Stanislaus County Library. Kathleen Rinehart is no longer with the Library. The new
contacts are myself, clee@stanlibrary.org and Jason De Silva, jdesilva@stanlibrary.org.

Thank you,

Curtis Lee

Business Manager
Stanislaus County Library
Desk: 209-558-8951

Cell: 209-338-8300
clee@stanlibrary.org

From: Erate Funding <Erate Funding@comcast.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2018 1:00 PM

To: Curtis Lee <clee@stanlibrary.org>

Subject: RE: Comcast Business E-Rate Request Form

This is for 17-18 funding year — please forward FRN for 18-19 funding year

Thanks!
Bayo

From: Curtis Lee <clee@stanlibrary.org>

Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2018 1:47 PM

To: Erate Funding <Erate_Funding@cable.comcast.com>; Erate Funding <Erate Funding@cable.comcast.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Comcast Business E-Rate Request Form

Hello,
The attached was submitted back in September please confirm receipt.
Thank you,

Curtis Lee

Business Manager
Stanislaus County Library
Desk: 209-558-8951

Cell: 209-338-8300
clee@stanlibrary.org




