

*KENNETH E. HARDMAN, P.C.*

*Attorney At Law*

*1255 - 23RD STREET, N.W.*

*SUITE 830*

*WASHINGTON, D.C. 20037-1170*

*DIRECT DIAL: (202) 223-3772*

*TELECOPIER: (202) 833-2416*

December 10, 1993

CAPITOL PAGING  
1420 Kanawha Boulevard East  
Charleston, WV 25301

Attention: Mr. William D. Stone

852

Hours

REDACTED

HDO

11/01/93	Research consent order policies	0.75
11/02/93	Meeting with FCC re possible revised settlement	1.00
11/04/93	Telephone conference with FCC counsel re brief on settlement; initial research re same	0.75
11/05/93	Research, draft, edit and file memo in support of Joint Motion to Approve Consent Agreement	5.50
11/09/93	FCC staff telephone conference re proceeding; RAM counsel telephone conference re same; review FCC brief in support of consent agreement	1.00
11/10/93	Prepare for and participate in conference at FCC re proceeding on discovery	2.50

	<u>Hours</u>
11/16/93 Review files and preparation of memo on stipulations; telephone conferences with D Stone and M Raymond re same	4.00
11/17/93 Review PCP customer documentation; telephone conference with M Raymond and Mark re possible computer reports; review FOIA file	1.25
11/18/93 Meeting of counsel on discovery; initial review of PRB discovery requests; telephone conference with A Peters re issues; research on deposing FCC employees	4.50
11/19/93 Prepare discovery memo for A Peters; conference call with D Stone, M Raymond and TD Kauffelt re initiating discovery and using "waiver" strategy; conference call with A Peters and D Carter re analysis of FCC and RAM documents on interference; telephone conference with H Soloman re deposing FCC engineers	4.50
11/22/93 Review revenue records and telephone conference with Mark re same; draft interrogatories	3.50
11/23/93 Prepare and file interrogatories for Private Radio Bureau and Field Operations Bureau	7.00
11/24/93 Prepare and file interrogatories for RAM and request for production of documents; conference call with TD Kauffelt and M Raymond re strategy on rejection of settlement and responding to discovery requests; telephone conference with Mark re 1993 financial data; telephone conference with FCC counsel re rejection of settlement; telephone conference with RAM counsel re possibility of two-way settlement	4.50

	<u>Hours</u>	
11/29/93 Telephone conference with RAM counsel re two-way settlement; conference calls with D Stone, M Raymond and TD Kauffelt re same and Private Radio Bureau document request; M Raymond telephone conference re 1993 computer data; draft and send for review settlement agreement with RAM	2.75	
11/30/93 Telephone conference with FCC counsel re Capitol interrogatories; review RAM comments on draft settlement agreement; telephone conferences with RAM counsel re same; conference call with D Stone and M Raymond re same; conference call with M Raymond and B McCallister re Private Radio Bureau request for admissions	3.50	
SUBTOTAL :	[ 47.00	REDACTED
	_____	<u>Amount</u>
For professional services	REDACTED	REDACTED
Additional charges:		
<u>Disbursements</u>		
11/29/93-General disbursements recorded through 11/29/93 including printing & duplication, postage and local messenger service		REDACTED
-HDO disbursements recorded through 11/29/93 including printing & duplication, postage and local messenger service		255.92
SUBTOTAL :	[	REDACTED
<u>Tolls</u>		
11/21/93-HDO - Telephone tolls through 11/21/93		83.54
SUBTOTAL :	[	83.54]
Total costs		REDACTED

*KENNETH E. HARDMAN*

*Attorney At Law*

*1255 - 23RD STREET, N.W.*

*SUITE 830*

*WASHINGTON, D.C. 20037-1170*

*DIRECT DIAL: (202) 223-3772*

*TELECOPIER: (202) 833-2416*

January 12, 1994

CAPITOL PAGING  
1420 Kanawha Boulevard East  
Charleston, WV 25301

Attention: Mr. William D. Stone

861

	<u>Hours</u>
<u>HDO</u>	
12/01/93 Prepare and file response to FCC Request for Admissions and Request for Production of Documents	4.00
12/02/93 Prepare and file notice of withdrawal of discovery requests; telephone conference with RAM counsel re FCC reaction to settlement; preliminary work on motion to dismiss application	1.50
12/03/93 Prepare and file motion to dismiss application	1.25
12/06/93 Review RAM motion to dismiss and PRB motion to compel; telephone conference with RAM counsel re same; intial preparation of responses to PRB interrogatories; M Raymond telephone conference re same	1.50
12/07/93 Initial review of PRB response to interrogatories; preparation of response to PRB interrogatories	5.50
12/08/93 Further drafting, finalization and filing of response to PRB interrogatories	4.00

	<u>Hours</u>
12/09/93 Analysis of PRB responses and objections to Capitols interrogatories	1.00
12/10/93 Research issues on PRB motion to compel; conference call with A Peters and D Carter re FCC response to interrogatories on inspection; draft, edit and file opposition to PRB motion to compel; further analysis of PRB objections to Capitol interrogatories	6.50
12/13/93 Initial review of order denying RAM request to withdraw; telephone conferences with counsel to PRB re objections to discovery; draft letter to counsel re same; review letters between FCC and RAM re two minute timer; draft and send request to TD Kauffelt re follow-up on certain issues	2.50
12/14/93 Telephone conference with FCC counsel re discovery; finalize and file letter on PRB answers and objections to interrogatories	0.50
12/15/93 Telephone conferences with TD Kauffelt re Rowe statements; telephone conference with M Raymond re status and exhibit from B McCallister	0.75
12/17/93 Telephone conference with FCC counsel re schedule for RAM interrogatories and stipulation on admissions; review schematic on carrier operated relay and M Raymond telephone conference re same; M Raymond telephone conference re RAM/PRB interrogatories and requests for admissions	1.00
12/21/93 Research re FCC motion to enlarge issues	1.75

	<u>Hours</u>	
12/22/93 Draft, edit and file opposition to PRB motion to enlarge issues; telephone conference with FCC counsel re interviewing Huntington secretary; analysis of position on response to RAM requests for admissions	4.50	
12/23/93 Draft, edit and file response to PRB second set of interrogatories; telephone conferences with PRB counsel and M Raymond re telephone interview of J Hague; telephone conference with counsel for NABER re interview for information on coordination; draft and send letter to counsel re same; initial drafting on motion to delete footnote	5.00	
12/28/93 Telephone conferences with M Raymond and J Hague re FCC interview, status and telephone line; telephone conference with A Peters re facts of case	2.00	
12/29/93 Conference call with FCC and J Hague re FCC inspection in August 1991; telephone conference with M Raymond re conference call	0.50	
12/30/93 Telephone conferences with FCC counsel re exchange of exhibits and further inspection of ledgers; further drafting, editing and filing motion to delete footnote	2.25	
SUBTOTAL :	[ 46.00	REDACTED
	_____	<u>Amount</u>
For professional services	REDACTED	REDACTED

Amount

Additional charges:

Disbursements

12/29/93-HDO - Disbursements recorded through 12/29/93 including printing & duplication, postage and local messenger service	327.96
SUBTOTAL :	[ 327.96]

Paralegal

12/13/93-Obtain copy of transcript of pre-hearing conference from FCC files	54.64
SUBTOTAL :	[ 54.64]

Tolls

12/21/93-HDO - Telephone tolls through 12/21/93	40.56
SUBTOTAL :	[ 40.56]

---

Total costs	\$423.16
-------------	----------

REDACTED

**KENNETH E. HARDMAN**

*Attorney At Law*

1255 - 23RD STREET, N.W.

SUITE 830

WASHINGTON, D.C. 20037-1170

DIRECT DIAL: (202) 223-3772

TELECOPIER: (202) 833-2416

February 12, 1994

CAPITOL PAGING  
1420 Kanawha Boulevard East  
Charleston, WV 25301

Attention: Mr. William D. Stone

868

	<u>Hours</u>
<u>HDO</u>	
01/03/94 Initial preparation of testimony for direct case	2.00
01/05/94 Telephone conference with NABER re interviews and review files on Capitol/RAM coordination; draft and send memo to A Peters re his direct testimony	2.75
01/06/94 Review NABER files re Capitol coordination; interview D Vasek re same; telephone conference with A Peters re testimony	4.00
01/07/94 Draft and send request to NABER for items from its files to be used for Capitol's direct case; draft M Raymond testimony	3.50
01/08/94 Draft M Raymond testimony	2.00
01/09/94 Draft M Raymond testimony; compile information on PCP customers for possible exhibit	4.00
01/10/94 Conference call with M Raymond and B McCallister re events concerning initiating PCP service; further drafting of M Raymond testimony; initial review of A Peters draft testimony	5.50

	<u>Hours</u>
01/11/94 Further drafting of M Raymond testimony; D Stone telephone conference re hearing	4.50
01/12/94 Telephone conference with A Peters re his draft testimony; D Vasek telephone conference re documents	2.75
01/13/94 M Raymond, T D Kauffelt and A Peters telephone conferences re direct testimony; M Raymond and R Harrison telephone conferences re Greenup County Rescue; telephone conference with NABER counsel re declaration; draft and transmit NABER declaration	4.75
01/14/94 Telephone conferences with M Raymond, A Peters and B McCallister re McCallister declaration; draft same and declaration for R Harrison; review NABER submission and send request for change	2.25
01/15/94 Review and analysis of documents and information	2.00
01/16/94 Review and analysis of documents and information; revise M Raymond draft testimony	6.50
01/17/94 Further editing of M Raymond and A Peters direct testimony; telephone conferences with M Raymond and A Peters re same	4.00
01/18/94 Finalize and file Capitol's direct case	2.50
01/20/94 A Peters telephone conferences re PRB exhibits and trial strategy	1.50
01/21/94 Telephone conferences with A Peters and D Carter re PRB interference exhibits; telephone conference with M Raymond re operations procedures	2.50

	<u>Hours</u>	
01/24/94 Telephone conference with FCC counsel re witness notification; D Carter telephone conferences re Hark Verifier capabilities	0.75	
01/25/94 Telephone conference with FCC counsel re cross-examination of witnesses; M Raymond and D Stone telephone conferences re same; draft and send proposed stipulation to FCC re Foelak; draft and send letter on notification of witnesses for cross-examination; draft and file objections to production of certain persons for cross-examination	3.50	
01/28/94 Telephone conferences with M Raymond and D Stone re hearing; T D Kauffelt telephone conference re same	1.00	
01/29/94 Review Federal Rules of Evidence	1.00	
01/31/94 Pretrial preparation	5.00	
SUBTOTAL :	[ 68.25	REDACTED
	_____	<u>Amount</u>
For professional services	REDACTED	REDACTED
Additional charges:		
<u>Disbursements</u>		
01/27/94-HDO -- Disbursements recorded through January 27, 1994, including printing & duplication, postage and local messenger service		233.64
SUBTOTAL :	[	233.64 ]
<u>Fed Express</u>		
01/14/94-HDO - Federal Express charges for January		67.75
SUBTOTAL :	[	67.75 ]

Amount

Photocopies

01/18/94-HDO -- Reproduction and binding of Capitol's  
direct case 530.42

SUBTOTAL : [ 530.42 ]

Tolls

01/21/94-HDO -- Telephone tolls through January 21, 1994 147.81

SUBTOTAL : [ 147.81 ]

---

Total costs \$979.62

REDACTED

**MOIR & HARDMAN**

*Attorneys At Law*

2000 L STREET, N.W., SUITE 512

WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036

FAX: 202-833-2416

*KENNETH B. HARDMAN*

*DIRECT DIAL: (202) 223-3772*

March 11, 1994

CAPITOL PAGING  
1420 Kanawha Boulevard East  
Charleston, WV 25301

Attention: Mr. William D. Stone

875

	<u>Hours</u>	
<u>HDO</u>		
02/01/94 FCC trial	8.50	
02/02/94 FCC trial	10.50	
02/03/94 FCC trial	9.50	
02/04/94 FCC trial	5.50	
02/05/94 Analysis of PRB Exhibits 16 and 17	1.50	
02/07/94 FCC trial	9.50	
02/08/94 FCC trial	10.00	
02/09/94 FCC trial	5.50	
02/19/94 Initial review and abstracting of hearing transcript	2.00	
02/20/94 Initial review and abstracting of hearing transcript	1.50	
02/21/94 Initial review and abstracting of hearing transcript	5.00	
SUBTOTAL :	[ 69.00	REDACTED

REDACTED

Amount

Additional charges:

Miscellaneous

02/18/94-Hearing transcript for 2/1 through 2/4/94 in Docket 93-231	1,187.05
02/25/94-Hearing transcript for 2/7 - 2/9/94 in Docket 93-231	999.55
SUBTOTAL :	[ 2,186.60]

Tolls

02/24/94-HDO - Telephone tolls through February 21, 1994	49.33
SUBTOTAL :	[ 49.33]

---

Total costs \$2,235.93

REDACTED

KENNETH E. HARDMAN

**MOIR & HARDMAN**  
Attorneys At Law  
2000 L STREET, N.W., SUITE 512  
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036  
FAX: 202-833-2416

DIRECT DIAL: (202) 223-3772

April 11, 1994

CAPITOL PAGING  
1420 Kanawha Boulevard East  
Charleston, WV 25301

Attention: Mr. William D. Stone

883

Hours

REDACTED

	<u>HDO</u>	
03/02/94	M Raymond telephone conference re status; D Stone and M Raymond telephone conference re meeting on Capitol Hill	0.50
03/09/94	Telephone conference with M Raymond and D Stone re transcript and meeting progress	0.25
03/11/94	Telephone conference with FCC counsel re PRB position on findings and conclusions; M Raymond telephone conferences re transcript and meeting	0.50
03/13/94	Initial review and abstract of M Raymond testimony	2.50

	<u>Hours</u>	
03/14/94 Telephone conference with M Raymond and D Stone re hearing transcript and local Senate office	0.50	
03/15/94 D Stone telephone conference re meeting on appointment	0.25	
03/25/94 M Raymond telephone conference re preparation of letter for appointment; telephone conference with staff re same	0.50	
SUBTOTAL :	[ 5.00	REDACTED

REDACTED

**MOIR & HARDMAN**

*Attorneys At Law*

2000 L STREET, N.W., SUITE 512

WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036

FAX: 202-833-2416

KENNETH E. HARDMAN

DIRECT DIAL: (202) 223-3772

May 11, 1994

CAPITOL PAGING  
1420 Kanawha Boulevard East  
Charleston, WV 25301

Attention: Mr. William D. Stone

897

	<u>Hours</u>
<u>HDO</u>	
04/02/94 Review and abstracting of hearing testimony	7.50
04/03/94 Draft proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law	2.00
04/04/94 Draft proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law	8.00
04/05/94 Draft proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law	8.00
04/06/94 Draft proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law	8.50
04/07/94 Draft proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law	9.50
04/08/94 Finalize and file proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law	2.50
04/11/94 Office conference with K Hardman re strategy	0.25
Initial review of PRB summary of position; telephone conference with M Raymond re same; office conference with B Moir re strategy; draft and send advice memo to D Stone and M Raymond	1.00

	<u>Hours</u>	
04/13/94 Draft proposed letter to Senator Byrd	2.25	
04/14/94 Review material re case; edit letter; office conference with K Hardman re same	1.00	
Further editing of letter; office conference with B Moir re same	0.25	
SUBTOTAL :	[ 50.75	REDACTED
	_____	<u>Amount</u>
For professional services	REDACTED	REDACTED
Additional charges:		
<u>Messengers</u>		
04/15/94-HDO -- local messenger service through April 15, 1994		12.50
SUBTOTAL :	[	12.50]
<u>Photocopies</u>		
04/11/94-HDO -- printing and reproduction through April 11, 1994		178.24
SUBTOTAL :	[	178.24]
		_____
Total costs		\$190.74

REDACTED

**MOIR & HARDMAN**

*Attorneys At Law*

2000 L STREET, N.W., SUITE 512

WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036

FAX: 202-833-2416

KENNETH E. HARDMAN

DIRECT DIAL: (202) 223-3772

June 10, 1994

CAPITOL PAGING  
1420 Kanawha Boulevard East  
Charleston, WV 25301

Attention: Mr. William D. Stone

905

Hours

REDACTED

HDO

05/03/94	Review and analysis of Private Radio Bureau and RAM proposed findings and conclusions	3.00
05/04/94	Research and draft reply to proposed findings and conclusions	5.00
05/05/94	Draft and edit reply to proposed findings and conclusions	9.00
05/06/94	Draft, edit and file reply to proposed findings and conclusions	6.00
05/10/94	Initial review and analysis of PRB reply; telephone conference with D Stone and M Raymond re strategy	0.75

	<u>Hours</u>	
05/19/94 M Raymond telephone conference re follow-up on meetings	0.25	
05/25/94 D Stone telephone conference re followup with meetings and strategy	0.25	
SUBTOTAL :	[ 24.25	REDACTED
	_____	<u>Amount</u>
For professional services	REDACTED	REDACTED
Additional charges:		
<u>Photocopies</u>		
05/06/94-EDO -- duplication of reply to proposed findings and conclusions		37.99
		_____
Total costs		\$37.99

REDACTED

**MOIR & HARDMAN**  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW  
2000 L STREET, N.W., SUITE 512  
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036-4907  
FAX: 202-833-2416

KENNETH E. HARDMAN

DIRECT DIAL: (202) 223-3772

November 9, 1994

CAPITOL PAGING  
1420 Kanawha Boulevard East  
Charleston, WV 25301

Attention: Mr. William D. Stone

#960

Hours

REDACTED

HDO

10/31/94	Initial review and analysis of Initial Decision; telephone conference with D Stone and M Raymond re same	1.50
----------	---	------

SUBTOTAL :	[	1.50	REDACTED
------------	---	------	----------

REDACTED

KENNETH E. HARDMAN

**MOIR & HARDMAN**  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW  
2000 L STREET, N.W., SUITE 512  
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036-4907  
FAX: 202-833-2416

DIRECT DIAL: (202) 223-3772

December 6, 1994

CAPITOL PAGING  
1420 Kanawha Boulevard East  
Charleston, WV 25301

Attention: Mr. William D. Stone

#968

Hours

REDACTED

HDO

11/02/94	Further review and analysis of Initial Decision	1.00	
11/03/94	Telephone conferences with M Raymond re decision; edit statement re same; conference call with M Raymond and T Sharp re decision; draft and send press releases to trade publications re same	2.00	
11/10/94	M Raymond telephone conference re press contacts on Initial Decision	0.25	
11/14/94	M Raymond telephone conference re prospective strategy	0.25	
11/17/94	M Raymond telephone conference re press matters; research EAJA issues at FCC	0.75	
11/21/94	Further research on EAJA issues	0.75	
	SUBTOTAL :	[ 5.00	REDACTED

KENNETH E. HARDMAN

**MOIR & HARDMAN**  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW  
2000 L STREET, N.W., SUITE 512  
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036-4907  
FAX: 202-833-2416

DIRECT DIAL: (202) 223-3772

January 4, 1995

CAPITOL PAGING  
1420 Kanawha Boulevard East  
Charleston, WV 25301

Attention: Mr. William D. Stone

#977

	<u>Hours</u>
<u>HDO</u>	
12/02/94 M Raymond telephone conference re exceptions to Initial Decision	0.25
12/04/94 Review and analysis of Private Radio Bureau's exceptions to Initial Decision	1.50
12/08/94 Analysis of Private Radio Bureau's exceptions to Initial Decision	1.00
12/09/94 Further analysis of Private Radio Bureau's exceptions to Initial Decision	2.00
12/11/94 Draft reply to Private Radio Bureau's exceptions to Initial Decision	3.00
12/12/94 Draft reply to Private Radio Bureau's exceptions to Initial Decision	7.00
12/13/94 Draft reply to Private Radio Bureau's exceptions to Initial Decision	8.00
12/14/94 Finalize and file reply to Private Radio Bureau's exceptions to Initial Decision	4.00

CAPITOL PAGING

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/15/94 M Raymond telephone conference re reply brief and strategy; telephone conference with FCC counsel re procedure	0.50	
For professional services rendered	27.25	REDACTED

REDACTED

*Kenneth E. Hardman*  
**MOIR & HARDMAN**  
2000 L Street, N.W., Suite 512  
Washington, D.C. 20036-4907  
Direct Dial: (202) 223-3772  
Fax: (202) 833-2416

Invoice submitted to:  
CAPITOL PAGING  
1420 Kanawha Boulevard East  
Charleston, WV 25301  
Attention: Mr. William D. Stone

April 1, 1996

Invoice # 1175

Professional services

Hours

HDO

2/23/96	Initial review of Review Board decision affirming in part and modifying in part ALJ Initial Decision; draft and send advice memo to M Raymond re same; telephone conference with M Raymond re same	1.00
---------	--	------

CAPITOL PAGING

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/7/96 Telephone conference with M Raymond re strategy in light of Review Board decision	0.25	
3/12/96 Telephone conference with M Raymond re response to Review Board decision; telephone conferences with FCC staff re possible settlement	0.50	
3/15/96 Telephone conference with D Stone and M Raymond re strategy concerning Review Board decision	0.25	
3/20/96 Review tape of FCC agenda meeting on August 3, 1993, and press briefing for application for review	1.00	
3/21/96 Review and analysis of record for drafting application for review	1.00	
3/22/96 Draft and edit application for review of Review Board decision	7.00	
3/23/96 Draft and edit application for review of Review Board decision	2.50	
3/25/96 Further editing of application for review; finalize and file	1.50	
SUBTOTAL:	[ 15.00	REDACTED

REDACTED