



PEPPER & CORAZZINI  
 L.L.P.  
 1776 K Street, N.W., #200  
 Washington, D.C. 20006  
 (202) 296-0600

February 10, 1995

Billed through 01/31/95

Bill number 1808-00000-076 HJB

Peter Price, Esquire  
 Liberty Cable Co., Inc.  
 575 Madison Avenue  
 New York, NY 10022

Federal Communications Commission	
Docket #	96-41
Present	TWCV
Disc. ion	Identified <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Received <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Rejected <input type="checkbox"/>
Reporter	SP
Date	1-28-97

\*\*\*\*\*  
 RE: Liberty Cable, Inc.  
 New York, NY  
 \*\*\*\*\*

Balance forward as of bill number 075 dated 01/10/95

REDACTED

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

01/03/95 MJL	Review licenses; update files. Review PNS re: granted and accepted applications. Issue letters re: same.	1.75 hrs
01/04/95 MJL	All client letter re: Notice of proposed rule making to revise parts 21 and 94.	.08 hrs
01/10/95 JDJ	Legal research re: Text for notice of Proposed Rule Making FCC 94-314. Meeting with FCC staff--Patricia Chew; Phone call to Robert James.	.67 hrs
01/11/95 MJL	Review petition to deny (Time/Warner). Research re: authorizations granted/pending.	2.00 hrs
01/11/95 HJB	Review Time Warner petition; Telephone Call with Peter Price re same; memo to Peter Price re same.	1.75 hrs
01/16/95 RFC	Review Jacobs affidavit in District Court case.	.25 hrs
01/17/95 MJL	Prepare STA. Review STA grants received from FCC.	2.00 hrs
01/17/95 HJB	Telephone Call with Jim McNaughton re copyright litigation; Telephone Call with Peter Price and Lloyd Constatine re State Court and Federal Court and FCC litigation.	2.67 hrs
01/18/95 HJB	Legal Research re opposition to Time Warner petition to deny; Draft same.	5.92 hrs

Bill number 1808-00000-076 HJB

01/19/95 HJB	Telephone Call from Jim McNaughton re copyright litigation.	.25 hrs
01/19/95 HJB	Revise opposition to petition to deny.	1.50 hrs
01/20/95 MJL	Review and verify consolidated licenses for Bristol and Normandie Court sites.	2.50 hrs
01/20/95 HJB	Telephone Call with Debra Carrazaara re statements of account; Revise Time Warner Opp.	3.08 hrs
01/23/95 AEM	Research re: distribution of copyright royalties.	.50 hrs
01/23/95 HJB	Revise Time Warner opp.	.75 hrs
01/23/95 MJL	Review and verify licenses for 99 Battery, Milford, Windsor and Lincoln.	2.50 hrs
01/24/95 AEM	Review information and memo to HJB re: distribution of copyright royalties.	.25 hrs
01/24/95 JDJ	Legal research re: Identify site #'s for Bristol plaza and Normandie CT, based on FCC license.	1.50 hrs
01/24/95 HJB	Revise and File opposition to Time Warner Petition to Deny.	.67 hrs
01/25/95 JDJ	Legal research re: Identify site number with path; Identify missing site numbers, etc. for the Normandy and Bristol License for Liberty Cable.	2.00 hrs
01/25/95 HJB	Letter to Jmi McNaughton re copyright distributions.	.25 hrs
01/26/95 MJL	Prepare license update. Call to Gettysburg licensing. File correction to Lincoln application.	2.00 hrs
01/27/95 MJL	Review grants and acceptance public notices. Update files.	.25 hrs
01/30/95 HJB	Revise eligibility statement in 18 GHz apps.	.25 hrs
01/30/95 MJL	Draft 6 18 GHz applications. File 1 of 6.	5.00 hrs
01/31/95 HJB	Review and Revise Bristol mod.	.25 hrs

Total fees for this matter

REDACTED

## ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

Database Research  
 Database Research  
 Courier  
 Long Distance Telephone  
 Printing and Duplicating  
 Research Materials  
 Telecopy charges

REDACTED

Total costs for this matter

## BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL FEES

40.59 hrs

REDACTED

bill number 1808-00000-076 HJB

TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL

REDACTED

NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

FCC/CP 017492

\*\*\*\*\*  
WHEN MAKING PAYMENT PLEASE RETURN COVER SHEET OR  
INCLUDE CLIENT BILL # ON CHECK. THANK YOU

PEPPER & CORAZZINI  
L.L.P.  
1776 K Street, N.W., #200  
Washington, D.C. 20006  
(202) 296-0600

February 10, 1995

Billed through 01/31/95

Client number 1808 HJB

Peter Price, Esquire  
Liberty Cable Co., Inc.  
575 Madison Avenue  
New York, NY 10022

\*\*\*\*\*  
RE: Liberty Cable, Inc.  
New York, NY  
\*\*\*\*\*

BALANCE FORWARD FOR THIS MATTER  
TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER  
TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

REDACTED

TOTAL FEES

40.59 hrs

TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

REDACTED

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THESE BILLS

NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

REDACTED

PEPPER & CORAZZINI  
L.L.P.  
1776 K Street, N.W., #200  
Washington, D.C. 20006  
(202) 296-0600

March 10, 1995

Billed through 02/28/95

Bill number 1808-00000-079 HJB

Peter Price, Esquire  
Liberty Cable Co., Inc.  
575 Madison Avenue  
New York, NY 10022

\*\*\*\*\*  
RE: Liberty Cable, Inc.  
New York, NY  
\*\*\*\*\*

Balance forward as of bill number 076 dated 02/10/95  
Payments received since last bill (last payment 02/24/95)

REDACTED

Net balance forward

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

02/03/95 MJL	Draft applications for six 18 GHz links; update files re same.	1.00 hrs
02/06/95 HJB	Review reply to opposition; Letter to Peter Price and Lloyd Constatine re same.	1.50 hrs
02/10/95 HJB	Copyright analysis; Letter to Peter Price re same.	1.92 hrs
02/14/95 HJB	Telephone Call with Peter Price re copyright filings; Letter to to Peter Price re same.	2.25 hrs
02/15/95 HJB	Telephone Call with Jim MacNaughton re copyright filings.	.25 hrs
02/16/95 HJB	Legal Research re SHVH of 1994; Memorandum to Jim MacNaughton re same.	1.17 hrs
02/17/95 HJB	Telephone Call from Jim MacNaughton re copyright liability.	.25 hrs
02/20/95 MJL	Prepare six 18 GHz applications for filing.	1.50 hrs
02/21/95 MJL	Prepare and file six 18 GHz applications; review public notices for grant. Draft memo re grant.	4.00 hrs
02/21/95 HJB	Review apps. to be filed.	.25 hrs

Bill number 1808-00000-079 HJB

02/21/95 ELR	Telephone Calls to FCC in Gettysburg re: status of various microwave radio applications.	.25 hrs
02/22/95 HJB	Copyright analysis	.83 hrs
02/23/95 HJB	Telephone Call with Jim MacNaughton re interconnects; Telephone Call with Debra Carrazana re gross receipts.	.33 hrs
02/23/95 MJL	Inventory; Prepare 7-18 Ghz applications.	5.00 hrs
02/24/95 HJB	Work on copyrights.	.50 hrs
02/24/95 MJL	Prepare and send out 18 GHz inventory. Review public notices re: grants/acceptances of 18 GHz applications.	.75 hrs
02/25/95 HJB	Review statements of account	4.50 hrs
02/27/95 HJB	Work on copyright filings; phone call w/Debra Corazanna re. same.	2.17 hrs
02/27/95 HJB	Review new station application.	.25 hrs
02/28/95 HJB	Work re copyrights.	.25 hrs

Total fees for this matter

REDACTED

ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

Westlaw Research Warner-HJB  
 Courier  
 Long Distance Telephone  
 Printing and Duplicating  
 Postage  
 Research Materials  
 Telecopy charges

REDACTED

Total costs for this matter

REDACTED

BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL FEES 28.92 hrs

TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

REDACTED

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL

NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

REDACTED

\*\*\*\*\*  
 WHEN MAKING PAYMENT PLEASE RETURN COVER SHEET OR  
 INCLUDE CLIENT BILL # ON CHECK. THANK YOU

PEPPER & CORAZZINI  
L.L.P.  
1776 K Street, N.W., #200  
Washington, D.C. 20006  
(202) 296-0600

March 10, 1995

Billed through 02/28/95

Client number 1808 HJB

Peter Price, Esquire  
Liberty Cable Co., Inc.  
575 Madison Avenue  
New York, NY 10022

\*\*\*\*\*  
RE: Liberty Cable, Inc.  
New York, NY  
\*\*\*\*\*

BALANCE FORWARD FOR THIS MATTER  
TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER  
TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

REDACTED

TOTAL FEES

28.92 hrs

REDACTED

TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THESE BILLS

NET BALANCE FORWARD

REDACTED

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

PEPPER & CORAZZINI  
L.L.P.  
1776 K Street, N.W., #200  
Washington, D.C. 20006  
(202) 296-0600

April 10, 1995

Billed through 03/31/95

Bill number 1808-00000-080 HJB

Peter Price, Esquire  
Liberty Cable Co., Inc.  
575 Madison Avenue  
New York, NY 10022

\*\*\*\*\*  
RE: Liberty Cable, Inc.  
New York, NY  
\*\*\*\*\*

Balance forward as of bill number 079 dated 03/10/95  
Payments received since last bill (last payment 04/03/95)

REDACTED

Net balance forward

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

03/01/95 HJB	Draft statement of account	.50 hrs
03/06/95 HJB	File statements of account.	1.00 hrs
03/10/95 MJL	Review Public notices for accepts/grants for 18GHz facilities; notify Liberty of Accepts - update database.	.75 hrs
03/13/95 HJB	Telephone Call from Jim MacNaughton re statement of account; work papers.	.25 hrs
03/16/95 HJB	Letter to Debra Carazzana re royalty check.	.25 hrs
03/16/95 HJB	Telephone Call from Steve Coran re proposed videotron transaction.	.33 hrs
03/17/95 HJB	Due diligence re Videotran; Telephone Call with Peter Price re same.	.75 hrs
3/20/95 MJL	Review public notice for accepts and grants; Telephone Call with FCC re emission designators. Review all applications for emission designators. Telephone Call with Behrooz re same. Draft letter to Comsearch.	5.00 hrs
03/20/95 JDJ	Legal Research re: Correct error on Liberty Cable Applications; Telephone Call to Gettysburg re: file #'s for new applications.	2.50 hrs

FCC/CP 017497

Bill number 1808-00000-080 HJB

03/21/95 MJL	Review material from Comsearch re new emission designators, prepare amendments for filing. Review license list from Rini & Coran and cross check with P&C inventory for due diligence.	5.00 hrs
03/21/95 HJB	Telephone Call from Jim MacNaughton re copyrights; meeting with Steve Coran re Due diligence.	1.50 hrs
03/21/95 JDJ	Telephone Call to Gettysburg re: File numbers for Liberty Cable Applications @ Bristol, Normandie, & River Tower.	.50 hrs
03/23/95 MJL	Prepare and file 7-18 Ghz applications; review Comsearch materials.	5.00 hrs
03/24/95 MJL	File four applications for 18 Ghz applications.	.50 hrs
03/24/95 JDJ	Telephone Call to Gettysburg re: file numbers for various call signs; Legal Research re: locate PN's for new applications.	.83 hrs
03/27/95 HJB	Review Time Warner supplement.	1.67 hrs
03/28/95 HJB	Telephone Call from Jim MacNaughton re permitted distant signals and licensing issues.	.50 hrs
03/29/95 HJB	Legal Research re eligibility; Telephone Call with Jim MacNaughton re same and compulsory licensing.	1.67 hrs
03/29/95 MJL	Update status of pending applications; research re: pending applications re: proposed assignment due diligence.	1.00 hrs
03/31/95 MJL	Review public notice for applications accepted for billing/grants.	.25 hrs

Total fees for this matter

REDACTED

## ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

Westlaw Research Definition-HJB  
 Database Research  
 Courier  
 Long Distance Telephone  
 Petty Cash  
 Printing and Duplicating  
 Postage  
 Research Materials  
 Telecopy charges

REDACTED

Total costs for this matter

REDACTED

## BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL FEES

29.75 hrs

REDACTED

Bill number

1808-00000-080 HJB

PAGE 3

TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL

REDACTED

NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

FCC/CP 017499

\*\*\*\*\*  
WHEN MAKING PAYMENT PLEASE RETURN COVER SHEET OR  
INCLUDE CLIENT BILL # ON CHECK. THANK YOU

PEPPER & CORAZZINI  
L.L.P.  
1776 K Street, N.W., #200  
Washington, D.C. 20006  
(202) 296-0600

April 10, 1995

Billed through 03/31/95

Client number 1808 HJB

Peter Price, Esquire  
Liberty Cable Co., Inc.  
575 Madison Avenue  
New York, NY 10022

\*\*\*\*\*  
RE: Liberty Cable, Inc.  
New York, NY  
\*\*\*\*\*

BALANCE FORWARD FOR THIS MATTER  
TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER  
TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

REDACTED

TOTAL FEES 29.75 hrs

TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

REDACTED

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THESE BILLS

NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

REDACTED

FCC/CP 017500

PEPPER & CORAZZINI  
L.L.P.  
1776 K Street, N.W., #200  
Washington, D.C. 20006  
(202) 296-0600

May 10, 1995

Billed through 04/30/95

Bill number 1808-00000-081 HJB

Peter Price, Esquire  
Liberty Cable Co., Inc.  
575 Madison Avenue  
New York, NY 10022

\*\*\*\*\*  
RE: Liberty Cable, Inc.  
New York, NY  
\*\*\*\*\*

Balance forward as of bill number 080 dated 04/10/95  
Payments received since last bill (last payment 04/17/95)

REDACTED

Net balance forward

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

04/03/95 HJB	Telephone Call from Steve Coran re Videotron transaction. Legal Research re: TW Petition.	2.92 hrs
04/03/95 MJL	Research re: 18 GHZ inventory. Cross check with Rini & Coran to resolve discrepancies.	4.00 hrs
04/04/95 MJL	Research re: discontinued paths for Rini & Coran inventory.	2.00 hrs
04/05/95 JDJ	Legal Research re: New site application for Liberty Cable @ Lincoln Park, filed 3-22-94.	.17 hrs
04/06/95 MJL	Research re Rini & Coran due diligence inconsistencies.	2.50 hrs
04/07/95 HJB	Telephone Call from Peter Price re copyright royalties; Letter to Peter Price re same.	3.00 hrs
04/10/95 HJB	Telephone Call with Peter Price re compulsory licensing.	.25 hrs
04/11/95 HJB	Telephone Call from Ed Milstein re def. of network station. Draft memo to Ed Milstein re same; Telephone Call with Peter Price re same.	.83 hrs
04/12/95 ELR	Legal Research re: comments filed on behalf of MPAA and other various entities in Docket 86-7B.	2.50 hrs

bill number 1808-00000-081 HJB

04/13/95 MJL	Research re: inventory of 18 GHz paths. Documentation to Rini & Coran.	2.00 hrs
04/13/95 ELR	Legal Research re: applications and related correspondence filed on behalf of Liberty Cable; Sending to Rini & Coran.	1.00 hrs
04/14/95 MJL	Review public notice of 4 OFS applications. Update files accordingly.	.75 hrs
04/17/95 HJB	Letter to Jim MacNaughton re def. of cable system.	.25 hrs
04/19/95 MJL	Prepare four 18 GHz applications check stations on pending applications.	4.00 hrs
04/21/95 MJL	New licenses.	.75 hrs
04/24/95 HJB	Draft opp. to PTD.	5.25 hrs
04/24/95 MJL	Research re: Time Warner petition and pending paths; Telephone Call with FCC re: status of pending applications.	.75 hrs
04/25/95 HJB	Revise Opposition	.67 hrs
04/26/95 HJB	Telephone Call from Leslie Spasser re Time Warner petitions. Revise same.	4.67 hrs
04/26/95 MJL	Telephone Call with Behrooz Nehrain re: paths for STA; Telephone Call with FCC Gettysburg re: status of applications. Research re: pending paths; discussion with HJB.	1.50 hrs
04/27/95 HJB	Revise opposition; Telephone Call with Peter Price re status of petitions; Telephone Calls with Leslie Spasser re opposition; Conference call re same.	5.92 hrs
04/27/95 JDJ	Legal Research re: Authorization for Windsor, CT.	.33 hrs
04/27/95 JDJ	Berry Best search re: All Liberty applications accepted for public notices (granted and pending) since 11-94.	1.50 hrs
04/27/95 MJL	Research; Telephone Call with Behrooz; Telephone Call with FCC Gettysburg. Draft STA request.	6.50 hrs
04/28/95 HJB	Revise STA request; Telephone Call with Joel Marcus and Jeff Lanning re petitions.	1.50 hrs
04/28/95 MJL	STAs for pending applications. Preparing Revise listing for pending applications. Prepare memo to Behrooz re: same. Call with Behrooz re: same.	3.00 hrs

Total fees for this matter

ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

REDACTED

Westlaw Research Eligibility-HJB  
Westlaw Research Eligible-HJB  
Courier

bill number 1808-00000-081 HJB

Long Distance Telephone  
Printing and Duplicating  
Telecopy charges

REDACTED

Total costs for this matter

BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL FEES 58.51 hrs

TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

REDACTED

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL

NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

REDACTED

FCC/CP 017503

\*\*\*\*\*  
WHEN MAKING PAYMENT PLEASE RETURN COVER SHEET OR  
INCLUDE CLIENT BILL # ON CHECK. THANK YOU

PEPPER & CORAZZINI  
L.L.P.  
1776 K Street, N.W., #200  
Washington, D.C. 20006  
(202) 296-0600

May 10, 1995

Billed through 04/30/95

Client number 1808 HJB

Peter Price, Esquire  
Liberty Cable Co., Inc.  
575 Madison Avenue  
New York, NY 10022

\*\*\*\*\*  
RE: Liberty Cable, Inc.  
New York, NY  
\*\*\*\*\*

BALANCE FORWARD FOR THIS MATTER  
TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER  
TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

REDACTED

TOTAL FEES

58.51 hrs

TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

REDACTED

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THESE BILLS

NET BALANCE FORWARD

REDACTED

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

FCC/CP 017504

PEPPER & CORAZZINI  
L.L.P.  
1776 K Street, N.W., #200  
Washington, D.C. 20006  
(202) 296-0600

June 10, 1995

Billed through 05/31/95

Bill number 1808-00000-082 HJB

Peter Price, Esquire  
Liberty Cable Co., Inc.  
575 Madison Avenue  
New York, NY 10022

\*\*\*\*\*  
RE: Liberty Cable, Inc.  
New York, NY  
\*\*\*\*\*

Balance forward as of bill number 081 dated 05/10/95

REDACTED

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

05/01/95 HJB	Work re STA.	.50 hrs
05/01/95 JDJ	Legal Research re: obtain copies of Applications and Authorizations held by Liberty for Rini & Coran Due diligence.	1.15 hrs
05/01/95 MJL	Rini and Coran correspondence. STA revisions.	2.00 hrs
05/02/95 JDJ	Legal Research re: Authorizations and applications from Bristol, Century, Milford, Lincoln, and Normandy for Rini & Coran.	.83 hrs
05/02/95 MJL	Revise eight STAs and prepare for filing.	3.00 hrs
05/03/95 HJB	File opp. to TW petition.	.58 hrs
05/03/95 MJL	Prepare and file eight applications for STA. Call with Behrooz Nourain. Call with General Counsel (FCC) re: ex parte.	1.50 hrs
05/05/95 MJL	Call with Behrooz. Check FCC public notices.	.25 hrs
05/09/95 MJL	Research re. status of apps & draft STAs for 18 GHz stations; research re. OPTEL due diligence.	2.00 hrs
05/10/95 MJL	Prepare applications & STAs for 18 GHz facilities.	2.00 hrs
05/11/95 HJB	Review applications; Review TW reply.	2.00 hrs
05/11/95 MJL	Research re. Time Warner petition to deny re. construction; phone call w/FCC Gettysburg.	2.00 hrs

Bill number	1808-00000-082 HJB	
05/12/95 HJB	Telephone Call from Henry Rivera re meeting; with Bill Kennard; Letter to Peter Price re Time Warner reply.	.83 hrs
05/15/95 HJB	Telephone Call from Peter Price re Time Warner Reply; Draft Surreply; Telephone Call with Leslie Spasser re same; Telephone Call with Henry Rivera re same.	4.75 hrs
05/15/95 MJL	Research re: application processing procedure changes. Research re: Time Warner petition for Optel.	2.00 hrs
05/16/95 HJB	Work on Reply to STA app.; Telephone Call with Henry Rivera and Leslie Spasser re Surreply; Revise Surreply; Telephone Call with Behrooz Nourain re same. Telephone Call with Tony Ontiveros re same.	5.58 hrs
05/16/95 MJL	Review status of pending applications. Call with FCC staff re; same. Discuss same with Howard Barr. Review ex parte rules re: Time Warner petition.	1.25 hrs
05/16/95 JDJ	Telephone Call with Gettysburg re: status of STA's for various call signs for Liberty Cable.	.92 hrs
05/17/95 HJB	Telephone Call from Peter Price re Surreply; Telephone Call with Henry Rivera re same.	1.83 hrs
05/18/95 MJL	Research re: petitions to deny and STAs. Draft new STAs. Call with Behrooz Nourain.	1.50 hrs
05/18/95 HJB	Revise Reply to STA app. Telephone Call with Henry Rivera re CX parte notice.	3.33 hrs
05/19/95 HJB	Review STA requests; Telephone Call with Peter Price re same; Revise STA.	1.50 hrs
05/19/95 MJL	File STAs on Amendment applications; research re. same; phone call w/Behrooz Nouraini.	2.00 hrs
05/21/95 MJL	Five STA's for amendments.	1.00 hrs
05/23/95 MJL	Prepare and file amendment applications and STAs. Research re: petition to deny re: hardware issue. Modify exhibits re: eligibility. Call with Behrooz re: hardware issues.	4.50 hrs
05/23/95 HJB	Conference with MJL re STA request; Revise Reply to Opposition re same. Draft opposition to PTD.	5.33 hrs
05/23/95 JDJ	Berry Best search re: history of 18ghz filings for LCS Communications.	.50 hrs
05/24/95 MJL	Hardware interconnection research. File five amendments to STAs. Call with Behrooz.	2.00 hrs
05/24/95 HJB	Revise Opposition; Telephone Call with Peter Price re STA reply.	3.25 hrs
05/25/95 HJB	Draft opposition; Telephone Call with Peter Price re same; Telephone Call with Henry Rivera re STAs.	6.00 hrs
05/25/95 JDJ	Berry Best, ISI re: 18ghz filings history for ICS, TVMax and Cable Plus.	1.25 hrs

Bill number 1808-00000-082 HJB

05/25/95 MJL	Research re 18Ghz licenses on FCC database for HJB.	.75 hrs
05/25/95 MJL	Research re STA's; draft same.	2.00 hrs
05/26/95 JDJ	Legal Research re: History of 18 GHz filings for 94 to 95 on ISI Database for TVMAX, Cable Plus and ICS.	.75 hrs
05/26/95 HJB	Revise opposition.	3.17 hrs
05/30/95 HJB	Revise and File opposition.	1.50 hrs
05/30/95 MJL	Status check on STAs & application.	.24 hrs
05/31/95 JDJ	Legal Research re: history of 18 Ghz for TV Max using ISI.	1.50 hrs

Total fees for this matter

REDACTED

ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

Database Research  
 Database Research  
 Lexis Research  
 Dataworld research Network-HJB  
 Westlaw Research Opp.-HJB  
 Westlaw Research Warner-HJB  
 Courier  
 Long Distance Telephone  
 Petty Cash  
 Printing and Duplicating  
 Postage  
 Telecopy charges

REDACTED

Total costs for this matter

REDACTED

BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL FEES 77.04 hrs

TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

REDACTED

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL

NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

REDACTED

\*\*\*\*\*  
 WHEN MAKING PAYMENT PLEASE RETURN COVER SHEET OR  
 INCLUDE CLIENT BILL # ON CHECK. THANK YOU

PEPPER & CORAZZINI  
L.L.P.  
1776 K Street, N.W., #200  
Washington, D.C. 20006  
(202) 296-0600

June 10, 1995

Billed through 05/31/95

Client number 1808 HJB

Peter Price, Esquire  
Liberty Cable Co., Inc.  
575 Madison Avenue  
New York, NY 10022

\*\*\*\*\*  
RE: Liberty Cable, Inc.  
New York, NY  
\*\*\*\*\*

BALANCE FORWARD FOR THIS MATTER  
TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER  
TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

REDACTED

TOTAL FEES

77.04 hrs

TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS

REDACTED

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THESE BILLS

NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

REDACTED



Monday	Tuesday

Federal Communications Commission	
Wednesday 96-41	Thursday No. 45
Present	TWCV
	Identified ✓
	Received ✓
	Rejected
Reporter	
Date	1-28-97

Saturday
1 91/274

93/272  
 memo due on  
 motion to Vol.  
 re R.C. &

4 94/271

5 95/270  
 1808 - Response to  
 TW supp.

6 96/269

7 97/268

8 98/267

100/265  
 proposed  
 Delphia/Clear  
 channels closing  
 156 - Comments  
 re on MFS Pet.  
 submitted to the local  
 rep.

11 101/264

12 102/263

13 103/262  
 12p's  
 Deadline  
 Leave for  
 Lexington in  
 a.m.  
 Expand Court  
 Deadline

14 104/261  
 Good Friday  
 Passover begins at sundown

15 105/260  
 Passover

107/258

18 108/267  
 Dina late about  
 10am.

19 109/266

20 110/255

21 111/254

22 112/253

114/251

25 115/250  
 1806 - off to  
 Warner. Petition.  
 182.

26 116/249  
 Professional  
 Secretaries Day  
 Staff Appointment  
 Day 12-2 at the

27 117/248  
 4pm meet at  
 Henry's office  
 1250 conn. Ste

28 118/247  
 Expand Reply  
 Court Deadline

29 119/246



**In The Matter Of:**

*Before the FCC - CONFIDENTIAL*  
*In Re: Application of Liberty Cable Co., Inc*

---

*Edward Milstein*  
*Vol. 1, May 30, 1996*

---

*Miller Reporting Company, Inc.*  
*507 C Street, N.E.*  
*Washington, DC 20002*  
*(202) 546-6666 FAX: (202) 546-1502*

*Original File 0530emil.asc, 66 Pages*  
*Min-U-Script® File ID: 0385099863*

**Word Index included with this Min-U-Script®**

<u>Federal Communications Commission</u>	
Docket No. <u>96-41</u>	Exhibit No. <u>46</u>
Presented by <u>TWCV</u>	
Disposition	Identified <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	Received <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	Rejected <input type="checkbox"/>
Reporter <u>JR</u>	
Date <u>1-28-92</u>	

BEFORE THE FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION

In re: Application of : WT Docket No.  
: 96-41

Liberty Cable Co., Inc. :

CONFIDENTIAL

Thursday, May 30, 1996

Washington, D.C.

The deposition of EDWARD MILSTEIN, called for examination by counsel for Time Warner Cable of New York City in the above-entitled matter, pursuant to notice, in the offices of the Federal Communications Commission, 2025 M Street, N.W., Fifth Floor Conference Room, Washington, D.C., convened at 9:05 a.m., before David A. Kasdan, RPR, a notary public in and for the District of Columbia, when were present on behalf of the parties:

APPEARANCES:

On behalf of the Applicant:

ROBERT L. BEGLEITER, ESQ.

ELIOT L. SPITZER, ESQ.

Constantine & Partners

909 Third Avenue

New York, NY 10022

(212) 350-2707

On behalf of Time Warner Cable of New York City:

BRUCE BECKNER, ESQ.

Fleischman and Walsh

1400 16th Street, N.W.

Sixth Floor

Washington, D.C. 20036

(202) 939-7900

On behalf of the Federal Communications Commission:

KATHERINE C. POWER, ESQ.

JOSEPH PAUL WEBER, ESQ.

MARK L. KEAM, ESQ.

Enforcement Division

Federal Communications Commission

Wireless Telecommunications Bureau

2025 M Street, N.W.

Washington, D.C. 20554

(202) 418-0919

Also Present:

ROBERT PETIT

CONTENTS

WITNESS EXAMINATION BY COUNSEL

EDWARD MILSTEIN

By Mr. Beckner 4

By Mr. Weber 56

EXHIBITS

NUMBER MARKED FOR IDENTIFICATION

Edward Milstein Nos. 1 and 2 17

PROCEEDINGS

Whereupon,

[1] EDWARD MILSTEIN  
[2]  
[3] was called for examination by counsel for Time  
[4] Warner Cable of New York City and, after having  
[5] been duly sworn by the notary public, was examined  
[6] and testified as follows:

[7] EXAMINATION BY COUNSEL FOR  
[8] TIME WARNER CABLE OF NEWYORK CITY  
[9] BY MR. BECKNER:

[10] Q: Would you please state your full name for  
[11] the record.

[12] A: Edward Lawrence Milstein.

[13] Q: Mr. Milstein, as I introduced myself  
[14] before we went on the record, I will do formally on  
[15] the record, my name is Bruce Beckner and I  
[16] represent Time Warner Cable of New York City in  
[17] this proceeding. I'm going to ask you a few  
[18] preliminary questions about the process, and we  
[19] will get right into the substance of the  
[20] examination.

[21] Have you had your deposition taken before,

[1] sir?

[2] A: Once.

[3] Q: And you understand after you were sworn by  
[4] the Court Reporter you are required to give answers  
[5] that are truthful to the best of your knowledge and  
[6] belief?

[7] A: Yes.

[8] Q: And because of that, you have the right to  
[9] understand the questions being put to you, so if  
[10] there is something about my question that you don't  
[11] understand, please feel free to speak up and say  
[12] so, and I will try to rephrase it or explain it.

[13] The second thing I would like you to do  
[14] is, since the record being made is a written record  
[15] and not an audio or videotape, when you choose to  
[16] answer a question with a yes or no, say "yes" or  
[17] "no" as opposed to "uh-huh" or "huh-uh" or nodding  
[18] your head, that kind of thing. That way the Court  
[19] Reporter knows exactly what you mean and can take  
[20] it down.

[21] Finally, you have the right to confer with  
[22] your lawyer. I assume Mr. Spitzer is here

[1] representing you in his capacity as Liberty Cable;  
[2] is that correct?

[3] A: Co-chairman.

[4] Q: And you have the right to confer with your  
[5] lawyer during an examination. You simply ask for a  
[6] break and you may confer with him and you may do so  
[7] privately if you wish.

[8] And similarly if you would like to take a  
[9] break for any reason, simply say so and we will go  
[10] off the record to take a break. My purpose is not  
[11] to make anybody uncomfortable.

[12] Are there any other questions that you  
[13] want to ask me about the proceeding that maybe  
[14] hasn't been clear?

[15] A: No.

[16] Q: Fine. In addition to being co-chairman of  
[17] Liberty Cable, are you one of the owners of Liberty  
[18] Cable?

[19] A: Yes, I am.

[20] Q: You own that in conjunction with your  
[21] brother?

[22] A: My brother and my cousin.