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ATTACHMENT B
Affidavit of Mr. Gilbert Rasco

STATE OF TEXAS §
S
COUNTY OF BRAZORIA §
BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority on this day of June 16, 2016, personally appeared

Gilbert Rasco, who being by me duly sworn on oath deposed and said:

I.- My name is Gilbert Rasco. My position with Brazoria Telephone Company (“Brazoria”
or “Company”) is Vice President of Operations. In my position, | am responsible for
overseeing all operations of the Company, including certifying Billed Entity Application

Reimbursement (“"BEAR™) forms for E-rate applicants.

I~

[ am over 18 years of age and authorized to make the statements herein.

3. Tattest that Brazoria did not receive any notifications of pending BEAR forms from USAC
related to the 2014 E-rate funding year.

4. Inmy personal knowledge, information, and belief, the facts as stated in the appeal request

by Columbia-Brazoria School District, as well as those stated in this affidavit, are true and

correct.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NOT.

G cAUA & R%ﬁ‘,’

Gilbert Rasco
Vice President - Operations

! Tl
SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN TO BEFORE ME on this (D day of June 2016, to

certify which witness my hand and seal of'u['ﬁcc.(z
el o
KAY C. HUDGEON s dseorar

Notary Public .J Notary P ublic in and for the State of Texas
STATE '

i
W

¢

| e ————————— ="




ATTACHMENT C

Electronic Mail Correspondence between Service Provider and C-BSD



From: Jonathan Champagne

Sent: Tuesday, February 09, 2016 11:05 AM
To: 'Lee Ullrich'

Subject: RE: USAC - Funding year 2014

Sounds good. | will just manually check every so often during this time frame
Thanks

From: Lee Ullrich [mailto:lee@ecspecialists.net]

Sent: Tuesday, February 09, 2016 11:02 AM

To: jonathan@btel.com
Subject: Re: USAC - Funding year 2014

Usually July to September, these were done on September 21, 2015

Lee Ullrich

Erate Consulting Specialists, Inc.
Ph 281-232-0928 x101

Fax 281-232-0949

Cell 832-314-4414

This message contains confidential information and is intended for the individual named. If you are not the named
addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if
you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system.

From: jonathan@btel.com <jonathan@btel.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 9, 2016 10:58 AM

To: Lee Ullrich

Subject: RE: USAC - Funding year 2014

What month do you usually submit the form? Is it the same time each year?

From: Lee Ullrich [mailto:lee@ecspecialists.net]
Sent: Tuesday, February 09, 2016 10:57 AM
To: jonathan@btel.com

Subject: Re: USAC - Funding year 2014

The minute that | submit the form



Lee Ullrich

Erate Consulting Specialists, Inc.
Ph 281-232-0928 x101

Fax 281-232-0949

Cell 832-314-4414

This message contains confidential information and is intended for the individual named. If you are not the named
addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if
you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system.

From: jonathan@btel.com <jonathan@btel.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 8, 2016 10:55 AM

To: Lee Ullrich

Subject: RE: USAC - Funding year 2014

He said he just did HFT. | have copies I'll send to you for your files
Thanks so much for your help.
JC

For future reference, when are they usually ready for us to certify? 1 will put a tickler system in place for
next time.

From: Lee Ullrich [mailto:lee@ecspecialists.net]
Sent: Tuesday, February 09, 2016 10:41 AM
To: jonathan@btel.com

Subject: Re: USAC - Funding year 2014

Gil just certified the B-TEL 472 so he must have found the email, now we need the HFT one certified.

Lee Ullrich

Erate Consulting Specialists, Inc.
Ph 281-232-0928 x101

Fax 281-232-0949

Cell 832-314-4414



This message contains confidential information and is intended for the individual named. If you are not the named
addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if
you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system.

From: jonathan@btel.com <jonathan@btel.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 9, 2016 10:27 AM

To: Lee Ullrich

Subject: RE: USAC - Funding year 2014

| just talked to Gil. He has not seen anything. Are they available to certify? We have talked to USAC
about the notifications many times, but nothing seems to help.
Just let me know what we need to do.

Thanks

From: Lee Ullrich [mailto:lee@ecspecialists.net]
Sent: Tuesday, February 09, 2016 10:21 AM
To: jonathan@btel.com

Cc: Greg Fields (IT)

Subject: Re: USAC - Funding year 2014

Jonathan when a 472 is posted an email is sent to the contact name on your SPIN which | believe is Gil,
in the past he has always claimed he has never received them, if this is the case he needs to update his
contact info on the USAC website. You are correct, none have been certified by you and that is why they
have not been processed and paid.

Lee Ullrich

Erate Consulting Specialists, Inc.
Ph 281-232-0928 x101

Fax 281-232-0949

Cell 832-314-4414

This message contains confidential information and is intended for the individual named. If you are not the named
addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if
you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system.

From: jonathan@btel.com <jonathan@btel.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 9, 2016 10:13 AM

To: Lee Ullrich

Subject: RE: USAC - Funding year 2014

| don’t think either one was certified. You usually send me an email when you post them so we know
they can be certified. | don’t remember getting anything. Gil has only received one notification over the
years. He tells me when he certifies them. | have not received anything from USAC either



Jonathan

From: Lee Ullrich [mailto:lee@ecspecialists.net]
Sent: Tuesday, February 09, 2016 10:10 AM
To: jonathan@btel.com

Subject: Re: USAC - Funding year 2014

Jonathan, | don't have any record of the 472 2247744 being certified by you, the HFT one was and | am
inquiring about it. Can you check to see if the Brazoria Telephone Form 472 was certified?

Lee Ullirich

Erate Consulting Specialists, Inc.
Ph 281-232-0928 x101

Fax 281-232-0949

Cell 832-314-4414

This message contains confidential information and is intended for the individual named. If you are not the named
addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if
you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system.

From: jonathan@btel.com <jonathan@btel.com>
Sent: Monday, February 8, 2016 2:19 PM

To: 'Greg Fields (IT)"; Lee Ullrich

Subject: RE: USAC - Funding year 2014

Thanks Greg. | was wondering how the appeal might affect the process. Hopefully CBISD can still get
the money for 2014.

JC

From: Greg Fields (IT) [mailto:greg.fields@cbisd.com]
Sent: Monday, February 08, 2016 2:10 PM

To: jonathan@btel.com; Lee Ullrich

Subject: RE: USAC - Funding year 2014

Sorry Jonathan, this may have to do with us owing money for our classification being wrong. We paid
the money but by the time it was all straightened out we had to file an appeal.

Lee can probably clarify on this and let us know if this is the case.

Greg



From: jonathan@btel.com [mailto:jonathan@btel.com]

Sent: Monday, February 8, 2016 2:05 PM

To: Lee Ullrich <lee @ecspecialists.net>; Greg Fields (IT) <greg.fields@cbisd.com>
Subject: FW: USAC - Funding year 2014

Did either of you guys get this? | don’t show | received a reply back
Jonathan

From: jonathan@btel.com [mailto:jonathan@btel.com]
Sent: Monday, February 01, 2016 4:29 PM

To: 'Greg Fields (IT)"; Lee Ullrich (lee@ecspecialists.net)
Subject: USAC - Funding year 2014

Lee:

I don’t show where we received any of the money for the 2014 funding year. Were we supposed to do
any validations? | was just looking at last year’s entries and thought | would ask.

Jonathan Champagne
HFT Communications, LP



ATTACHMENT D

Screen Shots of Certified BEAR Forms



5/19/2016 Service Provider Search Page

Need Help?

Home n-.’lertify BEAR mBulk Download maulk Upload mTerms and Conditions mReturn to Portal

Search BEAR Forms

Please choose from one or more of the following search options:

Created Date From 09/01/2015 To 11/01/2015
Range:

Dollar Amount: Min Max

Billed Entity
Number:

Invoice Id:

BEAR Form Status: lA" o ¥ i

|Search

Search Results:

Certify |Certify |Certify |Billed |Billed Entity |Invoice |[Status Reimbursement|Contact |Authorized |Certified |Date Submitted
by by by Entity |Name Id > Amount Name By By |Created |to SLD on
Invoice|BEN |FRN |Number
[g E 141306 |COLUMBIA-|2247744 [COMPLETED |$12,448.80 LEE LEE: Gibert [9/21/2015|2/9/2016
BRAZORIA ULLRICH|ULLRICH |Rasco [12:50:38 |11:37:03
IND SCH PM AM
DIST

[Certify Selection

SLD Home | Contact Us
Client Service Bureau: 1-888-203-8100
& 1597 - 2007, Universal Service Administrative Company. All Rights Reserved.

https /Awww2.sl.universalservice.orglbear/spsearch.aspx 12




ATTACHMENT E

Form 472 (BEAR) Notification Letter Dated February 18, 2016
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USAC ™

Universal Service Administrative Company Schools and Libraries Division
Bl

Form 472 (BEAR) Notification Letter

February 18, 2016

Gilbert Rasco

Brazoria Telephone Company
314 West Texas

PO Box 2008

Brazoria, T 77422

Re: Invoice Number - as assigned by USAC: 2247744
Service Provider IdentificationNumber: 143002410
Reimbursement Form Number: 2014 B-TEL
Billed Entity Number: 141306

Lee Ullrich
COLUMBIA-BRAZORIAIND SCH DIST
7422 Foster Creek Dr.
Richmond, TX 77406

Preferred Mode of Contact: E-mail at lee@ecspecialists.net
Total Amount of Reimbursement Approved for Payment: $0,00

This letter is your notification that the Schools and Libraries Division (SLD) of the
Universal Service Administrative Company (USAC) has processed an ECC Form 472,

"Billed Entity Aﬁplicant Reimbursement (BEAR)" Form from the above named applicant
listing you as the service provider. USAC has committed to reimburse the discounted
portion of the cost of eligible services provided to eligible entities pursuant to one
or more FCC Forms 471, "Description of Services Ordered and Certification Forn" .

In certain instances, a line may not have been paid. Review the BEAR Letter Applicant
Reimbursement Report (Report) following this letter for the reasonés) this may Eave
occurred. For more information about Iines that have not been paid, see the explanation
of Invoice Error Codes in Step 9 on our website. Work with the appi

icant (your
customer) to correct any errors.

Once corrected, your customer may submit a new BEAR to
request reimbursement for any unpaid lines.

We recommend using the BEAR Online tool from the Apply Online area or Required Forms
section of our website for additional submissions. I¥ a new BEAR cannot be submitted
before the invoice deadline passes, you or your customer may submit a request for a
deadline extension. (See "I

nvoice Deadlines and Extension Requests' posted in the SLD
section of our website for more information.)

Pursuant to the Federal Communication Commission's (FCC) Second Report and Order and

Further Notice of Proposed Rulemaking iE‘CC 03-101, released April 29, 2003), you must

renit the amount shown as "Total Amount of Reimbursement Approved for Payment' above to
¥our customer no later than 20 days after receif)t of pa¥ment of the approved discounts
rom USAC. You also agreed not to tender or mak ?

: ] te use of the payment of the approved
discounts issued by USAC to you prior to remitting the discount to your

) customer (See
BEAR Form, Block 4, Service Provider Acknowledgment).

The USAC check should be mailed to the service provider named above within 20 days of
the date of this letter.

Schools and Libraries Division - Correspondence Unit
30 Lanidex Plaza West, PO Box 685, Parsippany, NJ 07054-0685
Visit us online at: wwiw.usac.org/sl

PRCPRAOD 100012 -00012020300000

o



BEAR NOTIFICATION LETTER APPLICANT REIMBURSEMENT REPORT

Form 471 Application Number: 959367 rjf‘?\/
Funding Request Number: 2605874
Funding Year 2014: 07/01/2014 - 06/30/2015
Contract Number: MTH
Funding Commitment Decision: $12448.80
Reimbursenent Amount for this FRN: $0.00
Reimbursement Request Decision Explanation:
Invoice Received Date [02/09/2016] Later Than;

BEAR NL Page 3 of 3 02/18/2016

PRCPNIDO 1GO012  -CRO1203¢3L0000 00013
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USAC ™

Universal Service Administrative Company

Schools and Libraries Division

Form 472 (BEAR) Notification Letter

February 18, 2016

Gilbert Rasco

HET Communications LP
206 West Alabama

PO Box 1921
Brazoria, T 77422

Re: Invoice Number - as assigned by USAC: 2247747
Service Provider IdentificationNumber: 143004029
Reimbursement Form Number: 2014 HFT
Billed Entity Number: 141306

Lee Ullrich
COLUMBIA-BRAZORIAIND SCH DIST
7422 Foster Creek Dr.
Richmond, TX 77406

Preferred Mode of Contact: E-mail at lee@ecspecialists.net
Total Amount of Reimbursement Approved for Payment: $0.00

This letter is your notification that the Schools and Libraries Division (SLD) of the
Universal Service Administrative Company (USAC) has processed an ECC Form 472,

"Billed Entity Applicant Reimbursement (BEAR)" Form from the above named applicant
listing you as the service provider. USAC has committed to reimburse the discounted
portion of the cost of eligible services provided to eligible entities pursuant to one
or more FCC Forms 471, "Description of Services Ordered and Certification Form".

In certain instances, a line may not have been paid. Review the BEAR Letter Applicant
Reimbursement Report (Report) following this letter for the reasonés) this may have
occurred. For more informatlon about lines that have not been paid, see the explanation
of Invoice Error Codes in Step 9 on our website. Work with the appiicant (your
customer) to correct any errors. Once corrected, your customer may submit a new BEAR to
request reimbursement for any unpaid lines,

We recommend using the BEAR Online tool from the Applg Online area or Required Forms
section of our website for additional submissions. I

: _ ) a new BEAR cannot be submitted
before the invoice deadline passes, you or your customer may submit a request for a
deadline extension. (See "Invoice Deadlines and Ext

. _ ( i ension Requests" posted in the SLD
section of our website for more information.)

Pursuant to the Federal Communication Commission's (FCC) Second Report and Order and
Further Notice of Proposed Rulemaking (FCC 03-101, released April 29, 2003), you must
remit the amount shown as "Total Amount of Reimbursement Approved for Payment" above to

¥our customer no later than 20 days after receiEt'of pa¥ment of the approved discounts
rom USAC. You also agreed not to tender or ma ?

‘ ' . ) e use of the payment of the approved
discounts issued by USAC to you prior to remitting the discount to your customer (See
BEAR Form, Block 4, Service Provider Acknowledgment),

The USAC check should be mailed to the service provider named above within 20 days of
the date of this letter.

Schools and Libraries Division - Correspondence Unit
30 Lanidex Plaza West, PO Box 685, Parsippany, NJ 07054-0685
Visit us online at; www.usac.org/s!

PSCENBOD 100013 -000130203P0000



BEAR NOTIFICATION LETTER APPLICANT REIMBURSEMENT REPORT

Form 471 Application Number: 959367
Funding Request Number: 2605894
Funding Year 2014: 07/01/2014 - 06/30/2015
Contract Number: MTM
Funding Commitment Decisieon: $22800,00
Reimbursement Amount for this FRN: $0.00
Reimbursement Request Decision Exglanation:
Invoice Received Date [02/09/2016] Later Than;

BEAR NL Page 3 of 3

PSCPNBO0I00D1T  -00013030330000 00014

02/18/2016



ATTACHMENT F

Administrator’s Decision on Appeal
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= Universal Service Administrative Company
Schools & Librartes Dimision

Administrator’s Decision on Appeal — Funding Year 2014-2015

April 29,2016

Gilbert R. Rasco
Brazoria Telephone Co
P.0. Box 2008

314 W. Texas Street
Brazoria, TX 77422

Re:  Applicant Name: COLUMBIA-BRAZORIA IND SCH DIST
Billed Entity Number: 141306

Form 471 Application Number: 959367
Funding Request Number(s): 2605874, 2605894
Your Correspondence Dated: March 23,2016

After thorough review and investigation of all relevant facts, the Schools and Libraries
Division (SLD) of the Universal Service Administrative Company (USAC) has made its
decision in regard to your appeal of USAC's Funding Year 2014 Notification of
Commitment Adjustment Letter for the Application Number indicated above. This letter
explains the basis of USAC's decision. The date of this letter begins the 60 day time
period for appealing this decision. If your Letter of Appeal included more than one
Application Number, please note that you will receive a separate letter for each
application.

Funding Request Number(s): 2605874, 2605894
Decision on Appeal: Denied
Explanation:

e FCC rules require that Invoice Deadline Extension requests be filed by the end of
the relevant invoice receipt period for the service category of the FRN requiring
an extension.  The invoice receipt deadline is 120 days after the end of the
service delivery date or 120 days alter the date of the Form 486 Notification
Letter, whichever is later. USAC denied your request for Invoice Deadline
Extension because the request was not filed in a timely manner. Since USAC's
decision was consistent with the FCC rules, your appeal is denied.

Since your appeal was denied in full, dismissed or cancelled. you may file an appeal with
the FCC. Your appeal must be postmarked within 60 days ol the date on this letter.
Failure to meet this requirement will result in automatic dismissal of your appeal. You

1000 South Jefterson Road, P.O. Box 902, Whippany, New lersey 07951
Visit us online at: wanw usac org/sl/



should refer to CC Docket No. 02-6 on the first page of your appeal 1o the FCC. I you
are submitting your appeal via United States Postal Service, send to: FCC. Office of the
Seeretary, 445 12th Street SW, Washington, DC 20554. Further information and options
for filing an appeal directly with the FCC can be found under the Reference
Area/"Appeals” of the SLD section of the USAC website or by contacting the Client
Service Bureau. We strongly recommend that you use the clectronic filing options.

We thank you for your continued support, patience and cooperation during the appeal
process.

Schools and Libraries Division
Universal Service Administrative Company

ce: Lee Ullrich

100 South Jetterson Road. P.O. Box 902, Wiippany, New lersey 07951
Visit us online at: waw usac org/sl



