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418793
418793
418743
4187393
418825
418825
418825
418825
418825
418825
418825
418825
418825
418825
418825
418825
418825

1153404
1153419
1153423
1153429
1153458
1153465
1153476
1153481
1153486
1153495
1153502
1154841
1154851
1154859
1154866
1154873
1154878

Number FRN

World
World
World
World
World
World
World
World
World
World
World
World
World
World
World
World
World

Communications
Communications
Communications
Communications
Communications
Communications
Communications
Communications
Communications
Communications
Communications
Communications
Communications
Communications
Communications
Communications
Communicaticens

Applicant Name

Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter

BEN
School
school
School
School
School
School
School
School
School
School
School
School
School
School
School
School
school

SPIN

151163
191163
191163
191163
191163
191183
191163
191163
191163
191163
191163
191163
191163
191163
191163
191163
191163

Service Provider Legal Name

143000083
143000083
143000804
143020661
143020516
143008340
143008840
143008940
143008940
143008940
143026063
143027179
143027179
143020873
143004851
143025942
143020661

file:///D:/DOCUME~1/SUZANNEZ/LOCAL S~1/TEMP/radB981C.tmp

Funding Year

Peco Hyperion Telecommunications {TelCove) 2004
Peco Hyperion Telecommunications (TelCove) 2004
Nextel Communications of Mid-Atlantic, Inc. 2004
Final Mile Technologies 2004

Geopffrey P. Deans 2004

Complete Convergence Inc 2004

Cemplete Convergence Inc 2004

Complete Convergence Inc 2004

Complete Convergence Inc 2004

Complete Convergence Inc 2004

Informed Resources, Inc. 2004

Friedman Computer Solutions, Inc. 2004
Friedman Computer Solutions, Inc. 2004
CompuWorld, Inc. 2004

ProMedia Technelogy Services, Inc. 2004

Premier Networks, Inc. 2004
Final Mile Technologies 2004

TN/ ANANA 1,79 TIRA
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424620
424620
424620
424620
424620
424620
424620
4246290

1193441
1193661
1194037
1194244
1194470
1194787
1195398
1195650

Number FEN
WISSAHICKCON
WISSAHICKCN
WISSAHICKON
WISSAHICKON
WISSAHICKON
WISSAHICKON
WISSAHICKON
WISSARHICKON

Applicant Name

CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER

SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOQL
SCHOCL
SCHOCL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL

BEN

231072
231072
231072
231072
231072
231072
231072
231072

file:///D:/DOCUME~1/SUZANNEZ/LOCALS~1/TEMP/radFOD59 tmp

Funding Year

2004
2004

2004

SPIN Service Provider Legal Name

143006954 Southern NJ Internet Providers

143006994 Southern NJ Internet Providers

143000904 Nextel Communications of Mid-Atlantic, Inc.
143020661 Final Mile Technologies 2004

143020661 Final Mile Technologies 2004

143020661 Final Mile Techmologies 2004

143008940 Complete Convergence, Inc.

143004358 Apple Computer, Inc. 2004

2004

TN 12/9004 117 DAA
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418401
418401
418401
418401
418401
418461
418461
418461
418461
418461
418461
41846l
418461
418461
418461
418461
418461
418461
418461

1152211
1152218
1152221
1152226
1152230
1152063
1152074
1152078
1152082
1152086
1152089
1152090
11520095
1152100
1152108
1152115
1152119
1152122
1152126

Number

Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising
Raising

FRN

Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons
Horizons

Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest
Quest

Applicant Name

Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter
Charter

BEN
School
School
School
School
School
School
School
School
School
Scheool
School
Schoel
School
School
School
School
School
School
School

SPIN

220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281
220281

Service Provider Legal Name

143006994
143006994
143000904
143020661
143026864
143020516
143008940
143008940
143008940
143008940
143008%40
143008185
143026063
143020873
143027179
143027179
143004851
143025942
143020661

file:///D:/DOCUME-~1/SUZANNEZ/LOCALS~1/TEMP/rad8 A5B9.tm;

Funding Year

Southern WJ Internet Providers 2004
Southern NJ Internet Providers 2004

Nextel Communications of Mid-Atlantic, Inc.
Final Mile Technologies 2004

Webgatherings 2004

Geoffrey P. Deans 2004

Complete Convergence Inc 2004
Complete Convergence Inc 2004
Complete Convergence Inc 2004
Complete Convergence Inc 2004
Complete Convergence Inc 2004

ComTec Systems Inc. 2004

Informed Resources, Inc. 2004
CompuWorld, Inc. 2004

Friedman Computer Solutions, Inc. 2004
Friedman Computer Solutions, Inc. 2004
ProMedia Technology Services, Inc. 2004

Premier Networks, Inc. 2004
Final Mile Technologies 2004

2004

10129004 1-14 DRA
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418699
418699
418699
418699
418699
418718
418718
418718
418718
418718
418718
418718
418718
418718
418718
418718

1153057
11530862
1153066
1153071
1153073
1153147
1153165
1153169
1153172
1153188
1153193
1153200
1153205
1153218
1153221
1153226

RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD
RICHARD

FRN

ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN
ALLEN

Applicant Name

PREFARTORY
PREPARTORY
PREPARTORY
PREPARTORY
PREFARTORY
PREFARTORY
PREPARTORY
PREPARTORY
PREPARTORY
PREPARTORY
PREPARTORY
PREPARTORY
PREPARTORY
PREPARTORY
PREPARTORY
PREPARTORY

CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER

BEN
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL

SPIN

228367
228367
228367
228367
228367
228367
228367
228367
228367
228367
228367
228367
228367
228367
228367
228367

file:///D:/DOCUME~1/SUZANNEZ/LOCALS~1/TEMP/radC6 1BD.tmp

Service Provider Legal Name Funding Year

143006994 Southern NJ Internet Providers 2004
143006994 Socuthern NJ Internet Providers 2004
143000904 Nextel Communications of Mid~Atlantic, Inc. 2004
143020661 Final Mile Technologies 2004

143026864 Webgatherings 2004

143020516 Geoffrey P. Deans 2004

143008940 Complete Convergence Inc 2004
143008340 Complete Convergence Inc 2004
143008940 Complete Convergence Inc 2004
143020661 Final Mile Technologies 2004

143026063 Informed Resources, Inc. 2004
143027179 Friedman Computer Sclutions, Inc. 2004
143027179 Friedman Computer Sclutions, Inc. 2004
143020873 CompuWorld, Inc. 2004

143004851 ProMedia Technology Services, Inc. 2004
143025%42 Premier Networks, Inc. 2004

10/12/2004 1:15 PM
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418570
418570
418570
418570
418570
418589
418583
418589
418589
418589
418589
418589
418589
418589
418589
418589
418589
418589
418589
418589
423402

1152633
1152637
1152641
1152645
1152651
1152699
1152706
11582712
1152717
1152724
1152736
1152747
1152761
1152773
1152792
1152838
1152915
1152920
1152828
11529832
1168661

RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE
RENAISSANCE

Applicant Name

CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER

SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOCL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOQL
S$CHOCL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
3CHOCL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHQOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL

BEN

227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139
227139

file:///D:/DOCUME~1/SUZANNEZ/LOCALS~1/TEMP/rad071A1.tmp

SPIN Service Provider Legal Name Funding Year
143006994 Southern NJ Internet Providers 2004
143000904 Nextel Communications of Mid-Atlantic, Inc.
143027179 Friedman Computer Sclutions, Inc. 2004
143020661 Final Mile Technologies 2004

143026864 Webgatherings 2004

143008940 Complete Convergence Inc 2004
143020516 Geoffrey P. Deans 2004

143008940 Complete Convergence Inc 2004
143008940 Complete Ceonvergence Inc 2004
143008940 Complete Convergence Inc 2004
143026063 Informed Resources, Inc. 2004
143025484 Worldwide Telecom 2004

143025484 Worldwide Telecom 2004

143027179 Friedman Computer Solutiens, Inc. 2004
143027179 Friedman Computer Solutions, Inc. 2004
143027179 Friedman Computer Solutions, Inc. 2004
143020873 Compuworld, Inc. 2004

143004851 ProMedia Technology Services, Inc. 2004
143025942 Premier Networks, Inc. 2004

143020661 Final Mile Technologies 2004

143666666 SLD Interim 2004

1N/12/2004 1-15 PM
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418390
418390
418390
418390
418390
418393
418393
418393
418393
418393
418393
418393
418393
418393
418393
418393
418393
418393
418393

1151650
11516533
1151656
1151659
1151663
1151672
1151673
1151674
1151676
1151678
1151679
1151682
1151687
1151683
1151692
1151695
1151697
1151700
1151702

Number

IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHQTEP
IMHCTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP
IMHOTEP

FRN

CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER

Applicant Name

SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOQL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOCL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOCL

198934
198934
198934
198934
198934
198934
198934
198934
198934
198934
198934
198934
198934
158834
198934
198934
198934
188934
198934

BEN SPIN
1430069594
143000304
143006994
143020661
143026864
143020516
143008340
143008940
143008940
143008940
143008540
143008185
143004340
143026063
143027179
143027179
143020873
143004851
143025942

Service Provider Legal Name

Southern NJ Internet Providers
Nextel Communications of Mid-Atlantic,
Southern NJ Internet Providers

Final Mile Technologies 2004

Webgatherings 2004
Geoffrey P. Deans
Complete Convergence
Complete Convergence
Complete Convergence
Complete Convergence
Complete Convergence
ConmTec Systems Inc.
Dell Marketing LP
Informed Resources,

Inc
Inc
Inc
Inc
Inc

Inc.

2004

2004
2004

Friedman Computer Solutions,
Friedman Computer Solutiens,

CompuWorld, Inc.

2004

Funding Year

2004

2004

2004
2004
2004
2004
2004

2004

inc.
Inc.

ProMedia Technology Services, Inc.
Premier Networks, Inc.

2004

Inc.

2004
2004

2004

file:///D:/DOCUME~1/SUZANNEZ/LOCALS~1/TEMP/rad9F750.tmp

inamnnd 1-14 DS
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418373
418373
418373
418373
418373
418380
418380
418380
418380
418380
418380
418380
418380
418380
418380
418380
418380

1151537
1151539
1151543
1151549
1151553
1151574
1151575
1151579
1151584
1151589
1151594
1151599
1151604
1151617
1151622
1151627
1151630

Number FRN

IMANTI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI
IMANI

EDUCATION
EDUCATION
EDUCATION
EDUCATION
EDUCATICON
EDUCATION
EDUCATION
EDUCATION
EDUCATION
EDUCATION
EDUCATION
EDUCATION
EDUCATION
EDUCATION
EDUCATION
EDUCATION
EDUCATION

Applicant Name

CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE
CIRCLE

221548
221548
221548
221548
221548
221548
221548
221548
221548
221548
221548
221548
221548
221548
221548
221548
221548

BEN SPIN
143006994
143006294
143000504
143008540
143026864
143020516
143008840
143008840
143008940
143008940
143008940
143008940
143026063
143008185
143027179
143004851
143025942

Service Provider Legal Name

Southern NJ Internet Providers
Southern NJ Internet Providers
Nextel Communications of Mid-Atlantic,

Complete Convergence Inc
Webgatherings 2004

Geoffrey
Conplete
Complete
Complete
Complete
Complete
Complete
Informed

P. Deans
Convergence
Convergence
Convergence
Convergence
Convergence
Convergence
Resources,

ComTec Systems Inc.
Friedman Computer Solutions,

ProMedia Technology Services,
Premier Networks,

Inc
Inc
Inc
Inc
Inc
Inc

Inc.

Inc.

2004

2004

2004

Funding Year

2004
2004

2004

2004
2004
2004
2004
2004
2004
2004

Inc.
Inc.

Inc.

2004
2004

file:///D:/DOCUME~1/SUZANNEZ/LOCALS~1/TEMP/rad5A195.tmp
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428323
428323
428323
428323
428347
428347
428347
428347
428347

1186963
1186976
1186982
1186988
1187018
1187024
1187077
1187087
1187094

Number FRN

HOPE
HOFE
HOFPE
HOPE
HOPE
HOPE
HOPE
HOPE
HOPE

CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER

Applicant Name

SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL

16020079
16020079
16020079
16020079
160200798
16020079
16020079
16020079
16020079

file:///D:/DOCUME~1/SUZANNEZ/LOCALS~1/TEMP/rad601D7.tmp

SPIN Service Provider Legal Name Funding Year
143025851 Digital Ingenuity Inc. 2004

143000904 Nextel Communications of Mid-Atlantic, Inc.
143025851 Digital Ingenuity Inc. 2004

143026864 Webgatherings 2004

143025851 Digital Ingenuity Inc. 2004

143027179 Friedman Computer Solutions, Inc. 2004
143020873 CompuWorld, Inc. 2004

143004851 ProMedia Technology Services, Inc. 2004
143008940 Complete Convergence Inc 2004

\

2004

INAYANA 1-19 DAL
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411507
411507
411507
411507
411507
411877
411877
411877
411877
411877
411877
411877
411877
411877
411877
411877
411877
411877
411877
417369

1148162
1148167
1148172
1148174
1148176
1148062
1148071
1148075
1148078
1148082
1148087
1148095
1148100
1148104
1148108
1148113
1148116
1148120
1148125
1148153

Number FRN

DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCQVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY
DISCOVERY

CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER

Applicant Name

SCHOQL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHCOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOCL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOQL
SCHOCL
SCHQOL
SCHOOL
SCHOCL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL

BEN

16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077
16020077

Service Provider Legal Name

143006994
143000904
143027179
143020661
143026864
143020516
143008940
143008940 .
143008340
143008940
143008940

143026063 ;»(,H/,a
-

143008185
143027179
1430271798
143027179
143004851
143020873
143025942
143020661

(-

file:///D:/DOCUME~1/SUZANNEZ/LOCALS~1/TEMP/radC65B4.tmp

Friedman Computer Soluti

Final Mile Technologies 2004 =

Webgatherings 2004
Geoffrey P. Deans
Complete Convergence Inc
Complete Convergence Inc
Complete Convergence Inc
Complete Convergence Inc
omplete Convergence Inc
Informed Resources, Inc.
ComTec Systems Inc.

Funding Year
Southern NJ Internet Providers
Nextel Communications of Mid-Atlantic,

ons,

2004

2004

Friedman Computer Solutions, Inc

Friedman Computer Soluti

ons,

Friedman Computer Solutions, Inc

ProMedia Technology Services,

CompuWorld, Inc.
Premier Networks, Inc.

2004
2004

2004
Inc.
Inc L 2004
76 s b

2004
2004
2004
2004
2004
2004

2004

Inc 2004

2004

Inc. 2004

Final Mile Technologies 2004 7T 4 s‘wb

2004

10/12/2004 1:07 PM
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418328
418328
418328
418328
418328
418348
418348
418348
418348
418348
418348
418348
418348
418348
418348
418348
418348

1151307
1151317
1151324
1151328
1151336
11513%e
1151402
1151408
1151424
1151430
1151443
1151449
1151462
1151468
1151472
1151477
1151479

Number

HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMEBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE
HARAMBEE

FRN

CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER
CHARTER

SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOQL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL

Applicant Name

228148
228148
228148
228148
228148
228148
228148
228148
228148
228148
228148
228148
228148
228148
228148
228148
228148

BEW SPIN
143006994
143006994
143000904
143020661
143026864
143020516

143008940 g

14300894077 O
143008940”‘7Z {
143008940 /
143008185 _
143026063
143027179
143027179
143020873
143004851
143020661

file:///D:/DOCUME~1/SUZANNEZ/L OCALS~1/TEMP/radAEA 56.tmy

Service Provider Legal Name Funding Year
Southern NJ Internet Providers 2004
Southern NJ Internet Providers 2004

Nextel Communications of Mid-Atlantic, Inc.
Final Mile Technologies 2004

Webgatherings 2004

Geoffrey P. Deans 2004

Complete Convergence Inc 2004
Complete Convergence Inc 2004
Complete Convergence Inc 2004
Complete Convergence Inc 2004

ComTec Systems Inc. 2004

Informed Resources, Inc. 2004
Friedman Computer Solutions, Inc, 2004
Friedman Computer Solutions, Inc. 2004
CompuWorld, Inc. 2004

ProMedia Technology Services, Inc. 2004

Final Mile Technologies 2004

/-

2004

INIINNA 1-11 DA
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471 Application Number FRN Applicant Name BEN SPIN Service Provider Legal Name Funding Year

411961 1148227 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOQL 221549 143006994 Scuthern WJ Internet Providers 2004

411961 1148230 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 221549 143000904 Nextel Communications of Mid-Atlantic, Inc. 2004
411961 1148233 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 221549 143006994 Southern NJ Internet Providers 2004

411961 1148236 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 221549 143020661 Final Mile Technologies 2004 — p’t]”Z; <o EB
411561 1148239 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOQOL 221549 143026864 Webgatherings 2004

417393 1148258 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 2215485 143008940 Complete Convergence Inc 2004

417393 1148259 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 221549 143008940 Complete Convergence Inc 2004

417393 1148263 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 221549 143008940 Complete Convergence Inc 2004

417393 1148264 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 221549 14300894071 Complete Convergence Inc 2004

417393 1148267 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOCL 221549 143008940 Complete Convergence Inc 2004

417393 1148269 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 221549 143008940 Complete Convergence Inc 2004

417393 1151116 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 22154% 143020516 — Geoffrey P. Deans 2004

417393 1151127 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 221549 143026063”, ~ Informed Resources, Inc. 2004 ({
417393 1151131 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 221549 143020661 @inal Mile Technologies 2004 ’/)T—é S’w
417393 1151135 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 221549 143020661 inal Mile Technologies 2004 /

417393 1151139 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 221549 143004851 ProMedia Technology Services, Inc. 2004
417393 1151143 GERMANTOWN SETTLEMENT CHARTER SCHOOL 221549 143027179 Friedman Computer Scolutions, Inc, 2004

a”

1N/17/7004 1.00 DRA
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RelComm, Inc. vs. Deposition of
Martin Friedman

Atlantic City Board of Education, et als.

Friday -

October 1, 2004

983-8484

Page 1
1 SUPERIOR COURT OF NEW JERSEY
LAW DIVISION - ATLANTIC COUNTY
2 DOCKET NO. ATL-1~477~04
3
RELCOMM, INC.,
4 Plaintiff,
5 vs.
6 ATLANTIC CITY BOARD OF EDUCATION;
FREDERICK P. NICKELS; MICRO
7 TECHNOLOGY GROUPE, INC.; DONNA
HAYE; MARTIN FRIEDMAN; ALEMAR
8 CONSULTING; and JOHN DOES 1-20,
Defendants.
9
10 e
Friday, October 1, 2004
R GCOPRY
12 Q
Oral sworn deposition of MARTIN
13 FRIEDMAN, taken at the law offices of Flaster
Greenberg, 1810 Chapel Avenue West, Cherry Hill, New
14 Jersey, before Robert J. Boccolini, Certified
Shorthand Reporter and Notary Public of the State of
15 New Jersey, on the above date, commencing at 10:10
a.m., there being present:
FLASTER GREENBERG
1810 Chapel Avenue West
Cherry Hill, NJ 08002
BY: J. PHILIP KIRCHNER, ESQ.
Attorneys for Plaintiff
TATE & TATE

The Lexington Building, Suite 5
180 Tuckerton Road
Medford, New Jersey 08055
(856) 983-8484 - (800) 636-8283
www.tate-tate.com

Tate & Tate 215-735-9088
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1 A. Actually, yes, itlis. 1 Q. 1997, 1believe, is that about when the
2 Q. Areyouan employee of Alemar at this time 2 program started?
3 today? ‘ 3 A, Yes.
4 A. Yes. 4 Q. Isthatright?
5 Q. Isthat your fulltime employment? 5 A. Yes.
6 A. Yes, 6 Q. And so,did Mr. Nickels call you or send you
7 Q. When did you become a fulltime employee of 7 aletter or how did he communicats that he wanted you
8 Alemar? 8 to attend a meeting? :
9 A. Around November of 2003. 9 A. [Iactually don't recall.
10 Q. Okay. Why did you leave Temple? 10 Q. Did anyone from ComTec Consulting contact you
i1 A. There was an administration that came in that 11  at the same time to tell you about this opportunity?
12 1wasn't really — I didn't like them, so 1 decided 12 A.  1don'trecall -
13 to leave. 13 Q. Do you recall when you were invited to attend
14 Q. Prior to that time, had you been working on a 14  that meeting?
15 parttime basis for Alemar? ' 15 A. Octoberor November of 2002 1 believe that
16 A. Yes. 16 was.
17 Q. What-- strike that. 17 Q. And did you have a meeting?
18 Under what states' laws is Alemar 183 A. Yes. ‘
19 incorporated, if you know? 19 Q. Who was present at the meeting?
20 A. Pennsylvania I believe. 20 A. Present was — I don't recall everyone, but
21 Q. Prior to your work for the Atlantic City 21 1I'l give you who I recall.
22 School Board, had your work been primarily for 22 Mr. Nickels, Miss Haye, another assistant
23 Pennsylvania schools and school districts? 23 superintendent, male, may have been black, I'm not
24 A. Yes. 24 sure, Mir. Gallagher — is he on the board? He's an
25 MS. WEINSTEIN: Objection. 25 attorney on the board, I believe, so Mr. Gallagher
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1 Q. Had you done work for any New Jersey schools 1 was there.
2 prior to your -- 2 There was another board member there who is
3 MS. WEINSTEIN: Objection to the form of 3 no longer on the board. There was an officer, a
4  the question. 4 police officer, I believe. There was also the
5 Q. --work for the Atlantic City School Board? 5  interim business administrator and the school
6 MS. WEINSTEIN: Objection. 6 district's business manager, and probably ene or two
7 THE WITNESS: No. 7 other people.
8 BY MR. KIRCHNER: 8 Q. The interitu business administrator, would
9 Q. How were you introduced to the Atlantic City 9 that be Lesley Motz?
10 School Board? : 10 A. Yes.
11 A.  Iwas invited by the superintendent to a 11 Q. And the business manager, is that Elisha
12 meeting. ‘12 Thompkins?
13 Q. The superintendent Mr. Fred Nickels? i3 A. Yes.
14 A. Yes. 14 Q. Was Marilyn Cohen at the meeting?
15 Q. How did Mr. Nickels know you, if you know? 15 A. Tdon'trecall. Ido notbelieve so.
16 A. Mr. Nickels heard from a company called 16 Q. How about John Jones, was he at the meeting?
17 ComTec that I worked with E-Rate and they recommended 17 A. Ne.
18 that he contact me to talk about thelr E-Rate status. 18 Q. And did Mr. Nickels run the meeting?
19 Q. Is E-Rate consulting the primary business of 19 A. 1believe so, for the most part.
20 Alemar? 20 Q. And what did you discuss at that meeting?
21 A.  Yes 21 A. They discussed — the district was fearful
22 Q. How long has Alemar been in the E-Rate 22 that they may not have complied with the E-Rate for a
23  consulting business? 23 number of years. They wanted me to review their
24 A. Sincethe program's lnception, elght years or 24 E-Rate submission, most especially for Year 5 and let
25 seven years. 25 them know where they were.
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BILL TO Atlantic City School District

cio Complste Convergencs, inc
311A Old Rodgers Rd

Bristol, PA 19007
2156.788.6811

215.788.1766 fax

Attn: Accounts Payable
1809 Pacific Avenue

SERVICE LOCATI..

invoice
DATE INVOICE #
0212812004 50059

Atlantic City School District
Data Center
1809 Pacific Avenue

Atlantic City NJ 08401 Atlaatic City NJ 08401
Attn: M. Coha
TELEPHONE # 609-343-7300
P.O. NO. TERMS DUE DATE REP SERVICE DATE MTG TICKET# REQUESTED BY
04-02179 Net 30 03/29/2004 RL Marilyn Cohen
ITEM QrYy OESCRIPTION TCH RATE AMOUNT
Cable 2{ 802026 Enclosed Rack with Vented sides and 593.00 1,186.00
plexiglass doors
Cable 8] 885004 Preferred Instaliation by Comtec 88.00 704.00
Cable 11805012 Visit Charge 78.00 73.00
Thank you for conlinuing {o choosc us as your Information Technology,
Consulting and Sales Firm. Sales Tax (0.0%) $0.00
Total S1.968.00
Balance Due  SueR.
0068512
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MICRO Technel " Groupe, Inc. N nvoice
‘ MR O division of Cumplete ¢, cienicn, Inc, . Q
_ e DATE INVOICE #
‘- ——¢ RemitTo: Micro Technology Groupe. Inc. 6 4
cio Complete Convergencs, inc 02/06/2004 50058
311A Oid Rodgers Rd
wwEle Bristol, PA 19007

216.788.6811
2156.788.1766 fax

BILL TO Atlantic City School District
Attn: Accounts Payable

1809 Pacific Avenue
Atlantic City NJ 08401

SERVICE LOCATL.

Atlantic City School District
Data Center

1809 Paciflic Avenue
Atlantic City NJ 08401
Atén: M. Cohin

TELEPHONE # 609-343-7300
P.0. NO. TERMS DUE DATE REP SERVICE DATE MTG TICKET# REQUESTED BY
04-02179 Net 30 03/07/2004 RL 1272972003 Marilyn Cohen
ITEM Qrty DESCRIPTION TCH RATE AMOUNT
Cable 5.5 | 885004 Preferred Installation by Comtec $7.00 478.50
Cable 1 | 802007 71t Rack package 359.00 359.00
Cable 2| 802018 rack shelf 61.00 122.00
Cable 11805012 Trip Charge 78.00 78.00
Cable 21| 885004 Preferred Installation by Comtec 87.60 1.827.00
Cable 1 | 802007 Wire and Cable 144.25 144.25
Cable t 1 805012 Visit Charpe 78.00 78.00
Thank you for continiing to choose us as your Information Technology,
Consulting and Sales Firm, Sales Tax (0.0%) $0
Total $1,086
Balance Due

SO

006815







MICRO Technology _.oupe, Inc.

a division of MAC Technology Groupe, Inc.

Suite H
3580 Progress Drive
Bensalem, PA 19020

s » s 0

215.245.8144 Fax 215.245.5116 wWww.mitgroupe.com

January 9, 2004

Mr. Martin Friedman
Atlantic City Schools
1809 Pacific Avenue
Atlantic City, NJ 08401-6803

Dear Mr. Friedman,

MICRO Technology Groupe, Inc. (MTG) of 311 A Old Rodgers Road, Bristol, PA is
pleased to present this proposal for the Districts’ Year 7 E-rate applications.

Please be aware of a few things. First, MTG has responded to the areas of the bid that are
within the expertise of MTG Engineers. We have offered *no bids” in areas where we do

not feel we can provide the district with the best level of service.

Second, we have bid the number of items as specified in the bid, but have also made
recommendations on the actual number of units we feel is needed by the district.

Third, we have provided the necessary documents — including reference letters, list of
references, and E-rate contracts.

MTG is very familiar with the Erate program and providing products and services to
schools via Erate. This includes the proper invoicing of goods and services approved by
the SLD.

Please take a few moments and review the information. We would appreciate the
opportunity to speak to you and the school about the products we have recommended.

I can be reached at 610-777-8650 or at rich@mtgroupe.com if you have any questions.
Thanks for your time and consideration.

Sincerely,

Richard D. Linkchorst :
Account Executive 006039


http://mtgroupe.com
mailto:rich@rntcrouDe.com
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Atlantic City BVE-Admin MICRO Technology Groupe, Inc.

1809 Pacific Avenue 311 A Old Rodgers Road
Atlantic City, NJ 08401-6803 Bristol, PA 15007
609-343-7200 SPIN 143008940
SLD Form# ;s:

678310000481953 1/8/04

Proposal for #678310000481953

Erate Proposal for Internal Connections
Al hardware or software will be purchased as fisted or "newer”

AGREEMENTS/WARRANTIES

LAN Maintenance Agreement
Rescription Extended Price
1 LAN Maintenance Agreement for 650 on-site hours on All Erate Eligible $ 74,750.00
Servers, Switches, Wireless Access peints, UPS units, Back up Drives.
Wire & Cable Maintenance
"No Bid™
Telephone System Maintenance Agreement
"No Bid”
Extended Warranties for Existing Equipment
Qty. Description Unit Price Exiended Price
12 One Year Srnartnet Maintenance 8x5xNext Business Day on the 6509 $ 832000 % 99,840.00
82 One Year Smartnet Maintenance 8x5xNext Business Day on the 3750 $ 728.00 $ 59,696.00
Sub Total $ 159,536.00
Qty. Description Unit Price Extended Price
Note - the school has two Watchguard Flrabox 4500 Firewall units, which are eligibla
undar Erate Year 7. Tha hardware warranty and software support for one year is covered.
2 Watchguard Extended Warranty 1 Yeaer Express for Firebox 4500 - Hardware $ 530.00 $ 1,060.00
2 Watchguard Extended Warranty 1 Yeaer Express for Firebox 4500 - Software $ 1,150.00 §% 2,300.00
Sub Totat $ 3,360.00
Equipment
CODEC "NO BID"
FIREWALL SERVER/ROUTER - MTG has determined no additional equipment Is neaded.
PYBX
PVBX Video Equipment
All products listed below are eRate eligible. School will need to purchase non-eligible products such as TVs, VCRs,
and cameras.
There are 6§ PVBX systams and related accessories in the pricing listed below.
There were 165 nodes requested In the bid documents.
Qty. Description unit Price
6  32x32 PvBX Switch $ 33,575.00 % 201,450.00
192 Video Modulator Pair $ 170,00 $ 32,640.00
192  Video Modulator Supply $ 255.00 $ 48,950.00
6  Rack System $ 850.00 ¢ 5,100,00
18 Agile Modulator $ 298.00 $ 5.364.00
6  Back up UPS APC 2200 RMIU $ 96400 $ 5,784.00
6 Complete Installation of the PVBX System by Certified MTG Engineers $ 3,500.00 $ 21,000.00

Maintenance Agreament
1 Maintenance Agreement for All Year € Erate eligible PVBX Video Products $ 12,000.00
90 Hours of On-site support wil be provided with this Maintenance Agreement
SubTotal $ 332,298.00

006040
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LAN CABLING AND ELECTRONICS

Cable Drops -
"No Bid"”

Wireless LAN for 106 areas
Qty,

Configuration Study to determine the best locations of the Access points. This will maximize wireless coverage.

106  CGsco Aironet 802.1G Access point

$ 659.00
212 Cisco 2.2 Gbi dipole Antenna $ 14.30
2 antennas are required for each access point.
106 Cisco Smartnet Maintenance - One Year for Wireless Access point $ 56.75
106 Installation Services by our Authorized Cisco Systems Engineer $ 250.00
This installation includes the configuration charge by MTG to determine Sub Total
the best location and configuration of the Wirgless Accass points., This wilt maximize
the effectiveness of the wireless equipment.
MLK Wireless Connection
1 Wireless connection to the modulars for MLK $ 11,995.00
This includes: 5 Wireless base units, five antennas, mounting equipment.
4 Cisco Catalyst 3750 12 SFP Standard Multilayer Image WS-C3750G-125-S $ 5,475.00
4  Cisco Smartnet Level 8 8x5xNext Business Day - One Year $ 585,00
4  APC SmartUPS PowerStack 250 rack mount UPS $ 190.00
1 Instaliation
Notea - this is only for the wirelass connection to tha 4 modulars. It Sub Total
does not Include the cabling requested within the modular units.
Note - tha wiring bidder must provids a deep cabinet in order housa the switch, UPS,
in additlon to the wirlng patch panel.
48-Port Switches
Qty, DRescription Unit Price
8  Catalyst 3750 48 10/100 + 4 SFP Standard Muitllayer Image $ 4,795.00
8  GE SFP, LC connector SX transceiver $ 350.00
1 Instailation by our Cisco Certifled Engineer
Sub Total
Routers - Wa do not fee! they are needed by the district.
Equipment Rack - Oty, 2
Qty. Dexcription Unit Price
2 APC Netshelter VX Base Enclosure Rack $ 1,666.00
2 APC Blanking panel kit $ 61.00
2 APC Roof fan trey $ 308.00
2 APC Rack mount LCD Monitor/keyboard drawer $ 1,902,000
2 Belkin Omniview 8 port KVM switch $ 329.00
16 Belkin 10 foot PS2 KVM cable set $ 44.00
2 Instalation of 2 APC racks and associated equipment by our APC -trainedEngineer Sub Total

NOTE: This UPS requires a 120 V 30 amp twist lock plupg. This is not Erate eligibla.
Pleasa consult with your electrician for the installation of that plug.

Patch Panels
"No Bid”

Patch Cables
"No Bid"

MTG, Inc. Confidential

Yr. 7...953

aven @an

$
$

$
$

Description Unlt pPrice Extended Price
We understand there are 106 areas to be covered with Access poimts. We highly recommend a

69,854.00
3,031.60

6,015.50
26,500.00
105,401.10

11,995.00

21,500.00
2,380.00
760.00
6,000.00
43,035.00

38,360.00
2,800.00
5,000.00

46,160.00

1,666.00
61.00
308.00
1,902.00
329.00
176.00
4,442.00

006049
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UPS - Qty. 10

0" Amencan o

Anit Price Jotal Price
American Power Conversion SmartUPS 3000va $ 132500 $ 13,250.00
10  APC Battery Pack $ 615.00 ¢ 6,150.00
10 Installation $ 250.00 $ 2,500,00
NOTE: This UPS raquires 2 120 V 30 amp twist lock plug. This is not Erate eligible. Sub Total $ 21,900,00
Please consult with your elactrician for the Instaliation of that plug.
Distance Learning Units
"No Bid~
Wireless Network Interface Cards
The Form 470 request 60 wireless cards. You can get either PCMCIA (for laptop computers) and PCI cards (for
desktop computers with a PCI slot). We have priced 50 of both,
If the SLD deems the card Is eligible, however at less than 100%, the school is responsible for 100% of the inelgible
portion, plus 10% of the eligible portion.
Qty. Description Anit Prica Jotal Prica
PCI Network Interface cards
60  Cisco PCI Network Interface cards $ 233.00 % 13,980.00
60 Installation of Wireless Network card $ 250,00 $ 15,000.00
SubTota) % 28,980.00
Wireless access points for 35 mobile units -- "NO BID™
DISTANCE ED - "NO BID"
NON ERATE ELIGIBLE
Since the district is looking at implementing wireless on a large scale, we recommend a wireless
study for each building.
1 do not believe this is Erate eligible, but defer to the expertise of the districts' Erate consultant.
Description Anit Price
9 Building-wide Wireless Site Survey $ 1,500.00 $ 13,500.00

006042
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Erate Contract

Contract # Y1-00100AC

This contract is based on the funding commitment from Schools and Library Division (SLD) of the Universal Service Administrative
Company (USAC). The commitment made here is contingent on the school entity being approved for funding by the receipt

of a Funding Commitment Deadsion Letter from the USAC for the requested amount. If funding is reduced, the school has the

option of reducing the scope of the contract accerdingly. If, for any reason, funding is denied, this agreement wouid then be
null and veid.

MTG requires the schoal to file their Form 486 as soon as possible after Erate approval is granted. MTG will not process any orders
until the SLD approves the 486 and notifies MTG that the 486 has been processed.

MTG will notify the school when the 486 is processed to begin the order process. MTG requires a valid school purchase order and a deposit
before any products or services are delivered.

The deposit comprises the schools' 10% of the eligible and 100% of the ineligible product.

Any products or services that are not paid by USAC and/or SLO upon recelpt of an invoice from MTG must be paid by the school.

SLD Form# -~
678310000481953

Please check the following products and services the school wishes to submit for E-rate approval:
Oty Description Unit Price Extended Price Check Here:
AGREEMENTS/WARRANTIES
LAN Maintenance Agreement

Qty.  Description

Extended Price
1 LAN Maintenance Agreement for 650 on-site hours on All Erate Eligible $ 74,750.00
Servers, Switches, Wireless Access points, UPS units, Back up Drives.

Extended W ties for Existing Equi :

Qty. Dagcription Unit Prica  Extemded Price
12 One Year Smartnet Maintenance BxSxNext Business Day on the 6509 $ 8,320.00 $% 99,840.00
82 One Year Smartnet Maintenance Bx5xNext Business Day on the 3750 4 728.00 $% 59,696,00

oty, DRescription Unit Price  Extanded Price

Note - the school has two Watchguasrd Firebox 4500 FirewaHl units, which are eligible
under Erate Year 7. The hardware warranty and software support for one year is covered,

2 Watchguard Extended Warranty 1 Veaer Express for Firebox 4500 - Hardware 4 530.00 % 1,060.00
2 Watchguard Extended Warmranty 1 Yeaer Express for Firebox 4500 - Software $ 1,150.00 $§ 2,300.00
Equipment
BYEX

PVBX Video Equipment

All products listed below are eRate eligible. Schoel will need to purchase non-eligible products such as Tvs, VCRs,
and cameras.

There are 8§ PVBX systems and related accessories In tha pricing listed below.
There ware 165 nodes requested in the bid documents.

Ay, Description Unit Price
1) 3I2x32 PVBX Switch $ 3357500 4§ 201,450.00
192 Video Modulator Pair $ 170.00 $ 32,640.00
192 Video Modulator Supply $ 255.00 %  48,960.00
] Rack System $ 850.00 $ 5,100.00
18 Agile Modulator $ 298.00 $ 5,364.00
6 Back up UPS APC 2200 RM3U $ 964.00 $ 5,784.00
6 Complete Installation of the PVBX System by Certified MTG Engineers $ 3,500.00 $ 21,000.00
Maintenance Agreament
1 Maintenance Agreement for All Year 6 Erate eligible PYBX Video Products $ 12,000.00

90 Hours of On-site support will be provided with this Maintenance Agreement

LAN CABLING AND ELECTRONICS
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Wireless LAN for 106 areas

Qty,

We understand there are 106 areas to be covered with Access points. We highly recommend a
Configuration Study to determine the best locations of the Access points. This will maximize wireless coverage.
106 Cisco Alronet 802.1G Access point $ 653.00
212 Cisco 2.2 Ghi dipole Antenna $ 1430 3
2 sntennas are required for each access point.
106 Cisco Smartnet Maintenance - One Year for Wireless Access point $ 56.75 §
106 Installation Services by our Authorized Cisco Systems Engineer $ 250.00 %
This installation includes the configuration charge by MTG to determine
the best location and configuration of the Wireless Access points. This will maximize
the effectiveness of the wireless equipment.
MLK Wireless Connection
1 Wireless connection to the modulars for MLK $ 11,99500 3§
This includes: 5 Wireless base units, five antennas, mounting equipment.
4 Cisco Catalyst 3750 12 SFP Standard Muitilayer Imege WS-C3750G-125-S $ 5,475.00 §
4 Cisco Smartnet Level 8 8x5xNext Business Day - One Year 3 539500 $
4 APC SmartUPS PowerStack 250 rack mount UPS $ 190.00 &
1 Installation $
Note - this is only for the wireless connection to the 4 modulars. It
does not include the cabling requested within the modular units.
Note - the wiring bidder must provide a deep cabinet in order house the switch, UPS,
in addition to the wiring patch panel.
48-Port Switches
Qty, Description Uniz Price
8 Catalyst 3750 48 10/100 + 4 SFP Standard Multilayer Image H 4,795.00 $
8 GE SFP, LC connector SX transceiver $ 350.00 $
1 Installation by our Clsco Certified Engineer $
Routers - Wa do not fes! they are heeded by the district.
Equipment Rack - Oty, 2
Qty, Description
2 APC Netshelter VX Base Enclosure Rack $ 1,666.00 §
2 APC Blanking panel kit $ 61.00 $
2 APC Roof fan tray $ 308.00 $
2 APC Rack mount LCD Monitor/keyboard drawer $ 1,902.00 %
2 Belkin Omniview 8 port KVM switch $ 329.00 $
16 Balkin 10 foot PS2 KVM cable set $ 4400 $
2 Installation of 2 APC racks and associated equipment by our APC -trainedEngineer
NOTE: This UPS requires a 120 V 30 amp twist lock plug. This is not Erate eligible.
Plaase consult with your electrician for the installation of that plug.
UPS - Qty. 10
Qty. Rescription
10 American Power Conversion SmartUpPS 3000Va $ 1,325.00 $
10 APC Battery Pack $ 615.00 $
10 Installation $ 25000 §
NOTE: This UPS requires a 120 V 30 amp twist lock piug. This Is not Erate eligible.

DRescription

Please consult with your electrician for the installation of that plug.

Wireless Network Interface Cards

Oty. Description
PCI Network Interface cards

60
60

The Form 470 request 60 wireless cards. You can get either PCMCIA (for laptop computers) and PCI cards (for

desktop computers with a PCI slot). We have priced 50 of both.

Extended Price

69,854.00
3,031.60

6,015.50
26,500.00

11,595.00

21,900.00
2,380.00
760.00
6,000.00

38,360.00
2,800.00
5,000.00

1,666.00
61.00
308.00
1,902.00
329.00
176.00

13,250.00
6,150.00
2,500.00

IF the SLD deems the card Is eligible, however at less than 100%, the school is responsible for 100% of the ineligible

portion, plus 10% of the eligible portion.

Cisco PCI Network Interfoce cards ]
Installation of Wireless Network card $

Wireless access points for 35 mobile units — "NO BID"

233.00 $
250.00 $

UnitPrice  _Total Price

13,980.00
15,000.00
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