
Let me krlOW what kind of ETA we are looking at.
I'm in a real emergency for at least 2 or 3 3550-24pwr's with stacking modules in all 3.
Thanks, Tim
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clayfendley

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Mike Seitz [mseitz@IKELECTRICcom]
Wednesday, July 26, 2006 11 :52 AM
clayfendley
FW: Palestine

Here is the PO number we were to reference for the order on the previous email.

-----Original Message-----
From: Tim Vent [mailto:tvent@griver.grsc.k12.ar.usJ
Sent: Monday, October 17, 2005 1:23 PM
To: Mike Seitz
Subject: Re: Palestine

P.O. #3742

Ju st ship it. t.o us here (but see if you can get me an ETA or a heads up when it ships so I
can be ready to unload it). Thanks, Tim

»> "Mike Seit_z" <mseitz@IKELECTRIC.com> 10/17/2005 12:59:59 PM »>
Tim,

Am I supposed to be referencing a purchase order number on this?

Mike Sei::z

:;:K Electric

501~376~2081 x172

mseitz@ikelectric.com <mailto:mseitz@ikelectric.com>

www.ikelectric.com <http://www.ikelectric.com>

1
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~ Schools &Li1raries

IMPORTANT

Please record this Invoice's information in a secure place for
future records

InvoicelD: 614810

Security Code: 6878

Continue»

Hnllil' Clienl Service Bureaul 1-888-20J-8100

In the Matter of I-K Electric
Company Request for Waiver

Exhibit 7
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FocmJ'J~Blocl-;l

~,Schools&Libraries

Form 474 • Block 2: Funding Request Number
Information
3. FOfTn J71 AcpFcation Nt;mce~ 37129,1

;034708 ~

Last

1C. Sill Freauency

Shicown Date to Customer or
Of VVOf.k. Periormed

Tetal AmoGr,t
j ~ by Ser:icc P:cvicier T-:;:),

Ser·/ice

< ~ Tota' C:scQunt Amount Billed te­
i~ SLC

Other

2005

108425.65

91077.54

Accept Invoice Une QueslionlProbrem

FRN's added so far:

Save & Exit Submit Invoice

Hi, inC Clicnt Service Bureau ]-888-203-5100

hUD:, \V\V\V .slforms,univer!:':l[service: .org/forrn474/Display_Pl N.aspx '?Cicrion=new' 11/1812005
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FCC Form 474 Approval O~.;18

3060 - 0856

Universal Service for Schools and Libraries

Tilis form C3:' be filed onlire or by m~ii.

Estimated Average 6lJfcer: H0:.r$ Pe~

Response: 1,5 ,,"';;;'::$

''':'(;:;;l ;;cm;:::;'0tet: by SBr.'ic8 PrOj:OSf5

SERVICE PROVIDER Invoice Form

Persons wiDfwl1y making faise st.tltemenis on this form can b~ punished by fine cdorfeiture, under the Communications Act. 47 U.S.C.
Sees, 502, 503(b), or fine or imprisonment tJl':der Tille HI of the United Stales Coce, 18 U.S.C, Sec, 1001.

\jCTiCE TO :t"OiVIDUA,-S: Seeier, 59 Q.<,; cf 1b~

se:'~2S ",f>J 'C; de~CT'1ir'i':: We ,1'''1DLT( ~<

:a:J's ,:: 8"(>(:: '.Inti"" \\':'z:", :"Cj

':::rf'rLi:,,~8r: )e::,siv's LfrHe; !~z:m ;::€ \;rd '" ' "'"'"
5;,;;)COI;';';;; t '\) arnol,/,( ci 'he disCC,Jrt$ :;~c\,;dG"\-: ic
Ie (!:;:>:>;: : ,)( the ;:fisc;>,;n:s

(he fvnd eCri'inis;ra:or to review bili;> ie:
0",,,,,.,, p.,a G8""ici? ha, have sigGed a

-anc 'iciaries 'NhO feGB;ved a F;J0Cing
~c S'..:Cmi: Se:'.<ce Pr';'N'Jer Invoice Form to ottain universal $ervicc

and LprJries it,is Se'Yice P'lc\',cer !r;vo,ce Form inform'S tr,e !In,j Zicm';<stre:;)f
Jin: bm0es anc fer ;:,hi("11he scr.:iCI) seeks UhiV81$ii.i Service i ne
',;'t'; ',;--:0e, Sect'00 254::;1 (",e ,".0 cd ~S3,: as ame"!ded, US C §

rr:ay GisC ce:h,,-::;icsed
your iRS ,ax

the matching comr,v;!e,

0""""'-'''' th~ :,2/Qil/2-" idE"; "caten rUGter aro othe, ;'.r<~;''nc.:;Cn ye,)
'/2"""',8" Ser"c€:, ether f.,def6) acercies cn:Lcr yo"" t,)

may iliS'J ;)iev,j", this tnfcrm"tir;,n te :f'6$-& Bge!1des

-, ('01 c,,: ;::;: u. ,

:",0 'u£;;c,;r; \)::;:it0;~

:;",>,"~~iC' /<' ;)! 1';05
cy >~,C'

\c 'G4.~.J

,.:c: (;,I ,97·: P,:o ;,.. "in 92>579, D'nc'T,bcr 3" iS7," ::; USC, § 552, <we ,~10 F;;p&:"Ncrk,
is ::;, 0 ?5D~ s: S€-C.

1, Service Provider Name !30 eMraeters maxmum:IK ELECTRIC COMPANY

Area Code:50t Phone Number: 37620B14. Contact Telephone Number (14 <:i;;:t5 rt\a;{irnc;r:'1)
Ext.: 172

, Service Provider Identification Number (SPIN) (9 characters ma""",,,! 43007431
Contact Name 130 characte,s SElL\

Contact Fax Number {'to cigi1s rr~ax;r:"urn; Area Code:501 Fax Number: 3761463

Conlact E-Mail Address (1CO:ha'acters maximcmiMSElTZ@IKELECTRICCOM
5, Invoice Number (25 characters r12.X;mwrnj 18294

FCC Form 474 - October 2001

, Total Invoice

. lnvoice Date to SLD (rr,nICGY', l1/18 /20U5

Page 1 of 2

SERVICE PROVlDER Invoice Form

t()nTl.f 7.:.i.!Blnck2.aspx ?pn:vpage:::;block I I III Si2D05



Fcm,147 4 Block I

OuestionlProblem

14.
Discount
Amount
Billed to

SLD
(14.2
digits
max.)

13.
Total

iUndiscountcd)
I Amount for
i Senicc pcrFR"
(14.2 digits max.)

an

12.
Shipping Date

to
Customer or
Last Day of

Work
Performed

(mmddYYn)

11.
Customer

Billed
Date

llllmHH)

10.
Bill

Fre1luency
(e.g.~

:\lnnthly.
Quarterly.
Aunually·.
One-time.

Other!

Form 474 Menu

OTHER

9.
Funding
Request
"umber
, FR,,)

,up to 10
digits)

,from Funding
Comrnitment

Dcdsiofb

1034708

8.
FCC Form

471
A pplicalion

"umber
iup to J(j

digits)
IfWH1 funding
Commitment

371294

Page 2 of 2 FCC Form 474 - Octobe, 2001

i Lmc Client Sen(ce Bureau: 1-888- 203· 8! 00

htlD :i/WW\\ .sl forms, uni versabervl<"c.org/furm174/B j(x'k2 .asp.x?prevpage=block1 I ill snoos

------------------
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Universal Service Administrative Company
Schools & Libraries Division

Administrator's Decision on Invoice Appeal

JUf'''' 2. 2(~lti

\like Seltz
I·I( Electnc Company
P.O Box 2£40
Link Rock. AR 72203

Re: SF!) Invoice Numl.....r:
S1.O Invoice Lin""
Vendor Invoke #:
471 Application 0lamtk'f:
Fanding Requc'l Number; s):
Correspondence D;He<:I'

614810
2207263
18294

1294
W34708, lU34630. 1034883
JnUllary 30. 2()06

/\11t,,:r t!1on)ugh rcviev.: and inV6tigatioll of an relevant fxts, th¢ Universul ServK:e
AdIml1isrTat!vc Company (USAC) I1;L, 11l.1de its dedsion i.n regard to your 'ljlpeal. This letter
"'x plains the basis ofUSAC'S decision. "ll1e date of lhis k'l.ter begins the 60··day rime period
Cor appealing this decision to th,' Federal Communieati<)fls ConunIssloll (FCC). If your leiter
of appeal lndllded more than one SLD Invoke NUJ1lber. please note rhat for each Invoice for
\vhkh an ;'lPI~ll is submittcd 1 ;) sepm:arc l~tter b: sent.

Funding ReqllCsr NllrnbenSl:
Deci'ion Oil Appeal:
Expbnation:

lO34708
Denii1d in fun

I

You are appealing Sill'" decision to re:l,,"~IIJ1voice614810 het,ause the billed dale was
outside of the funding year. Y()u :State that L~e ,'ootrnct exph'utioll date h~td heen extended to
JUlle 30. 2006 VIa a Fonn sm. You say tb!l you did not receive any information tha! the
customer had not extended other dares th~t were required.

For FRN 1034708. the service end dare is September 30,2005. Therefore, the period fur
whicb discounts ('Ulwntly ,1ppiy Is July 1.2003 to September )0, 2005.

:)()t~:,h l;:fterwn Rc;;.c, PO Bm; l,f02. \VbpPLnY, New J~r~ey 0:98!
ViSit U5 <~nlin.: m: S1<rtl/.l.1SiilC.O!£}''S1

In the Matter ofI-K Elet:tric
Company Request for Waiver

Exhibit 9
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Intornmtton that .\Cfvices \vert: ddivered oUL~tde of this period. You did
!l(,: dl,.'mDl1:,;tmtc oth('f\\I;-;c 111 your Consequently, SLD your appeal bt'X~ause

:he~t: sel"\l·ce:s \veee niH delivered \vithin the ~.;;ervicl~ ddivcrypc-riod lmdcr programmies.

1034630 and 1034383
Dismissed

I

lr\'(ll(~e 61 ~g 11) does 1](\t :lppl:, tn FRKs 11}34630 >ll:u 1034883. ThcF,.;'t<wc. the dppeJJ [tJf

thc.\l." FR!\s j$ di;',lnls~C(L

It you thi:fc[S II (ur futth;,;'f \!XUmiflJlion of your appllcat!()n~ you may file an
\Vjll'; llle Fedentl C\wl1mUnk:ltioll'S Commission "FCCL You ~hould refer to CC

t)iICk..'t N.J. 02-6 ()O the p;tge of your appealLO the FCC, '{our appeal muq he
:\>;.:~C.! v¢d (Jf j)(]srmarked t'tvlthin 60 day); of the above date on this Jetter. E\iJure to meet
fhi,S \vill result in ~Hl(otH~![k dismissal of your appeul. If you arc submitting
your ilppeat vi:! United Sl31('$ Po:'.tal Service, send to: FCC. Offic{' of th~ Secretary. 445
i Srret"i S\V, DC Funher inf()rrnatifm Jnd option;:, for filing an

directly \\ ith tht FCC C:ln be !\)UJ1d in the'! App-t~als Procedure" posted in the
\n~"a ()f the ;md Librarh~,:'. weh -sile Or by (ont~lcting lhe CIJent

S('T\K'l' Bureau \Vt ' n:"..'ODlmend that you USc the dcctronk filing options,

~(ht\nh and L:J,LUics Di\'hlon
1~'nivers<11 S,~rvict" Administrative Company

TIll1 V"nl
Gre;)l Riter:- Edtlcatl(m C,)cDt:rCttt"c
('';:In:;j'lls

Hdcna, :\1:.t 72342

i',( ,;;;,dhk(;~': :',n R«:'1. PO, flA)\ ;~)2, \Vbiplxmy. Nt"N J<::l\<;<> ir7\j~ I
\';,j\ '\/nhx: <1t A''l/t.'dys;:u:.or.;isi

---------~"-_.
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clayfendley

From: Scott Korenblat [scottk@IKELECTRIC.com]

Sent: Thursday, July 20, 20066:55 PM

To: clayfendley@comcast.net

SUbject: FW Followup on 371294 invoicing issue, [Waiver Request needed]

From: Scott Korenblat
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2006 3:30 PM
To: 'Walter Ebel'; Bryan Duke
Subject: FW: Followup on 371294 invoicing issue, [Waiver Request needed]

Email string with an ombudsman at USAC ",his response received today.

From: Paul Stankus [mailto:pstankus@usac.org]
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 20062:46 PM
To: Scott Korenblat
Cc: Robert Spiller; John Noran; Mike Seitz; Guy Spann; Becky Rains
Subject: RE: Followup on 371294 invoicing issue, [Waiver Request needed]

Mr. Korenblat,

I am sorry if there have been any misunderstandings in your conversations with me or with the client service bureau, but as
the administrator of the program, we are constrained by formal FCC rules involving extensions to service delivery deadlines.
We are allowed some fiexibility in administering the program, but not in this area. The deadlines and the procedures for
requesting extensions are highlighted on our website, and we try to reiterate the importance of adhering to these deadlines in
all our correspondence.

As I mentioned in my most recent Email response, the appropriate remedy is to file a request for a waiver with the FCC as
soon as possible and be sure to include any extenuation circumstances that contributed to your missing the deadline.

Paul Stankus

From: Scott Korenblat [mailto:scottk@IKELECTRIC.com]
Sent: Tuesday, July 18, 2006 11:47 AM
To: Paul Stankus
Cc: Robert Spiller; John Noran; Mike Seitz; Guy Spann; Becky Rains
Subject: RE: Followup on 371294 invoicing issue, [Waiver Request needed]

Dear Paul.

Unfortunately for IK Electric, apparently all of your efforts and continued communication over the past three
months in order to assist us related to our invoice rejection have failed. If this problem was as you state below, I am
confused as to why you and Mr. Noran have repeatedly indicated that your office could possibly assist us in the first
place, please reference all of our past correspondence.

During our scheduled conference call on July I i h 2006, you informed me of the following:

In the Matter ofl-K Electric
Company Request for Waiver

7/2512006 Exhibit 10
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John Noran (ST. manager customer service USAC) was unable to assist IK although he has tried to do so.

The USAC website has been modified to include a tool for communicating obscure deadlines. This tool was
not available when the applicant (Great River Coop) over looked the requirement to request a service
delivery deadline extension resulting in our invoice rejection

You researched and found case numbers where the USAC Client Services Bureau informed IK (Mike Seitz)
that all was in order for IK to proceed although the service delivery date had expired thus completely
misinforming IK leading to our invoice rejection.

You are aware of the fact that there is no way for the service provider to know that the service delivery date
had expired.

You are working through your office in "trying to get our executive leadership at USAC to understand" all
of the above.

You also said in this conversation that you would provide me with other appeal and waiver information from
similar cases based on the same problems that exist at USAC in order to assist IK with our forthcoming appeal and
waiver request.

Please contact me if this is not an accurate account of our conversation.

Thank you,

Scott Korenblat
President
IK Electric
501-912-4888
scottk@ikelectric.com
www.ikelectric.com

From: Paul Stankus [mailto:pstankus@usac.org]
sent: Thursday, July 13, 20068:59 AM
To: Scott Korenblat
Cc: Robert Spiller; John Noran
Subject: Followup on 371294 invoicing issue, [Waiver Request needed]

Dear Mr. Kornblatt,

Thank you for participating in the conference call yesterday regarding the invoicing problem with IK Electric yesterday. As we
discussed, application 371294, FRNs 1034708 and 1034883 have been denied payment for "customer billed date outside of
funding year." In researching the issue, I uncovered the guidance from the FCC that specifies Service Delivery Extension
Requests - FCC 01-195-- http://www. universalservice.org/_res/documents/aboul/pdf/fcc-orders/2001-fcc-orders/FCC,01,
195.pdf.

Here is the relevant text regarding Service Delivery Extension Requests that led to your denial:

15. Similar to the requirements outlined in the November 2000 Extension Order,
applicants who wish to sati.~tY criteria (3) should submit documentation to the Administrator
requesting reliefon these grounds on or before the original non-recurring services deadline./8

7/25/2006
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The revised deadline will be calculated based on the date ofthe Administrator's decision relating
to the explanation. For example, ifan entity is awarded discounts for internal connections in
Funding Year 4, and installation is delayed due to circumstances beyond its control, it will need
to file with the Administrator an explanation and evidence ofthe delay on or before September
30, 2002. lfthe Administrator grants an extension before March l, 2003, they will have until
September 30, 2003 to complete installation.

Because the applicant's Service Delivery Extension Request was received on Feb 2, 2006 (after the FCC deadline of
September 30, 2005), the request was denied. As administrators of the program, we have no flexibility to extend the
deadlines that were imposed by FCC Orders. Oniy the FCC can waive their own rules.

In order to get this deadline extended, you will need to send a waiver request to the FCC, requesting a waiver of the rule
(above) for Service Delivery Extension Requests.

I apologize for any misunderstandings you may have experienced in dealing with the Universal Service Fund.

Paul Stankus

***********************************************

Paul Stankus
Asst. Manager of Customer Service
USAC
2000 L St. NW, Suite 200
Washington, DC 20036
Phone: (202) 776-0200 x1618
Fax (202)776-0080
email: pstankus@universalservice.org
*****************************************************

7/25/2006
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