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July 29, 2009

EX PARTE

Ms. Marlene H. Dortch
Secretary
Federal Communications Commission
445 12th Street, SW
Washington, DC 20554

Re: Petition ofTelcordia Technologies, Inc. to Reform or Strike Amendment 70, to
Institute Competitive Bidding for Number Portability Administration, and To End
the NAPM LLC's Interim Role in Number Portability Administration Contract
Management; Renewed Request for Interim Standstill Order; and Request that
NANC Resolve Dispute Concerning Necessity of Adding Certain URI Codes for
the Completion of Telephone Calls, WCB Docket No. 07-149; Request/or a
Standstill Order

Dear Ms. Dortch:

On July 28,2009, on behalf of Telcordia Technologies, Inc. ("Telcordia"), Linda
Coffin and I met with Priya Aiyar, Legal Advisor to Chairman Genachowski, to discuss
Telcordia's request for a standstill order to halt the implementation ofAmendment 72 to
the contract between NeuStar, Inc. ("NeuStar") and the North American Portability
Management, LLC ("NAPM"), to the extent that it implements Change Orders NANC
429,430 and 435, pending the completion of the NANC's dispute resolution process with
respect to a dispute filed by Telcordia challenging the lawfulness of those Change Orders.

As summarized more fully in the attached materials, we described Telcordia's
repeated attempts to enter the market as an NPAC database services provider, which was
frustrated time and time again by secret, no-bid extensions and modifications to the
contract between the NAPM and NeuStar, resulting in a de facto exclusive contract until
2016.' We explained that these contract extensions and modifications violate federal law
because they were undertaken by a private entity, without any FCC review or approval.

See Presentation at the FCC: FCC Must Act to Reassert Its Oversight and Control ofInherentIy
Governmental Decisions, Reopen Competition in NPAC Services, and Preserve Competition in ENUM
Services (July 28, 2009)(attached).
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We discussed the exigency of the renewed standstill request that Telcordia filed
with the Wireline Competition Bureau (the "Bureau") on May 22, 2009. Not only does
the implementation of the three disputed change orders violate the FCC's rules regarding
the NPAC database because the infonnation is not "necessary to route telephone calls to
the appropriate telecommunications carrier" and because NANC has not detennined that
this specific infonnation is "necessary," 47 C.F.R. § 52.25(f),2 but ifNeuStar were
allowed to include these URI fields for IP-IP VoIP, SMS (text messaging) and MMS
(picture messaging) in the NPAC database, it could use its NPAC monopoly to cross­
subsidize entry into the ENUM services market - at a time when all other database
providers are locked out of entering the NPAC market by the tenns of the NAPM­
NeuStar agreement.

Telcordia's standstill request satisfies each of the Virginia Petroleum Jobbers3

factors, as set forth in more detail in our attached letter of June 24, 2009:

• Likelihood of success on the merits. Telcordia has demonstrated an
overwhelming likelihood of success on prevailing in its claim that implementation
of additional URI fields into the NPAC database without regulatory approval
violates Commission rules and must be stopped. Rule 52.25(f) requires a NANC
necessity finding and no such finding has been made, nor have the proponents of
inclusion of these fields supported such a finding.

• The threat of irreparable harm absent the grant of preliminary relief is real.
Implementation of additional URI fields imposes costs on third parties that cannot
be recovered. Further, competitive ENUM service providers such as Telcordia
will suffer loss of business, a recognized irreparable hann, especially because
Telcordia cannot bring an FCC complaint against NeuStar (a non-common
carrier) to recover damages for violation of Rule 52.25(f), nor would it be able to
do so in court unless the court were to recognize a private right of action or tort
against a non-common carrier in this context.

• There is no showing of injury to other parties if relief is granted. Ordering a
standstill of implementation of additional URI fields will not significantly hann
third parties, other than a possible delay to NeuStar in rolling out its competing
services based on these fields.

• The issuance of the order will further the public interest. Administration of
the NPAC database is conducted within a regulatory framework under the
ultimate jurisdiction of the Commission. NAPM and NeuStar have circumvented
established regulatory oversight and restrictions by making alterations to the
NPAC without prior approval. The NANC is now conducting its dispute

47 C.F.R. § 52.25 (excerpts attached).
Virginia Petroleum Jobbers Association, Petitioner, v. Federal Power Commission, Respondent,

Blue Ridge Gas Company, Intervenor, 105 U.S. App. D.C. 172 (1959).
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resolution investigation into the facts surrounding this dispute. Issuing a standstill
order will allow NANC to complete the dispute resolution process and make a
determination before the change to the NPAC becomes a/ait accompli.4

Although Telcordia meets all four prongs, under the Commission's precedent, the
Commission balances and weighs each of these factors and does not need to find
satisfaction of each prong to issue a standstill order. The Commission has found "no due
process requirement that any single factor, such as irreparable inj~ to the moving party,
be demonstrated as a prerequisite to issuance of a standstill order."

We reiterated our request that the standstill order be issued immediately so that
the pre-Amendment 72 status quo will not be altered during the pendency of the currently
ongoing NANC dispute resolution proceeding and while NANC provides a report to the
Chief of the Wireline Competition Bureau, and to allow the Bureau 90 days to consider
that report pursuant to 47 C.F.R. § 52.26(b)(3).

Sincere~,,~~~

g!~
Counsel to Telcordia Technologies, Inc.

cc: Priya Aiyar
Jennifer Schneider
Nicholas Alexander
Julie Veach
Ann Stevens
Marilyn Jones
Melissa Kirkel
Thomas Koutsky

See Letter from John T. Nakahata, Counsel to Telcordia Technologies, Inc., to Ms. Marlene H.
Dortch, Secretary, Federal Communications Commission (June 24, 2009)(attached).
5 AT&T Corp. v. Ameritech Corp., 13 FCC Red 14508,14516 n.43 (1998).
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Oversight of Number Portability in the USA
(The Cast)

Number Portability 
Administration Center 
Contractor (NeuStar)

Service providers and other users such as service bureaus sign user agreements

North American Numbering Council 
(Oversight of number portability 

administration, including NAPM LLC)

Federal Communications Commission
(Overall jurisdiction over numbering)

North American Portability Management (NAPM) –
(Signs and manages Master Agreement with NPAC; 

Contractor Members: ATT, Verizon, Qwest, T-Mobile, 
Embarq, Sprint, Comcast, XO)
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NeuStar and NAPM LLC – A Series of Secret 
No-Bid Deals That Lock In NeuStar’s Monopoly

Original (and ONLY) competitively bid contracts – Term 
1997-2002.

First no-bid extension (12/2000) – Term extended to 
2006, with option for 2007.

Second no-bid extension (10/2003) – Term extended to 
2011.

Third no-bid extension (Amendment 57, 9/2006) – Term 
extended to 2015; competitive bidding forbidden before 
2012 with penalty clauses.

Fourth no-bid modification (Amendment 70, 1/2009) –
Competition blocked to 2016.

3

•

I the elements of success I

"Telcordia.



Telcordia’s 2009 Requests Before FCC, WCB 
and NANC

Amendment 70 Petition
Begin competitive bidding for new NPAC contract.
Leave Amendment 70 prices in place during bidding 
and implementation transition.
Terminate existing contract when new contract is 
implemented.

NANC Dispute on Whether URIs Can Be 
Implemented Without a NANC or FCC Finding 
that they are “Necessary to Route Telephone 
Calls” under 47 C.F.R. 52.25(f).
Request that WCB Issue a Standstill Order 
Pending NANC Dispute Resolution

4
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Amendment 70 is Anti-Competitive and 
Attempts To Frustrate FCC Oversight.
NAPM and NeuStar eliminate all possibility of competitive 
NPAC services until 2016 (extended from 2012) – done in 
secret, without FCC approval.

Industry and consumers are overcharged by ~$550 million thru 2015
NAPM is exercising the FCC’s inherently governmental authority over 
when to extend contracts or conduct bids.
Failure to bid violates Presidential directive and Competition in 
Contracting Act.

NAPM improperly exceeds its authority by permitting NeuStar to 
transform the NPAC into an ENUM provisioning database –
enabling NeuStar to extend its monopoly from NPAC to ENUM 
by 2016 without FCC approval.
With an “all-or-nothing” inseverability clause, NAPM and 
NeuStar deliberately frustrate FCC oversight and consideration 
of policy issues.

5
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NPAC Contracts Foreclose Competition to 2016 
– Making Non-Exclusivity a Sham.
Amendment 57 (2006) blocked competition in NPAC services 
before 2012 by creating a $30+ million penalty for issuing an 
RFI or RFP, or selecting an additional NPAC vendor.
Amendment 70 (2009) removed penalty but blocks competition 
by making it uneconomic to select an additional NPAC 
vendor(s).

NeuStar loses no revenue for one year after competitive entry, no matter 
how much market share it loses in the first year.
NeuStar may never lose any revenue.  Even at significant (e.g. 30%) loss of 
market share, NeuStar loses no revenue.*
Even losing 50% market share, NeuStar gets 92% of the revenue it would 
have received for handling 100% of the market.*
At 70% market share loss, NeuStar still gets 82% of the revenue it would 
have received for handling 100% of the market.* 
If transactions grow faster, the picture is even worse.

6

*   For 2011-2015, assuming 16% annual transaction growth, and competitive entry in 2011 immediately at the stated percentage.  
Does not include 2016 credits.
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Amendment 70:  At 50% Market Share Loss, NeuStar Keeps 92% 
of Revenues – 2011-2015; at 30% Market Loss, it Keeps 100%•

NeuStar revenues at 70% v. 100% market share
(Assumes projected 16% tronsaction growth rate)

I the elements of success I

NeuStar revenues at 50% v. 100% market share
(Assumes projected 16% transaction growth rate)
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Another View – At 50% Market Share, Competitor’s 
Effective Per Transaction Price Must Be Over 5x Lower 
than NeuStar’s (and Free for the First Year)

8

•

Comparative NPAC Effective Transaction Rates
NeuStar =50% Transaction Share

Annual Transaction Growth =16%
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A Bad Contract Gets Even Worse – Amendment 
70 Extends the NPAC Monopoly to ENUM. 
Background:

ENUM – A competitive, multi-vendor market today.
ENUM associates a telephone number with Uniform 
Resource Locators (URIs) associated with IP gateways for 
customer services/devices.
ENUM is not a number portability administration service, but 
today uses NPAC as an input; however, in an all IP-IP 
universe, use of NPAC may no longer be needed.
Tier 0/1 ENUM Clearinghouse Providers enable IP-IP traffic 
exchange between service providers.
For Tier 0/1 ENUM Clearinghouses, key asset is database of 
TNs and associated URIs.
ENUM providers charge their customers.

9
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Amendment 70 Harms ENUM Competition.

NeuStar CEO: “What [Amendment 70] does is takes an existing 
platform that all networks are currently physically interfacing with, they’re 
currently depending upon it for routing virtually all telephone calls and it 
puts into that database the first three simple IP data points that are 
necessary for the first simple IP applications that networks are going to 
provide.” (1/28/09 Investor Call)

Amendment 70 cross-subsidizes the creation of an ENUM 
provisioning database by using the NPAC contract to create financial 
incentives (up to $22.5M) for the industry to issue the change orders and 
to actually use the URIs by 2011.  

URIs populated and modified under Amendment 70 are paid by 
industry as a whole, not by customer, creating another cross-subsidy.

No other vendor can integrate NPAC and ENUM before 2016 due to 
Amendment 70’s competitive lock-out.

High costs for others to create database means NeuStar can recoup 
monopoly profits after it drives other ENUM vendors from market.

10
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FCC Rules Do Not Permit NAPM to Add URIs 
to the NPAC (NANC Dispute)

47 C.F.R. 52.25(f) prohibits addition to NPAC of data not 
“necessary to route calls to the appropriate telecommunications 
carriers.” “The NANC shall determine what specific information is 
necessary.”
NANC has never found URIs to be “necessary to route calls to the 
appropriate telecommunications carriers. “

NANC considered in 2005 and failed to reach consensus.
As stated in the NANC 400 Report, “At the April 14, 2005 joint meeting of the 
Future of Numbering and LNPA Working Groups there was agreement of all 
parties that placement of Internet URIs (Universal Resource Identifiers) in the 
NPAC (Number Portability Administration Center) was not necessary to support 
PSTN (Public Switched Telephone Network) call completion.”

Neither NAPM nor the LNPA Working Group are NANC, and thus 
cannot add URIs to the NPAC without NANC finding the fields to be 
necessary.  NANC operates pursuant to FACA – NAPM does not.
No entity other than the FCC can authorize adding fields to the 
NPAC that are not “necessary to route calls to the appropriate 
telecommunications carriers.” NANC cannot make policy.

11
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Telcordia Standstill Request Pending NANC 
Dispute Resolution Process

NeuStar and NAPM are rushing to implement the URI 
fields before NANC and the FCC can consider the legality 
of including those fields in NPAC – creating a fait 
accompli.
Telcordia likely to prevail on the merits.
Third parties including Telcordia will incur costs if their 
customers request use of the URI fields – which will be 
irreparable once sunk.  Also, lost business due to an 
unlawful arrangement is irreparable harm.
No demonstrated harm to NeuStar or NAPM if relief is 
granted.
Public interest served by preventing monopoly extension 
into competitive markets.

12
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What the FCC Needs to Do
Prevent Further Harm.

Grant Standstill Order halting implementation of URI change 
orders pending resolution of NANC dispute (current target 
October NANC meeting).
Direct NAPM not to execute further amendments without prior 
NANC and FCC (or Bureau) review and approval.

Reestablish Competition in NPAC Services at the Best 
Possible Price for Consumers.

Declare current contracts, unjust, unreasonable, contrary to 
public interest, and thus void after transition.
Immediately begin a competitive procurement for multivendor 
NPAC to replace the current contracts.
During bidding and transition use Amendment 70 to set NeuStar 
compensation.

Reestablish Governmental Oversight.
End the NAPM LLC’s management of the NPAC contracts.
FCC makes final decision on all contract amendments.13
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ADDITIONAL BACKGROUND
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How Does Market Foreclosure Occur?

Key is how the “Floor” trigger for volume-
related reductions works.

No adjustments for one year after market share 
loss occurs.
No volume-related adjustments unless the Floor is 
breached.
Adjustments are taken from ever-increasing fixed 
price.
The Floor increases at 6.5% per year (parallel to 
fixed price increases);  thus, if transactions grow 
faster than 6.5%, NeuStar must lose an even 
greater market share before losing any revenue.

15
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No volume adjustments
(red exceeds green)

Competition Begins 2011
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Competition begins 2011

Volume adjustments begin
in 2012, but decrease every year
(red drops below green, 
but lines then converge)
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Slower Transaction Growth Does Not Negate 
Market Foreclosure; Faster Growth Enhances It
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Effect of Transaction Growth Rates on NeuStar Revenue Protection
2011-2015 - Constant 50% Market Share
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ENUM and the NPAC Chronology
2005

July – NANC sends report of no consensus on NANC 400 adding URI data in NPAC to FCC 
based on NANC Future of Numbering Working Group (FoN) Report.
Nov – CableLabs issues RFI for VoIP Peering, reporting that over 30 companies responded.

2007
Nov – CC1 ENUM LLC issues RFP for provider ENUM.

2008
Feb – FCC permits the industry to reconsider NANC 400 in light of the FCC 08-188 Order on 
Number Portability (VoIP and Porting Fields Order).
May – LNPA Splits NANC 400 into 4 change orders change orders one per URI (NANC 429-
432) and includes in SP prioritization of next release; two of the are “above the line” in initial 
prioritization.  Meeting of prioritization new Change Order 435 adding SMS added and included
July – Three of the URI change orders are included on the Recommended List for a next NPAC 
Release to NAPM; neither NANC nor FoN consensus has been sought with regard to adding 
URI data to NPAC per the original report.
Sept – Amendment 62 expands definition of “calls” to include video, music, pictures and text.

2009
Jan – NeuStar and NAPM LLC sign Amendment 70 with discounts for inclusion of URI Data in 
NPAC.
Feb – VeriSign issues press release announcing PacketCable certification of ENUM Server 
Provisioning Protocol for cable providers
Feb – Telcordia issues press release announcing award of CC1 ENUM LLC Service Provider 
ENUM registry to Telcordia

19
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Chronology of Events Including Telcordia –
NAPM LLC Activity

2005
Telcordia (and other competitor) submit unsolicited NPAC proposal presentations

2006
NAPM and NeuStar sign Amendment 57.

2008
Mar - Telcordia presents unsolicited Regional proposal with discounted pricing.
July - Telcordia submits unsolicited Regional and Multi-Peering proposals.
Aug – NAPM asks 28 questions regarding Peering proposal.
Sep - Telcordia presents Peering responses and industry ROI information.
Sep – NeuStar advises NAPM that it “wanted to discuss a restructuring of pricing 
terms in the Master Agreements”
Nov  20 – NAPM informs Telcordia that it will not consider a regional model because 
it “will not provide Users with a sufficient level of vendor choice that the Members  of 
the NAPM LLC believe will best serve and benefit consumers . . . .” NAPM says “The 
Multi-Peering Administrator Model deserves and warrants further consideration.”
NAPM requests Telcordia initiate “appropriate industry-wide subject matter expert 
consideration, review and buy-off” on a peering NPAC.

2009
Jan 8 – LNPA WG meets to consider multipeering NPAC architecture.
Jan 28 – NAPM adopts Amendment 70 and notifies NANC and the FCC.
July __ – NAPM reports to NANC that it has approved SOW 72, Implementation of 

20
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 47 CFR § 52.25 Database architecture and administration.  
 
 

(f) The information contained in the regional databases shall be limited to the in-
formation necessary to route telephone calls to the appropriate telecommunications 
carriers. The NANC shall determine what specific information is necessary. 

 
 
 
 
(i) Individual carriers may download information necessary to provide number 

portability from the regional databases into their own downstream databases. Individ-
ual carriers may mix information needed to provide other services or functions with 
the information downloaded from the regional databases at their own downstream da-
tabases. Carriers may not withhold any information necessary to provide number 
portability from the regional databases on the grounds that such data has been com-
bined with other information in its downstream database. 
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June 24, 2009

Ms. Marlene H. Dortch
Secretary
Federal Communications Commission
445 12th Street, SW
Washington, DC 20554

Re: Petition of Telcordia Technologies, Inc. to Reform or Strike Amendment 70, to
Institute Competitive Bidding for Number Portability Administration, and To End
the NAPM LLC's Interim Role in Number Portability Administration Contract
Management; Renewed Request for Interim Standstill Order; and Request that
NANC Resolve Dispute Concerning Necessity of Adding Certain URI Codes for
the Completion of Telephone Calls, WCB Docket No. 07-149

Dear Ms. Dortch:

Telcordia Technologies, Inc. (Telcordia") hereby responds to the ex parte filed by the
North American Portability Management LLC ("NAPM LLC") on June 18,2009. For all its
bluster, NAPM's ex parte confirms that Te1cordia has met the criteria for a standstill order with
respect to the continued implementation of three Uniform Resource Identifier ("URI") fields
during the pendency of a fonnal dispute Telcordia filed with the North American Numbering
Council on May 26, 2009. Furthermore. NAPM's extraordinary request that the Commission not
even take conunent on Telcordia's petition with respect to the legality of Amendment 70 should
be wholly disregarded. IfNAPM cannot withstand oversight, it should no longer be a key FCC
contractor.

Request for a Standstill Order on Change Orders 429, 430 and 435

Telcordia's request for a standstill order is simple. As set forth in that request, Telcordia
has filed a formal dispute with the NANC alleging that NAPM's Amendment 72, to the extent it
implements Change Orders 429,430 and 435, violates the FCC's rules by including
impermissible data in the NPAC database. The FCC's rule, 47 C.F.R. 52.25(1), states: "The
information contained in the regional databases shall be limited to the information necessary to
route telephone calls to the appropriate telecommunications carriers. The NANC shall determine
what specific information is necessary." No such fmding has been made by the NANC.
Telcordia therefore asks that the Commission issue a standstill order so that this information is

1200 18TH STREET. NW I SUITE 1200 I WASHINGTON. DC 20036 I TEl20n30·1300 I FAX 20H30-1301 I WllTSHIREGRANNIS.COM
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not included in the database and third parties are not required to expend funds to modify systems
to use this data until after its legality has been detennined. Telcordia has satisfied each of the
Virginia Petroleum Jobbers Assoc v. Federal Power Comm. factors (likelihood of success on the
merits, the threat of irreparable harm absent the grant of preliminary relief, the degree of injury
to other parties if relief is granted, and the issuance of the order will further the public interest),
although it is not necessary to satisfy each prong in order for a standstill order to be granted.

NeuStar and NAPM both ignore the Commission's precedent as to how it applies the
Virginia Petroleum Jobbers factors. As the Commission has said, "no single factor is necessarily
dispositive. For example, a compelling demonstration that the public interest would be
irreparably harmed lessens the level of certainty required of a moving party to show that it will
prevail on the merits."1 "A balancing of these interests then will be conducted in order to fashion
an administrative response on a case.btcase basis; moreover, there is no requirement that there
be a showing as to each single factor." "If there is a particularly overwhelming showing in at
least one of the factors," the Commission may find that relief"is warranted notwithstanding the
absence of another one of the factors.")

The Commission's decision granting a standstill order in the AmeritechlQwest Teaming
Standstill Order is particularly instructive. In that case, the Commission issued a standstill order
against a Bell Company's teaming arrangement with an unaffiliated long distance carrier because
the petitions "could cause significant changes to the competitive landscape in the local exchange
and long markets and because we fmd the petitions raise serious questions regarding whether the
agreement violates the Act" such that "these issues must be addressed before any lasting effects
resulting from this agreement take place in these markets.,,4 As the Commission noted in that
case, "a standstill order is warranted where the circwnstances are such that it would be
impracticable to 'withdraw service, once established, because of its disruptive effect. illS

Likelihood of success on the merits. As set out above, the FCC rule is very clear:
infonnation cannot be included in the NPAC unless it is "necessary to route telephone calls to
the appropriate telecommunications carriers." All other information can go into downstream

I AT&T Corp. v. Ameritech Corp., 13 FCC Red 14508, 14515-14515114 (1998)
rAmeritechlQwest Teaming Standstill Order").

Biennial RegulatoryReview-Amendment ofParts 0, U3, 22,24,26,27,80,87,90,95,97,
and 101 ofthe Commission's Rules to Facilitate the Development and Use ofthe Universal
Licensing System in the Wireless Telecommunications Services Amendment ofthe Amateur
Service Rules to Authorize Visiting Foreign Amateur Operators to Operate Stations in the United
States, Memorandum Opinion and Order, 14 FCC Red 9305, 9307' 4 (1999).
) Id.; see a/so Revision ofthe Commission's Rules to Ensure Compatibility with Enhanced 911
Emergency Calling Systems; Non-Initialized Phones, 17 FCC Red 19012, 1901519 (Wireless
Telecomm. Bureau 2002)(applying these standards on delegated authority and granting a sray).
4 Ameritech/Qwest Teaming Standstill Order, 13 FCC Red at 145171 15.
sId. at 14520' 25, quoting Midwest Television, Inc. (KFMB-TV), San Diego, Ca., Petitioner for
Immediate Temporary andfor Permanent ReliefAgainst Extensions ofService ofCATV Systems,
Memorandum Opinion and Order, 4 F.C.C. 2d 612, 621' 17 (1966).
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databases, but may not be placed in the NPAC. 47 C.F.R. § 52.25(f),(i). The rule also specifies
how information shall be determined to be necessary: NANC - and not NAPM or the Local
Number Portability Administration Working Group (LNPA WO) - must find the information to
be "necessary." Neither NANC nor the FCC has ever made such a determination - a fact that
neither NeuStar nor the NAPM disputes.

Knowing that the NANC has never found the three URI fields - for lP-IP VolP, picture
messaging and text messaging -- to be "necessary to route telephone calls to the appropriate
telecommunications carrier," NAPM attempts to tum the rule on its head. NAPM argues that it
is permitted to add these fields to the NPAC so long as there is "no consensus and agreement
among subject matter experts that Change Order 400 was beyond the scope of pennissible LNP
enhancements.'.6 But that is not the test or process specified by Rule 52.25(f) - which requires
that the infonnation be fOWld by the NANC to be "necessary."

Moreover, neither NAPM nor NeuStar in their recent ex partes actually claim that the
URI fields in Change Orders 429, 430 and 435 are "necessary to route telephone calls to the
appropriate telecommunications carriers" - notwithstanding that this is the basis of both
Telcordia's standstill request and its dispute filed with the NANC. NAPM asserts that the 2005
Future of Numbering Working Group (FaN WG) repert "detailed under the headings 'Pro
NANC 400 Conclusions' and 'Pro Recommendations' the several bases and authority for
concluding that Change Order 400 was within the scope of LNP," but it actually provides no
citations or references to actual discussion within that report. In fact, nowhere in Sections
4.2.1.2, 4.2.1.3, 4.2.1.9 and 4.2.1.10 of that repert (presumably the sections to which NAPM is
referring) is the Rule 52.25(f) necessity standard even discussed or cited. The proponents of
Change Order 400 never expressly asserted that these URI fields were "necessary to route
telephone calls to the appropriate telecomrnWlications carrier" - even though the opponents of
Change Order 400 clearly stated this objection.7 In fact, these proponent sections of the FON
WG Report appear to be carefully worded to avoid expressly making such a claim. In its most
recent ex parte, NAPM provides no examples of services for which number porting cannot occw

6 Ex Parte Letter from Dan A. Sciullo, Berenbawn Weinshienk, PC, to Marlene H. Dortch,
Secretary, Federal Communications Commission, WCB Docket No. 07-149 at 4 (JWle 18,
2009)("NAPM Ex Parte")(emphasis omitted).
7 FON WG Report at 25 ("No additional information beyond that currently in the NPAC is
needed to complete telephone calls to ported numbers through the PSTN. At the April 14, 2005
joint meeting of the Futwe of Numbering and LNPA Working Groups there was agreement of all
parties that placement of Internet URIs (Universal Resource Identifiers) in the NPAC (Number
Portability Administration Center) was not necessary to support PSTN (public Switched
Telephone Network) call completion and that changes to PSlN elements (switches, Service
Control Points, and Signal Transfer Points) were not contemplated. Instead, the proposal to add
URIs to the NPAC is to support diverse IP-enabled services beyond call completion, including
MultiMedia Messaging (MMS, e.g., exchange of camera phone pictures via email), Push-to-Talk
(PIT, using VoIP), Presence (as in Instant Messaging "buddy lists"), and VolP interconnection
(Le. completing calls using lP-based networks without traversing the PSTN.)")(emphasis added).
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without these URI fields or services that are "broken" by nwnber porting without these fields. 8

NAPM merely speculates that some services "may become 'broken' by porting.,,9

Thus, Telcordia has not just demonstrated a likelihood of success or that there are
"serious questions" regarding the lawfulness of Change Orders 429, 430 and 435,10 but it has
demonstrated an overwhelming likelihond of success. Rule 52.25(1) requires a NANC
"necessity" finding and no such finding has been made. Moreover, neither NAPM nor NeuStar
has even asserted that these data fields are "necessary to route telephone calls to the appropriate
telecormmmications carriers."

The tbreat of irreparable harm absent the grant of preliminary relief is real. Like
NeuStar, NAPM asserts that Telcordia will not be harmed by implementation of the URl fields
because, it asserts, these parameters can simply be purged if the FCC declares them to be
unlawful. I I However, as explained in Telcordia's standstill request, this argument ignores the
costs that third parties, including Telcordia, will have to incur. This harm is certain to occur in
the event of demand. If a customer wants to use the URI fields, local system vendors like
Telcordia will have to modify its portion of the local systems infrastructure used by carriers in
order to accommodate the use of these unlawful fields. That will hann those vendors, including
Telcordia to the extent they cannot recover these costs from its customers, and it will certainly
harm their customers. Once incurred, these costs are sunk and cannot be reversed. Moreover,
these costs are not recoverable under Article 9 of Amendment 72.

Furthermore, to the extent that NeuStar uses these unlawful data fields to gain business
that would otherwise have gone to Telcordia, or other competitive ENUM services providers,
that lost business is also irreparable harm, as the Commission recognized in the AmeritechlQwest
Teaming Standstill Order. Telcordia has no way to recover its lost revenue: NeuStar is not a
common carrier from whom Telcordia can recover damages under Section 207 of the
Communications Act. In the AmeritechlQwest Teaming Standstill Order, the Commission
observed, "If we later find the agreement to be unlawful, it will be very difficult to remedy these
losses without serious disruptions in service to the public and, indeed, it is possible that
customers who have mi¥:rated to Ameritech/Qwest pursuant to the agreement will never return to
their previous carriers." 2 The same here is true for Telcordia and other competitive ENUM
services vendors with respect to ENUM services: if customers migrate to NeuStar services based
on these unlawful fields, they may never return to Telcordia. If the fields are found to be
unlawful, the customers will be further harmed by needing to migrate to another provider. This
is threatened irreparable harm.

There is no showing of injury to other parties if relief is granted. Neither NeuStar
nor NAPM present any concrete claim ofhann to third parties if relief is granted. NAPM's

8 NAPM Ex Parte at 5.
9 !d.
10 Ameritech/Qwest Teaming Standstill Order, 13 FCC Red at 14517 ~ 15.
II NAPM Ex Parte at 5.
12 Ameritech/Qwest Teaming Standstill Order, 13 FCC Red at 14521 ~ 27.
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claims of services "broken" by porting are wholly speculative and backed by no evidence ofany
kind. Indeed, neither NAPM nor NeuStar provides any example of a telecommunications service
that is "broken" currently without the availability of the three URI fields. This is telling, and
demonstrates that there is no significant harm to third parties, other than the delay to NeuStar in
rolling out its competing services based on these fields.

In a footnote, NAPM now alleges that granting the standstill order "could needlessly
thwart" the implementation of interconnected VolP number portability. 13 But two of the URI
fields are for picture messaging and text messaging, which have nothing to do with
interconnected YoIP. NAPM also fails to acknowledge that interconnected VolP number porting
is accuning today without the added URI field. In any event, these technical arguments can be
fully considered by the NANC as part of the dispute Te1cordia filed. This does not eliminate the
need for the NANC to make a finding of necessity be/ore these disputed elements can be placed
in the NPAC.

Tbe issuance of tbe order will furtber the public interest. As in the Ameritech-Qwest
Teaming Order the public interest is furthered by the issuance of the standstill order. When the
FCC authorized creating of the NPAC, it set strict limits on the data that could go into the
regional monopoly NPAC databases, and required all other infonnation to be placed in
downstream databases. This limited the reach of the NPAC monopoly, and left all other service
open to competition without potential cross-subsidization. Here, as in the Ameritech~Qwest
Teaming Standstill Order, "it will be virtually im)'ossible to 'lU1Scramble' the effects of the
agreement and return to the current status quO."l As in that case, the balance of the harms
favors Telcordia.

NAPM's lack of hard facts as to the need for the three URI fields demonstrates that it has
the process backwards. Had it not elected to try to circumvent NANC's role, there would have
been another opportunity for all interested parties to discuss and to try to reach consensus
through NANC as to whether the three URI fields are in fact necessary to the routing of
telephone calls to the appropriate telecommunications carrier. The public interest is served by
addressing these questions in the proper order- first the NANC must detennine that a particular
field is necessary to the routing of telephone calls to the appropriate telecommunications carriers,
then - and only then - should parties be required to incur the costs of doing so. The public
interest is best served by insisting that decisions on the necessity of the data - and thus the
permissibility of including the data in the NPAC - precede the investment necessary to
implement use of the data by parties other than NeuStar.

The point of the standstill order is to do just that - to allow the NANC and, if necessary,
the Commission the ability to consider the threshold questions of whether the URI fields should
be a part of the NPAC before third parties are required to spend the money necessary to
implement those fields. NAPM and NeuStar apparently want these database changes to become

13 NAPM Ex Parte at n.5.
14 Ameritech/Qwest Teaming Standstill Order, 13 FCC Red at 14520 ~ 24.
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a/ail accompli before any oversight can have occurred. This is exactly the type of situation that
a standstill order was meant to address especially where, as here, Commission-specified
processes have been ignored. Accordingly, Telcordia's request for a standstill order pending the
completion of the NANC dispute resolution process should be granted.

Consideration of Telcordia's Amendment 70 Petition

Although Telcordia has asked the Commission to seek comment on Telcordia's petition,
NAPM wrongly asswnes that the failure to issue a public notice means that the petition is not
being considered. Under section 1.45 of the Commission's rules, all petitions are subject to a
default comment cycle. The only impact afthe Commission not issuing a public notice is that
NAPM has already missed its opportunity to file a timely response. Nonetheless, Telcordia
supports issuing a public notice seeking additional comment on its petition.

In any event NAPM's lawlessness is not something that the Commission should sweep
under the rug. As Telcordia has documented in its petition, NAPM has exercised the
Commission's inherently governmental authority in extending the NPAC contracts far beyond
their tennination dates without any competitive bids. This conduct violates the Competition in
Contracting Act as well as the President's procurement directives to all agencies, including the
FCC. The fact that a competitive procurement was conducted in 1997 does not excuse no-bid
contract extensions twelve years later - far beyond the scope of the original bid.

It is the FCC's role, not NAPM's or its FoNPAC (Future of the NPAC) Advisory
Committee's role, to decide the future of the NPAC. It may well be that the NPAC should be
limited to its existing functions, with other functions perfonned by other databases. That is for
the FCC to decide after receiving comment from all interested parties.

NAPM asserts that "at all appropriate times it has consulted with the FCC and NANC
seeking guidance and direction." This is a remarkable statement - especially when the NAPM
has repeatedly entered into no-bid contract extensions with NeuStar without prior review and
approval by the FCC or NANC. Certainly NANC was not informed of Amendments 57 and 70
prior to their execution - even though those contracts represented significant changes to the
tenns and conditions of NPAC services. including changes to when competitive bidding would
be pennitted or feasible. And no one at the FCC has ever indicated that they reviewed, approved
or were otherwise consulted with respect to these major contract amendments.

One other point is worth noting. In its ex parte, NAPM cites the inserverability clause in
Statement of Work 25 as evidence that it "reco~es the regulatory authority of the FCC with
respect to all contracting by the NAPM LLC."l But as Telcordia details in its Petition, this
inseverability clause actually serves to discourage compliance with FCC rules because it
provides that the only penalty for an unlawful tenn demanded by the contractor is the
extennination of an entire amendment - including the contractor's concessions. For example, if
the Commission finds any provision of Amendment 70 unlawful, the entire amendment would be

\, NAPM Ex Parle at 3.
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eliminated and all transactions re-priced at higher rates back to January 1,2009. This flouts
meaningful oversight and accountability.

NAPM's conduct - and its consistent agreements to foreclose competition in NPAC
services without any prior review or approval by the FCC - will cost consumers hundreds of
millions of dollars ifnot stopped.. The time has come for the Commission to shine the spotlight
on NAPM's contracts and to see if they can withstand close examination to detennine whether
they are consistent with the public interest. lfthey are not, there is no reason to allow these
contracts to continue.

Sincerely,

l:.fU/r
J T. Nakahata

ounsel to Telcordia Technologies, Inc.

cc: Jennifer Schneider
Mark Stone
Nicholas Alexander
Julie Veach
Randy Clarke
Ann Stevens
Marilyn Jones
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