
Mark Nadel 

From: Collin Kohberger E-Rate Exchange [ctk@erateexchange.com] 

Sent: Friday, January 27,20129:31 AM 

To: Mark Nadel 

Subject: RE: Withdrawing Greenburgh-Graham appeal of SLD 755959 
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Federal Communications Commission 
Office of the Secretary 

Please withdraw the appeal filed by Greenburgh-Graham in Docket No. 02-6 on August 1, 2011 
of FRN 2042868 (application #755959) as the matter has been resolve 

Thank you 

From: Mark Nadel [mailto:Mark.Nadel@fcc.gov] 
Sent: Friday, January 27, 2012 9:27 AM 
To: Collin Kohberger E-Rate Exchange 
Subject: Withdrawing Greenburgh-Graham appeal of SLD 755959 

Collin, 
I would appreciate it if you could send me an email like the following: 

Please withdraw the appeal filed by Greenburgh-Graham in CC Docket No. 02-6 on August 1,2011 
of FRN 2042868 (application #755959) as the matter has been resolved. 

Thank you. 

From: Collin Kohberger E-Rate Exchange [mailto:ctk@erateexchange.com] 
Sent: Friday, January 27, 2012 7:59 AM 
To: Mark Nadel 
Subject: RE: Greenburgh-Graham Appeal Item 215 

Hey Mark - sorry I didn't get to you yesterday -I'm leaving you a voice mail right now. 

E-mail is generally the best way to get a hold of me, but contact me when you get a chance. 

Thanks, 

Collin. 

From: Mark Nadel [mailto:Mark.Nadel@fcc.gov] 
Sent: Thursday, January 26, 20124:52 PM 
To: Collin Kohberger E-Rate Exchange 
Subject: RE: Greenburgh-Graham Appeal Item 215 

Collin, 
I called and left a message for you this morning and need to speak to you. 
Please call me at 202-418-7385. 
Mark 
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From: Collin Kohberger E-Rate Exchange [mailto:ctk@erateexchange.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, January 24,2012 11:24 AM 
To: Mark Nadel 
Subject: Greenburgh-Graham Appeal Item 21s 

Mark, 

Please find the attached Item 21 for the FRN in question (2042868) for Greenburgh Graham. 
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Basically - the FY 2010 application went through PIA - we submitted Item 21s - then submitted supporting 
documentation - the SLD sent us the FCDL with the FRN approved (and modified to agree with applicant 
documentation - See attached) 

Everything was fine until we attempted to file for a BEAR disbursement from CDWG - they claimed the FRN 
wasn't funded and the SLD overturned its original decision of funding this FRN - labeled it NOT funded stating 
that "Certain Items were not listed on the Item 21s". 

All Item WERE listed on the Item 21s - the Supporting contract was even submitted to verify that - and the FRN 
was funded. We are at a loss as to why this decision was overturned and request that the status of the FRN be 
returned to FUNDED so the school district can get the money they are owed from CDWG. 

Thank you Mark. 

Collin Kohberger E9 
Director of operations. . 

E-Rate Exchange, LLC 
focused. experienced, dedkated·e·rate consulting 
PO Box 451 I Syracuse. NY I 13206 
0: 315.422.7608 F: 866.283.9332 

t: '. You . U .... 

ctk@erateexchange.com 
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