
Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 

218 N. Lee Street, Suite 318 

Alexandria, VA 22314 

(703) 778-6555 office 
(703) 887-2.109 cell 

(703) 548-4399 fax 

On 2/17/10 11:05 AM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon l@duqlighT.com> wrote: 

Mr. Reardon, 

I have -attached a red lined Asset Purchase Agreement for your review and comment relative to the purchase 

by Duquesne Light Company of certain r-adio frequency licenses. Once you have had a chance to review the 

attached Agreement, I'd like to schedule some time to discuss any issues that you may have regarding 

Duquesne Light's comments. 

Thank you for your time and I look forward to hearing from you soon. 

Lesley C. Gannon 
Attorney at Law 
Legal and Environmental SeNices 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518- telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 
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Pillar, lee W 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: 

Dear Les, 

John Reardon [xreardon@earthlink.net] 
Tuesday, February 23, 2010 4:54PM 
Gannon, Lesley 
Sprock, Mark L; Pillar, Lee W; Delost, Ruth A; Noble, Joann 
Re: MCLM Radio Frequency licenses 

Okay, maybe there is an easier way. How about we talk tomorrow with Curt Brown? I can call you and patch 
him in. 

John 

On 2/23/10 4:14PM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannontwduqlight.corn> wrote: 

John. 

I'm researching the necessity of providing the information, as we are a public utility and not intending to use 
the frequencies for commercial (i.e., radio station) purpo5es. Completing the information will be extremely 
time consuming for DLC,. as we are owned by large multinational interes-'"LS. Determining whether the owners, 

directors and officers of DLC have any interest in other FCC-regulated companies will take significant time. i 
want to be sure that I've adequately researched alternatives before we request information from our owners 
and board regarding licenses held by their many other investments. 

Les 

From: John Reardon [mailto:xreardon@)earthlink.net] 
Sent: Tuesday, February 23, 2010 3:58 PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Subject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Ucenses 

Dear Lesley, 

I hope you are doing well. Do you have the information from Curt Brown to fill out for the application? 

I think its an ownership report he needs to file for Duquesne, since you don't already have one on file with the 
FCC, he told me. 

Please let me know how I can help. 

John 

On 2/19/10 4:21 PM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duqlight.com> wrote: 

Thanks. 
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Have a great weekend. 

Les 

From: John Reardon [mailto:xreardon@iearthimk.net] 
Sent: Friday, February 19, 2010 4:20 PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Cc: Sprock, Mark L; Whitfield, Maureen A.; Pillar, Lee W 
Subject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

We will prepare the application Monday and file it ASAP. 

We will call you Monday afternoon with our FCC counsel to verify the information before we file. 

John 

On 2/19/10 4:15 PM, "Gannon, lesley" <LGannon@duqlight.com> wrote: 

John, 

Thank you for the confirmation. Please let us know w~en we may begin working with the radio frequencies. 
We are anxious to get started. 

Les 

Lesley C. Gannon 
Attorney ai Law 
Legal and Environmental Serv1ces 
Duquesne Light Company 
414 Seven:h Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518- telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 

From: John Reardon [rnailto:xreardon@eorthllnk.net] 
Sent: Friday/ February 19, 2010 4:13 PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Subject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

Dear Les, 

I just wanted to confirm that we did receive the wire for $125K this afternoon. 
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Thanks and have a nice weekend. 

John 

On 2/19/1011:12 AM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duglight.com> wrote: 
John, 

Thanks for sending this. The wire should go out to you today or tomorrow, but we will still need a fully­
executed original. Would you please sign and return the agreement I mailed yesterday? 

Thank you! 

Lesley C. Gannon 
Attorney at Law 
Legal and Environmental Services 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh f,venue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518- telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 

From: John Reardon [mailto:xreardon@.learthiink.net] 
Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2010 4:48 PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Subject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Ucenses 

Dear Les, 

Here is the signed copy of the signature page. I will mail the entire agreement to you if you like, or wait until! 
get your originat sign that and send it back. 

Thanks, 

John 

On 2/18/10 2:40PM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duqfight.com> wrote: 
John, 

Attached is the executed Agreement. The original will go out in today's mail. 

Les 

Lesley C. Gannon 
Attorney at law 
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Legal and Environmental Servtces 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518- telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 

From: John Reardon [maHto:xreardon@earthlink.net] 
Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2010 1:46 PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Cc: Sprock, Mark L 
Subject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

Thanks, les. 

Once I get the signed agreement I will sign and scan it back, and overnight the original to you. 

Please let me know if there are any questions at any point in time. 

Sincerely, 

John 

On 2/18/10 1:42 PM, "Gannon, lesley" <LGannon@duqiight.com> wrote: 
John, 

I am waiting for the appropriate signature, but we should have the Agreement executed in the next day or so. 
I wlll scan and email it to you before mailing. Once we rece1ve a copy with MCLM's signature, we IArill initiate 
a wire. I put a February 28, 2010 deadline for payment in the Agreement. 

Les 

Lesley C. Ganno'i 
Attorney at Law 
Legal and Env:ronmental Services 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
PJttsburgh, Pl\ ! 5219 
412-~93-1518 -telephone 
412-383-1418 -fay 

From: John Reardon [mailto:xreardon(a)earthlink.net] 
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Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2010 1:25PM 
To: Gannon, lesley 
Subject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

Dear Lesley, 

I hope you are not getting too much snow up there today. I spoke with my Mom in Waynesburg, and she told 
me there may be another major storm coming your way! Wow, what a winter this has been. 

Here in Virginia the sun is out and its finally starting to melt the snow, there must be 3 feet on the ground still. 

1 wanted to touch base with you to see if you have learned anything from the accounting department relative 
to when we can enter the contract, get payment and file the FCC application. As you may recall, the FCC 
requires 21 days after filing before commencement of operations. And it will take us a day or two to prepare 

the FCC filing. 

Please let me know when you find out. 

Sincerely, 

John 

John Reardon 
CEO 

Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 

218 N. Lee Street, Suite 318 

Alexandria, VA 22314 

(703) 778-6555 office 
(703) 887-2109 cell 

(703) 548-4399 fax 

On 2/17/10 11:29 AM, "John Reardon" <xreardon@earthiink.net> wrote: 

Dear Lesley, 

Thanks for your call. The changes look good, as we discussed. 

We will file the FCC assignment application once payment is received. We take care of all that at our expense, 

as I mentioned. 

Here is our wire informatfon attached. For a FED EX, please mail to: 

Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
Attention: Sharon Watkins, Accounts Receivable 
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1601 Greentree Court 
Suite C 
Clarksville, IN 47129 
{812} 280-8609 

Please call or email me if you need anything. 

John 

John Reardon 
CEO 
Maritime Communications/land Mobile, LLC 
218 N. Lee Street, Suite 318 
Alexandria, VA 22314 
(703) 778-6555 office 
(703) 887-2109 .cell 
(703) 548-4399 fax 

On 2/17/1011:05 AM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@dualight.com> wrote: 

Mr. Reardon, 

1 have attached a red lined Asset Purchase Agreement for your review and comment relative to the purchase 
by Duquesne Light Company of certain radio frequency licenses. Once you have had a chance to review the 
attached Agreement, I'd like to schedule some time to discuss any issues that you may have regarding 
Duquesne Light's comments. 

Thank you for your time and I look forward to hearing from you soon. 

Lesley C. Gannon 
Attorney at Law 
Legal and Environmental Services 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518 - telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 
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Pillar, Lee W 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Lee and Mark, 

Gannon, Lesley 
Tuesday, February 23, 2010 5:35 PM 
Pillar, Lee W; Sprock, Mark L 
FW: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

.Are either of you available at lC:OO tomorrow for this call? 

Les 

From: John Reardon [mailto:xreardon@earthlink.net] 
Sent: Tuesday, February 23, 2010 5:22 PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Cc: Dennis C. Brown 
SUbject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

Dear Les, 

Curt Brown and I will call you at 10 AM. We believe there is an easier way in light of the hassle caused to your 
organization by going the current route. Namely, we will modify our license from "CMRS" to "PMRS" status 
and then assign it to Duquesne. Duquesne would not need to file an ownership report if we did it that way. 

In the interim, we would file a lease application so use can begin right away. 

We will talk with the FCC in the morning to confirm, but this seems to be the easier path to take. 

Have a good night, 

John 

On 2/23/10 4:56 PM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duqlight.com> wrote: 

Works for me. Please give me a time, and I will try to get one of our communications folks on the line as well. 
They know more about the bushess side of the frequencies than I. 

Les 

From: John Reardon [maHto:xreardon(ruearthlink.net;] 
Sent: Tuesday, February 23, 2010 4:54 PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Cc: Sprock, Mark L.; Pillar, Lee W; Delost, Ruth A.; Noble, Joann 
SUbject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

Dear Les, 
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Okay, maybe there is an easier way. How about we talk tomorrow with Curt Brown? I can call you and patch 

him in. 

John 

On 2/23/10 4:14PM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duqlight.com> wrote: 

John, 

I'm researching the necessity of providing the information, as we are a public utility and not intending tc use 
the frequencies for commercial (i.e., radio station) purposes. Completing the mformation will be extremely 
time consuming for DLC, as we are owned by large multinational interests. Determining whether the owners, 
directors and officers of DLC have any interest in other FCC-regulated companies will take significant time. ! 
want to be sure that l've adequately researched alternatives before we request information from our owners 

and board regarding licenses held by their many other investments. 

Les 

From: John Reardon [mailto:xreardon(fuearthlmk.net] 
Sent: Tuesday, February 23, 2010 3:58 PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Subject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Ucenses 

Dear Lesley, 

J hope you are doing welL Do you have the information from Curt Brown to fill out for the application? 

I think its an ownership report he needs to file for Duquesne, since you don't already have one on file with the 

FCC, he told me. 

Please let me know how I can help. 

John 

On 2/19/10 4:21PM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duqlight.com> wrote: 
Thanks. 

Have a great weekend. 

Les 

From: John Reardon ImaHto:xreardonrcvearthlink.net] 
Sent: Friday, February 19, 2010 4:20PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Cc: Sprock. Mark L.; Whitfield, Maureen A.; Pillar, Lee W 
Subject: Re: MQ.M Radio Frequency Licenses 
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Les, 

We will prepare the application Monday and file it ASAP. 

We will call you Monday afternoon with our FCC counsel to verify the information before we file. 

John 

On 2/19/10 4:15 PM, "Gannon} Lesley" <LGannon@duglight.com> wrote: 
John, 

Thank you for the confirmation. Please let us know when we may begin working with the radio frequencies. 
We are anXious to get started. 

Les 

Lesley C. GGnnon 
Attomey at Law 
Legal and Environmental Services 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsbur-gh, PP.. 15219 
412-393-15",8- telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 

From: John Reardon [mailto:xreardontruearthlink.net] 
Sent: Friday, February 19, 2010 4:13PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Subject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Ucenses 

Dear Les, 

I just wanted to confirm that we did receive the wire for $125K this afternoon. 

Thanks and have a nice weekend. 

John 

On 2/19/1011:12 AM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duolight.com> wrote: 

John, 

Thanks for sending this. The wire should go out to you today or tomorrow, but we will still need a fully­
executed original. Would you please sign and return the agreement I mailed yesterday? 
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Thank you! 

Lesley C. Gannon 
Attorney at Law 
Legal and Environmental Servtces 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518 - telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 

From: John Reardon [ mailto:xreardon@earthlink.net] 
Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2010 4:48 PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Subject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Ucenses 

Dear Les, 

Here is the signed copy of the signature page. I will mail the entire agreement to you if you like, or wait until I 

get your original, sign that and send it back. 

Thanks, 

John 

On 2/18/10 2:40PM, ''Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duolight.com> wrote: 
John, 

Attached is the executed Agreement. The original will go out in today's mail. 

Les 

Lesley C Gannon 
Attomey at Law 
Legal and Environmental Servtces 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518 -telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 

From: John Reardon [mailto:xreardon@earthrink.net] 
Sent Thursday/ February 18, 2010 1:46PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
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Cc: Sprock, Mark L. 
Subject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

Thanks, Les. 

Once I get the signed agreement I will sign and scan it back, and overnight the original to you. 

Please let me know if there are any questions at any point in time. 

Sincerely, 

John 

On 2/18/10 1:42PM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duqlight.com> wrote: 
John, 

lam waiting for the appropriate signature, but we should have the Agreement executed in the next day or so. 
I will scan and email it to you before mailing. Once we receive a copy with MCLM's signature, we will initiate 
a wire. I put a February 28, 2010 deadline for payment in the Agreement. 

Les 

Lesley C. Gannon 
f.'.ttorney at Law 
Legal and Environmental Services 
Duquesne ~igr1t Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-15~8- telephone 
412-383-1L18- fax 

From: John Reardon [mailto:xreardon@earthlink.net] 
Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2010 1:25PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Subject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

Dear Lesley, 

I hope you are not getting too much snow up there today. I spoke with my Mom in Waynesburg, and she told 
me there may be another major storm coming your way! Wow, what a winter this has been. 

Here in Virginia the sun is out and its finally starting to melt the snow, there must be 3 feet on the ground still. 

I wanted to touch base with you to see if you have learned anything from the accounting department relative 
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to when we can enter the contract, get payment and file the FCC application. As you may recall, the FCC 
requires 21 days after filing before commencement of operations. And it will take us a day or two to prepare 
the FCC filing. 

Please let me know when you find out. 

Sincerely, 

John 

John Reardon 
CEO 
Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
218 N. lee Street, Suite 318 
Alexandria, VA 22314 
(703) 778-6555 office 
(703) 887-2109 cell 
(703) 548-4399 fax 

On 2/17/1011:29 AM, "John Reardon" <xreardon@earthlink.ner> wrote: 
Dear Lesley, 

Thanks for your call. The changes look good, as we discussed. 

We will file the FCC assignment application once payment is received. We take care of all that at our expense, 
as I mentioned. 

Here is our wire information attached. For a FEDEX, please mail to: 

Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
Attention: Sharon Watkins, Accounts Receivable 
1601 Greentree Court 
Suite C 

Clarksville, IN 47129 
(812) 280-8609 

Please call or emall me if you need anything. 

John 

John Reardon 
CEO 
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Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
218 N. Lee Street, Suite 318 
Alexandria, VA 22314 
{703} 778-6555 office 
{703) 887-2109 cell 
(703) 548-4399 fax 

On 2/17/10 11:05 AM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duqiight.com> wrote: 

Mr. Reardon, 

I have attached a redlined Asset Purchase Agreement for your review and comment relative to the purchase 
by Duquesne Light Company of certain radio frequency licenses. Once you have had a chance to review the 
attached Agreement, I'd like to schedule some time to discuss any issues that you may have regarding 
Duquesne Light's comments. 

Thank you for your time and !look forward to hearing from you soon. 

Lesley C. Gannon 
Attorney at Law 
Legal and Environmental SeNices 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518- telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 
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Gannon, Lesley 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 
Attachments: 

Dear Lesley, 

John Reardon [xreardon@earthlink.net] 
Wednesday, February 17, 2010 11:30 AM 
Gannon, Lesley 
Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 
Wtre lnstructions-MCLM.doc 

Thanks for your call. The changes look good, as we discussed. 

We will file the FCC assignment application once payment is received. We take care of all that at our expense, 

as I mentioned. 

Here is our wire information attached. For a FEDEX, please mail to: 

Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
Attention: Sharon Watkins, Accounts Receivable 
1601 Greentree Court 
Suite C 
Clarksville, IN 47129 
(812) 280-8609 

Please call or email me if you need anything. 

John 

John Reardon 
CEO 
Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
218 N. Lee Street, Suite 318 
Alexandria, VA 22314 
(703) 778-6555 office 
(703) 887-2109 cell 
(703) 548-4399 fax 

On 2/17/10 11:05 AM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duglight.com> wrote: 
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Mr. Reardon, 

I have attached a red lined Asset Purchase Agreement for your review and comment relative to the purchase 
by Duquesne light Company of certain radio frequency licenses. Once you have had a chance to review the 
attached Agreement, I'd like to schedule some time to discuss any issues that you may have regarding 
Duquesne Light's comments. 

Thank you for your time and I look forward to hearing from you soon. 

Lesley C. Gannon 
Attorney at Law 
Legal and Environmental Services 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518- telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 
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Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 

-Wiring Instructions: 

Stock Yards Bank & Trust Co 
Jeffersonville, Indiana 
ABA Routing Number 083000564 
Account Name: Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
Account No. 1653504 
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Gannon, Lesley 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Dear Lesley, 

John Reardon [xreardon@earthlink.net] 
Thursday, February 18, 201 0 1 :25 PM 
Gannon, Lesley 
Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

I hope you are not getting too much snow up there today. I spoke with my Mom in Waynesburg, and she told 
me there may be another major storm coming your way! Wow, what a winter this has been. 

Here in Virginia the sun is out and its finally starting to melt the snow, there must be 3 feet on the ground still. 

I wanted to touch base with you to see if you have learned anything from the accounting department relative 
to when we can enter the contract, get payment and file the FCC application. As you may recall, the FCC 
requires 21 days after filing before commencement of operations. And it will take us a day or two to prepare 
the FCC filing. 

Please let me know when you find out. 

Sincerely, 

John 

John Reardon 
CEO 
Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
218 N. Lee Street, Suite 318 
Alexandria, VA 22314 
(703) 778-65,55 office 
(703) 887-2109 cell 
(703) 548-4399 fax 

On 2/17/10 11:29 AM, "John Reardon" <xreardon@earthlink.net> wrote: 

Dear Lesley, 

Thanks for your call. The changes look good, as we discussed. 

We will file the FCC assignment application once payment is received. We take care of all that at our expense, 
as I mentioned. 
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Here is our wire information attached. For a FEDEX, please mail to: 

Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
Attention: Sharon Watkins, Accounts Receivable 
1601 Greentree Court 
Suite C 
Clarksville, IN 47129 
(812) 280-8609 

Please call or email me if you need anything. 

John 

John Reardon 
CEO 
Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
218 N. Lee Street, Suite 318 
Alexandria, VA 22314 
(703) 778-6555 office 
(703) 887-2109 cell 
(703) 548-4399 fax 

On 2/17/10 11:05 AM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duqlight.com> wrote: 

Mr. Reardon, 

I have attached a red lined Asset Purchase Agreement for your review and comment relative to the purchase 
by Duquesne Light Company of certain radio frequency licenses. Once you have had a chance to review the 
attached Agreement, I'd like to schedule some time to discuss any issues that you may have regarding 
Duquesne Light's comments. 

Thank you for your time and I look forward to hearing from you soon. 

Lesley C. Gannon 
Attorney at Law 
Legal and Environmental Services 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518- telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 
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Gannon, Lesley 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: 

John, 

Gannon, Lesley 
Thursday, February 18, 2010 1:43 PM 
'John Reardon' 
Sprock, Mark L. 
RE: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

I am waiting for the appropriate signature, but we should have the Agreement executed in the next day or so. I will scan 

and email it to you before mailing. Once we receive a copy with MCLM's signature, we will initiate a wire. I put a 

February 28, 2010 deadline for payment in the Agreement. 

Les 

Lesley C. Gannon 
Attorney at Law 
Legal and Environmental Servtces 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518 - telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 

From: John Reardon [mailto:xreardon@earthlink.net] 
Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2010 1:25 PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Subject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

Dear Lesley, 

I hope you are not getting too much snow up there today. I spoke with my Mom in Waynesburg, and she told 

me there may be another major storm coming your way! Wow, what a winter this has been. 

Here in Virginia the sun is out and its finally starting to melt the snow, there must be 3 feet on the ground still. 

I wanted to touch base with you to see if you have learned anything from the accounting department relative 
to when we can enter the contract, get payment and file the FCC application. As you may recall, the FCC 
requires 21 days after filing before commencement of operations. And it will take us a day or two to prepare 

the FCC filing. 

Please let me know when you find out. 

Sincerely, 

John 

DLC000202 



John Reardon 
CEO 
Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
218 N. Lee Street, Suite 318 
Alexandria, VA 22314 
(703) 778-6555 office 
(703) 887-2109 cell 
(703) 548-4399 fax 

On 2/17/1011:29 AM, "John Reardon" <xreardon@earthlink.net> wrote: 

Dear Lesley, 

Thanks for your call. The changes look good, as we discussed. 

We will file the FCC assignment application once payment is received. We take care of all that at our expense, 
as I mentioned. 

Here is our wire information attached. For a FEDEX, please mail to: 

Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
Attention: Sharon Watkins, Accounts Receivable 
1601 Greentree Court 
Suite C 
Clarksville, IN 47129 
(812) 280-8609 

Please call or email me if you need anything. 

John 

John Reardon 
CEO 
Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
218 N. Lee Street, Suite 318 
Alexandria, VA 22314 
(703) 778-6555 office 
(703) 887-2109 cell 
(703) 548-4399 fax 
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On 2/17/10 11:05 AM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duqlight.com> wrote: 

Mr. Reardon, 

I have attached a redlined Asset Purchase Agreement for your review and comment relative to the purchase 
by Duquesne Light Company of certain radio frequency licenses. Once you have had a chance to review the 
attached Agreement, I'd like to schedule some time to discuss any issues that you may have regarding 
Duquesne Light's comments. 

Thank you for your time and I look forward to hearing from you soon. 

Lesley C. Gannon 
Attorney at Law 
Legal and Environmental Services 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518 - telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 
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Gannon, Lesley 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: 

Thanks, Les. 

John Reardon [xreardon@earthlink.net] 
Thursday, February 18, 2010 1 :46 PM 
Gannon, Lesley 
Sprock, Mark L. 
Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

Once I get the signed agreement I will sign and scan it back, and overnight the original to you. 

Please let me know if there are any questions at any point in time. 

Sincerely, 

John 

On 2/18/10 1:42 PM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duqlight.com> wrote: 

John, 

I am waiting for the appropriate signature, but we should have the Agreement executed in the next day or so. 

I will scan and email it to you before mailing. Once we receive a copy with MCLM's signature, we will initiate 

a wire. I put a February 28, 2010 deadline for payment in the Agreement. 

Les 

Lesley C. Gannon 
Attorney at Law 
Legal and Environmental Services 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518 -telephone 
412-383-1418 - fax 

From: John Reardon [mailto:xreardon@earthlink.net] 
Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2010 1:25PM 
To: Gannon, Lesley 
Subject: Re: MCLM Radio Frequency Licenses 

Dear Lesley, 
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I hope you are not getting too much snow up there today. I spoke with my Mom in Waynesburg, and she told 
me there may be another major storm coming your way! Wow, what a winter this has been. 

Here in Virginia the sun is out and its finally starting to melt the snow, there must be 3 feet on the ground still. 

I wanted to touch base with you to see if you have learned anything from the accounting department relative 
to when we can enter the contract, get payment and file the FCC application. As you may recall, the FCC 
requires 21 days after filing before commencement of operations. And it will take us a day or two to prepare 
the FCC filing. 

Please let me know when you find out. 

Sincerely, 

John 

John Reardon 
CEO 
Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
218 N. Lee Street, Suite 318 
Alexandria, VA 22314 
{703) 778-6555 office 
{703) 887-2109 cell 
{703) 548-4399 fax 

On 2/17/10 11:29 AM, "John Reardon" <xreardon@earthlink.net> wrote: 
Dear Lesley, 

Thanks for your call. The changes look good, as we discussed. 

We will file the FCC assignment application once payment is received. We take care of all that at our expense, 
as I mentioned. 

Here is our wire information attached. For a FEDEX, please mail to: 

Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
Attention: Sharon Watkins, Accounts Receivable 
1601 Greentree Court 
Suite C 
Clarksville, IN 47129 
{812) 280-8609 
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Please call or email me if you need anything. 

John 

John Reardon 
CEO 

Maritime Communications/Land Mobile, LLC 
218 N. Lee Street, Suite 318 
Alexandria, VA 22314 
(703} 778-6555 office 
(703} 887-2109 cell 
(703} 548-4399 fax 

On 2/17/1011:05 AM, "Gannon, Lesley" <LGannon@duqlight.com> wrote: 
Mr. Reardon, 

I have attached a red lined Asset Purchase Agreement for your review and comment relative to the purchase 
by Duquesne Light Company of certain radio frequency licenses. Once you have had a chance to review the 
attached Agreement, I'd like to schedule some time to discuss any issues that you may have regarding 
Duquesne Light's comments. 

Thank you for your time and I look forward to hearing from you soon. 

Lesley C. Gannon 
Attorney at Law 
Legal and Environmental Services 
Duquesne Light Company 
411 Seventh Avenue 
Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
412-393-1518- telephone 
412-383-1418- fax 
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