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From: Willard, Ryan [mailto:RWillard@fibertech.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, May 21, 2013 9:50 AM 
To: Debi Sovereign 
Cc: 'Mandy Wood' 
Subject: FW: Hartford Schools shorted USAC payment 
 

Hi Debi, 
 
Here is what I have received from Melissa at USAC, who was responsible for processing the 
invoice.  She has given dollar amounts as well as addresses. 
 
Please let me know if you need any other information. 
 
Thanks, 
Ryan 
 
From: Brown, Melissa [mailto:Melissa.BROWN@sl.universalservice.org]  
Sent: Tuesday, May 21, 2013 10:43 AM 
To: Willard, Ryan 
Subject: RE: Hartford Schools shorted USAC payment 
 
Good Morning Ryan, 
 
Here is the list of ineligibles and cost.  
 
$1,095.00             30 Campfield Ave – Campfield Branch Library, Entity # 5398 
$1,095.00             200 Sherbrooke Ave – Hooker Environmental Studies Magnet School # 5335 (corner of 
Sherbrooke and Broadview Terrace – address is also 440 Broadview Terrace) 
$1,095.00             460 New Britain Ave – Goodwin Memorial Branch Library, Entity # 5336 
$1,095.00             500 Main Street – Hartford Public Library – Main Branch, Entity # 227325 
$1,095.00             744 Park Street – Park Branch Library, Entity # 5329 
$1,095.00             256 Farmington Ave  ‐ Mark Twain Branch Library, Entity # 5323 
$1,095.00             85 Edwards Street – . HPS 85 Edwards Street – Global Academy, Entity # 16068855 
$1,095.00             1250 Albany Ave‐Albany Ave Branch Library, Entity # 5391 
$1,095.00             649 Blue Hills Ave‐Blue Hills Branch Library, Entity # 5384 
$1,095.00             281 Barbour Street‐Barbour Branch Library, Entity # 5433 
$1,095.00             85 Edwards Street – HPS 85 Edwards Street – Global Academy, Entity # 16068855 
 
 
Thank You,  
Melissa R. Brown 
Associate Manager, Invoicing 
30 Lanidex Plaza West | Parsippany, NJ 07054 
T: 973.581.5152 | F: 973.599.6539 
Melissa.Brown@sl.universalservice.org 
 
 

Entity information added by Debi 
Sovereign 5/21/2013 



From: Willard, Ryan [mailto:RWillard@fibertech.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, May 21, 2013 9:50 AM 
To: Brown, Melissa 
Subject: RE: Hartford Schools shorted USAC payment 
 

Good morning Melissa, 
 
I just wanted to follow up with my request as so know which sites are ineligible, and the dollar 
amounts associated with each. 
 
Thank you, 
Ryan 
 
Ryan Willard 
Fibertech Networks 
300 Meridian Centre 
Rochester, NY 14618 
Phone (585) 568-8497 
Fax (585) 442-9709 
rwillard@fibertech.com 
 
From: Willard, Ryan  
Sent: Wednesday, May 15, 2013 9:37 AM 
To: 'Brown, Melissa' 
Cc: Schnauber, Mark 
Subject: RE: Hartford Schools shorted USAC payment 
 

Melissa, 
 
Do you have any other details on which sites are ineligible?  Also, the dollar amounts associated 
with each? 
 
Thank you, 
Ryan 
 
From: Brown, Melissa [mailto:Melissa.BROWN@sl.universalservice.org]  
Sent: Wednesday, May 15, 2013 8:52 AM 
To: Willard, Ryan 
Cc: Schnauber, Mark 
Subject: RE: Hartford Schools shorted USAC payment 
 
Good Morning, 
 
Your invoice was modified due to ineligible entities.  We cannot pay for sites that doesn’t match.  
 
Thank You,  



Melissa R. Brown 
Associate Manager, Invoicing 
30 Lanidex Plaza West | Parsippany, NJ 07054 
T: 973.581.5152 | F: 973.599.6539 
Melissa.Brown@sl.universalservice.org 
 
From: Willard, Ryan [mailto:RWillard@fibertech.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2013 3:27 PM 
To: Brown, Melissa 
Cc: Schnauber, Mark 
Subject: FW: Hartford Schools shorted USAC payment 
Importance: High 
 

Good afternoon Melissa, 
 
Today we received payment for April service for Hartford Schools.  There was an issue with the 
money released to Fibertech, and I wanted to follow up with you because the payment was 
shorted by $10,358.70.  ($37,668 was released) 

 
For this line item, we only received a partial of the undiscounted amount.  The reason behind 
this was noted as “Service to Entity Not Approved on 471;1223;” 
 
This was not an issue for the months prior for Hartford for the 2012 funding year.  Could you 
please look into this and provide any reason why the change in payment from USAC? 
 
Thanks, 
Ryan 
 
Ryan Willard 
Fibertech Networks 
300 Meridian Centre 
Rochester, NY 14618 
Phone (585) 568-8497 
Fax (585) 442-9709 
rwillard@fibertech.com 
 

   
















































